
COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-22 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials 
Award Listing - Solid Sod 

Effective: April 6, 2024 - April 6, 2025 

VENDOR: Cleverdon Farms, Inc. 

Price Bid per Price Bid per 
Sod Type Cuts Square Yard Square Yard 

Delivered Picked-up 
Centipede Block $2.10 $1.90 
Centipede Mini Rolls $2.10 $1.90 
Centipede 30" Rolls (42") $2.10 $1.90 
Bermuda/Tifton Block $2.25 $2.05 
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls $2.25 $2.05 
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls (42") $2.25 $2.05 
Celebrations Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid 
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid 
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid 
St. Augustine Block $3.00 $2.80 
St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid 
St. Augustine 30" Rolls (42") $3.00 $2.80 

Pick-up Location: Foley, Summerdale, Bon Secour 
Magnum Big Roll Sod Haverster only cuts 42 inches wide roll - 33.33 sq. yds. per roll 



COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-22 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials 
Award Listing - Fertilizer 

Effective: April 6, 2024 - April 6, 2025 

VENDOR: Evans & Company, Inc. 

Price Bid per Price Bid per 

Fertilizer Type Pound Pound 
Delivered Picked-up 

13-13-13 0.65 0.65 
10-10-10 No Bid No Bid 
8-8-8 0.50 
Agricultural Lime (Bag) 0.50 

Agricultural Lime (Bulk) - Price per Ton No Bid No Bid 

Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile 
Note: Transportation costs factored in for picked-up. 

VENDOR: Helena Agrl Enterprises, LLC 

Price Bid per Price Bid per 

Fertilizer Type Pound Pound 

Delivered Picked-up 
13-13-13 I -
10-10-10 0.50 0.30 

8-8-8 0.40 

Agricultural Lime (Bag) 0.40 

Agricultural Lime (Bulk) - Price per Ton No Bid No Bid 

Pick-up Location: Byhalia, MS 

Note: Transportation costs factored In for picked-up. 



COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-22 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials 
Award Listing - Grass Seeds 

Effective: April 6, 2024 - April 6, 202S 

VENDOR: Evans & Company, Inc. 

Seed Type I Price Bid per Pound I 
Picked-up-AREA 100 

Price Bid per Pound I 
Picked-up-AREA 200 

Price Bid per Pound I 
Picked-up-AREA 300 

Annual Ryegrass 0.85 0.85 0.85 
Tall Fescue 2.85 2.85 2.85 
Crimson Clover 1.70 1.70 1.70 
Brown Top Millet 1.10 1.10 1.10 
Unhulled Bermuda Grass 6.35 6.35 6.35 
Hulled Bermuda Grass 8.70 8.70 8.70 
Pensacola Bahia Grass 4.88 4.88 4.88 
Centipede 18.50 18.50 18.50 
Kentucky 31 Fescue 1.95 1.95 1.95 
Weeping lovegrass 16.00 16.00 16.00 
Annuallespedeza(Korean) 2.40 2.40 2.40 
Pre Mix Summer Seed Blend 2.25 2.25 2.25 

Crimson Clover 4.75%, Brown Top Millet 19%, Hulled Bermuda Grass 5%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 16%, 

Kentucky 31 Fescue 48%, Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 2% 
Pre Mix Winter Seed Blend 2.25 2.25 2.25 

Crimson Clover 9%, Gulf Rye 13%, Unhulled Bermuda Grass 9%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 9%, Kentucky 31 
Fescue50% 

Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile 
Note: The Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) bid price is for Annual Lespedeza Korean. 
Applies to Area 100, ZOO & 300. Transportation costs factored in for picked-up. 

VENDOR: Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC 

Seed Type l Price Bid per Pound I 
Delivered • AREA 100 

Price Bid per Pound I Price Bid per Pound I 
Delivered · AREA ZOO Delivered • AREA 300 

Annual Ryegrass 0.78 0.78 0.78 
Tall Fescue 1.44 1.44 1.44 
Crimson Clover 1.50 1.50 1.50 
Brown Top Millet 0.94 0.94 0.94 
Unhulled Bermuda Grass 4.00 4.00 4.00 
Hulled Bermuda Grass 6.90 6.90 6.90 
Pensacola Bahia Grass 4.00 4.00 4.00 
Centipede 15.00 15.00 15.00 
Kentucky 31 Fescue 1.60 1.60 1.60 
Weeping lovegrass 8.00 8.00 8.00 
Annual Lespedeza (Korean) 2.00 2.00 2.00 
PreMix Summer Seed Blend 1.55 1.55 1.55 

Crimson Clover 4. 75%, Brown Top Millet 19%, Hulled Bermuda Grass 5%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 16%, 

Kentucky 31 Fescue 48%, Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 2% 

PreMix Winter Seed Blend 1.90 1.90 1.90 
Crimsan Clover 9%, Gulf Rye 13%, Unhulled Bermuda Grass 9%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 9%, Kentucky 31 
Fescue50% 

Alternate Options - Coated: 
Unhulled Bermuda Grass 3.00 
Hulled Bermuda Grass 4.00 

Pick-up Location: 3200 Old Montgomery Rd. Selma, AL 36703 
Note: Transportation costs factored In for picked-up. 



COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-22 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials 
Award Listing - Silt Fence 

Effective: April 6, 2024 - April 6, 2025 

VENDOR: 

Description J Product Bid 

Type "A" Silt Fence Kit Mirafi 140NL 
Type "B" Silt Fence Kit SF 90 

6' C-Flex T Fencing Tenax 
8 ' C- Flex T Fencing Tenax 
Wattles (12 in.) Straw 
Wattles (20 in.) Straw 
Sediment Logs (12 in.) Curlex 
Sediment Logs (20 in.) Curlex 
Type S3 RECPs · 3 Month A.E.C. S/N Straw 
Type S3 RECPs · 12 Month A.E.C. S/N Straw 
Type S2 RECPs - 12 Month A.E.C. D/N Straw 
Type S1 RECPs • 24 Month Curlex II 
Type Sl RECPs • 36 Month Curlex Ill 
Type Sl RECPs • Perm TRMV 
Type CZ RECPs - 12 Month D/N Straw 
Type C2 RECPs - 24 Month 70/30 Straw/Coco. 
Type C2 RECPs - 36 Month Coconut 
Type CG RECPs - Perm TRMV 
Type Cl0 RECPs. Perm TRMV 
Sod Staples 11 Gauge Galvanized Steel- 10,000/box 
Nonwoven Geotextile 4.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) Mirafi 140NL 
Nonwoven Geotextile 8.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) Mirafi 180N 
Woven Geotextile (Filter fabric) Mirafi soox 
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 1 Mirafi 2XT 
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 2 Mirafi SXT 
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 3 Mirafi 7XT 
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 1 "Geogrid" BXll00 or equal 
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 2 "Geogrid" BX1200 or equal 
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 3 "Geogrid" BX1500 or equal 

Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile 

Evans & Company, Inc. 

I Price Bid I Price Bid I Unit of Measure Delivered Picked-up 
1.32 1.32 Per Linear Foot 
0.29 0.29 Per Linear Foot 

1.33 1.33 Per Linear Foot 
1.42 1.42 Per Linear Foot 
2.00 2.00 Per Linear Foot 
2.65 2.65 Per Linear Foot 
2.98 2.98 Per Linear Foot 
4.00 4.00 Per Linear Foot 
0.35 0.35 Per Square Yard 
0.35 0.3S Per Square Yard 
0.49 0.49 Per Square Yard 

0.80 0.80 Per Square Yard 
1.01 1.01 Per Square Yard 
2.45 2.45 Per Square Yard 
0.49 0.49 Per Square Yard 
0.70 0.70 Per Square Yard 
1.05 1.05 Per Square Yard 
2.45 2.45 Per Square Yard 
2.45 2.45 Per Square Yard 

65.00 65.00 Per Box 
0.91 0.91 Per Square Yard 
1.54 1.54 Per Square Yard 
0.80 0.80 Per Square Yard 
2.15 2.15 Per Square Yard 
2.20 2.20 Per Square Yard 
2.75 2.75 Per Square Yard 
1.59 1.59 Per Square Yard 
1.99 1.99 Per Square Yard 
4.10 4.10 Per Square Yard 



COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-22 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials 
Award Listing - Standard Flexamats - Tied Concrete Block Mats 
Effective: April 6, 2024 - April 6, 2025 

VENDOR: Evans & Company, Inc. 

Price Bid per Price Bid per 

Dimensions (L x W) Square Foot Square Foot 
Delivered Picked-up 

8' x30' 4.95 4.95 
8' x40' 4.95 4.95 
8' X 50' 4.95 4.95 
12' X 30' 4.95 4.95 
12' X 40' 4.95 4 .95 
12' X 50' 4.95 4 .95 
16' X 30' 4.95 4.95 
16' X 40' 4.95 4.95 
16' X 50' 4.95 4.95 

Anchors (price per unit) 4.00 4.00 

Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile 

Exceptions: Evans & Company, Inc. pricing does not include freight charges. 
Freight cost is $1,900.00 per truck load. 


