COMPETITIVE BID #WG23-57 Award Listing
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 100

Delivered Prices Only
Effective: October 21, 2023 through October 21, 2024

VENDORS: Mobile Asphalt Co. |H.O. Weaver & Sons, Inc. |Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
DESCRIPTION Delivered Delivered Delivered
BC-723 $81.90 $86.50 No Bid
424A-280 $96.00 $100.00 No Bid
424A-281 $85.60 $95.00 No Bid
424A-336 $87.90 $97.50 No Bid
424A-340 $89.35 $90.50 No Bid
424A-341 $80.10 $87.00 No Bid
424A-360 $89.35 $90.50 No Bid
424A-361 $80.10 $87.00 No Bid
424A-293 $76.80 $80.00 No Bid
424B-635 $80.10 $84.00 No Bid
424B-636 $76.80 $80.00 No Bid
424B-637 $76.80 $80.00 No Bid
424B-651 $76.80 $80.00 No Bid
424B-663 $76.80 $80.00 No Bid
424T-000 $105.45 $111.00 No Bid
424T-001 $105.45 $111.00 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid $18.00
*MAC supply location is Bay Minette Note: Primary - Yellow

Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County.

*WEAVER supply location is Cut Off Rd., Mobile & Woods Rd., Atmore

*Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504

Secondary - Orange




COMPETITIVE BID #WG23-57 Award Listing
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 200

Delivered Prices Only

Effective: October 21, 2023 through October 21, 2024

VENDORS: Mobile Asphalt Co. |H.O. Weaver & Sons, Inc. |Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
DESCRIPTION Delivered Delivered Delivered
BC-723 $82.90 $86.50 No Bid
424A-280 $97.00 $100.00 No Bid
424A-281 $86.60 $95.00 No Bid
424A-336 $88.95 $97.50 No Bid
424A-340 $90.40 $90.50 No Bid
424A-341 $81.15 $87.00 No Bid
424A-360 $90.40 $90.50 No Bid
424A-361 $81.15 $87.00 No Bid
424A-293 $77.85 $80.00 No Bid
424B-635 $81.15 $84.00 No Bid
424B-636 $77.85 $80.00 No Bid
424B-637 $§77.85 $80.00 No Bid
424B-651 $77.85 $80.00 No Bid
424B-663 $77.85 $80.00 No Bid
424T-000 $106.50 No Bid
4247-001 $106.50 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid $18.00
*MAC supply location is Bay Minette Note: Primary -Yellow

Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County.

*WEAVER supply location is Cut Off Rd., Mobile & Woods Rd., Atmore

*Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504

Secondary - Orange




COMPETITIVE BID #WG23-57 Award Listing
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 300

Delivered Prices Only

Effective: October 21, 2023 through October 21, 2024

VENDORS: Mobile Asphalt Co. H.O. Weaver & Sons, Inc. [Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
DESCRIPTION Delivered Delivered Delivered
BC-723 $82.90 $90.00 No Bid
424A-280 $99.30 $105.00 No Bid
424A-281 $89.00 $100.00 No Bid
424A-336 $91.00 $101.50 No Bid
424A-340 $92.90 $94 .50 No Bid
424A-341 $83.75 $91.00 No Bid
424A-360 $92.90 $94.50 No Bid
424A-361 $83.75 $91.00 No Bid
424A-293 $80.00 $84.00 No Bid
424B-635 $83.75 $88.00 No Bid
424B-636 $80.00 $84.00 No Bid
424B-637 $80.00 $84.00 No Bid
424B-651 $80.00 $84.00 No Bid
424B-663 $80.00 $84.00 No Bid
424T-000 $110.30 $115.00 No Bid
424T7-001 $110.30 $115.00 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid $18.00

*MAC supply location is Foley

Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County.

*WEAVER supply location is Cut Off Rd., Mobile & Woods Rd., Atmore

*Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504

Note: Primary - Yellow

Secondary - Orange




COMPETITIVE BID #WG23-57 Award Listing

BITUMINOUS MATERIALS - AREA 100
Picked-Up Prices Only

Effective: October 21, 2023 through October 21, 2024

Vendors: Mobile Asphalt Co. H.O. Weaver & Sons, Inc. Advanced Asphalt Products
Locations: Bay Minette Foley Mobile Atmore Jasper
DESCRIPTION

BC-723 2ibrabn $76.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-280 $91.95 $95.00 $95.00 No Bid
424A-281 $81.65 $85.00 $85.00 No Bid
424A-336 $83.65 $85.00 $85.00 No Bid
424A-340 $85.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-341 $76.85 $77.00 $77.00 No Bid
424A-360 $85.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-361 $76.85 $77.00 $77.00 No Bid
424A-293 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-635 $76.85 §75.00 $75.00 No Bid
424B-636 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-637 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-651 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-663 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424T-000 $103.90 $100.00 $100.00 No Bid
424T-001 $103.90 $100.00 $100.00 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid $30.00 E No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid No Bid $16,00

MAC Plant Locations:
Bay Minette - 43385 Nicholsville Rd.
Foley - 21650 Doc McDuffie Rd.

Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County

H. O. Weaver Plant Locations:
Mobile - Cut Off Road, Atmore - Woods Rd.

Advanced Asphalt Products LLC

Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504




COMPETITIVE BID #WG23-57 Award Listing
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS - Area 200

Picked-Up Prices Only

Effective: October 21, 2023 through October 21, 2024

Vendors: Mobile Asphalt Co. H.O. Weaver & Sons, Inc. Advanced Asphalt Products
Locations: Bay Minette Foley Mobile Atmore Jasper
DESCRIPTION

BC-723 $76.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-280 $91.95 $95.00 $95.00 No Bid
424A-281 $81.65 $85.00 $85.00 No Bid
424A-336 $83.65 $85.00 $85.00 No Bid
424A-340 $85.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-341 $76.85 $77.00 $77.00 No Bid
424A-360 $85.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-361 $76.85 $77.00 $77.00 No Bid
424A-293 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-635 $76.85 $75.00 $75.00 No Bid
424B-636 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-637 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-651 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-663 $72.70 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424T-000 $103.90 $100.00 $100.00 No Bid
4247-001 $103.90 $100.00 $100.00 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid | $30.00 | $30.00 No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00

MAC Plant Locations:

Foley - 21650 Doc McDuffie Rd.

H. O. Weaver Plant Locations:

Bay Minette - 43385 Nicholsville Rd.

Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County

Mobile - Cut Off Road, Atmore - Woods Rd.

Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504




COMPETITIVE BID #WG23-57 Award Listing
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS - AREA 300

Picked-Up Prices Only

Effective: October 21, 2023 through October 21, 2024

Vendors: Mobile Asphalt Co. H.O. Weaver & Sons, Inc. Advanced Asphalt Products
Locations: Bay Minette Foley NMobile Atmore Jasper
DESCRIPTION

BC-723 $73.50 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-280 $87.60 $95.00 $95.00 No Bid
424A-281 $77.15 $85.00 $85.00 No Bid
424A-336 $79.50 $85.00 $85.00 No Bid
424A-340 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-341 $74.35 $77.00 $77.00 No Bid
424A-360 | $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 No Bid
424A-361 $74.35 $77.00 $77.00 No Bid
424A-293 | $6B.40 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-635 $74.35 $75.00 $75.00 No Bid
424B-636 $68.40 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-637 | $68.40 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-651 $68.40 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
424B-663 $68.40 $70.00 $70.00 No Bid
4247-000 $97.00 $100.00 $100.00 No Bid
4247-001 $97.00 $100.00 §100.00 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid No Bid [7$30.00 $30.00 No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt- 50 Ibbag [T $40.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00

MAC Plant Locations:

Bay Minette - 43385 Nicholsville Rd.

Foley - 21650 Doc McDuffie Rd.

Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County

H. O. Weaver Plant Locations:
Mobile - Cut Off Road, Atmare - Woods Rd.

Advanced Asphait Products LLC
Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504
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