COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-23 Bid Tabulation
Provision of Instant Pre-Cooked Meals

VENDOR: Luxfer Magtech Inc Bid Price
Entree Variety Cost Per meal
Entrée Variety #1:  Hearty Beef Stew $5.43 97.74/Case
Entrée Variety #2:  Zesty White Chicken Chili $5.43 97.74/Case
Entrée Variety #3: Homestyle Chicken & Noodles $5.43 97.74/Case
Entrée Variety #4: Italian Style Pasta w/Vegetables & Tomato Sauce $5.43 97.74/Case
Entrée Variety #5:  Southwestern Style Chicken w/ Beans & Rice $5.43 97.74/Case
Entrée Variety #6: Tex Mex Style Beans & Rice $5.43 97.74/Case
Entrée Variety #7: No Bid
Entrée Variety #8: No Bid
Entrée Variety #9: No Bid
Entrée Variety #10: No Bid
Notes: Entrée Variety 1-6 make up a mixed case
Nutritional Charts Provided
VENDOR: Kinro Manufacturing Bid Price
Entree Variety Cost Per meal
Entrée Variety #1:  Vegetarian Chili $7.00
Entrée Variety #2:  Chili with Beans $7.00
Entrée Variety #3:  Chicken Creole $7.00
Entrée Variety #4:  Turkey Chili $7.00
Entrée Variety #5:  Lentils with Beef $7.00
Entrée Variety #6: Italian Sausage $7.00
Entrée Variety #7:  Elbow Macaroni $7.00
Entrée Variety #8:  Pasta Fagioli $7.00
Entrée Variety #9:  Cheese Tortellini $7.00
Entrée Variety #10: Chicken Chunks $7.00
Notes: Nutritional Charts Provided - Nutritional range will remain the same, but menu
components may change according to availability at the time of order
Not registered with Secretary of State - Status is Withdrawn
VENDOR: TRIO Community Meals LLC Bid Price
Entree Variety Cost Per meal
Entrée Variety #1: Italian Style Pasta w/Vegetables & Tomato Sauce $8.95
Entrée Variety #2:  Zesty White Chicken Chili $8.95
Entrée Variety #3:  Hearty Beef Stew $8.95
Entrée Variety #4: Homestyle Chicken $8.95
Entrée Variety #5: Tex Mex Style Beans & Rice $8.95
Entrée Variety #6:  Southwestern Style Chicken $8.95
Entrée Variety #7: No Bid
Entrée Variety #8: No Bid
Entrée Variety #9: No Bid
Entrée Variety #10: No Bid
Notes: Nutritional Charts Provided - Extensive list of Exception(s) to Bid Conditions

and Specifications: Renewal, Termination, Future Pricing, Indemnification, Change in Conditions,
Invoices/Payment Terms, Limitations of Liability, Subrogation, Non-Hire, Assignment or Transfer
Equal Opportunity




