
COMPETITIVE BID #WG25-11 Bid Tabulation
Provision of Motorgrader Blades

BIDDER: Thompson Tractor Co., Inc.
Length Width Thickness Bolt Amount Bid 

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8"  6" width: 6' 6" 5/8" 5/8" 7T1633 $54.94
6' 6" 5/8" 3/4" 7T1637 $57.79

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4"  6" width: 6' 6" 3/4" 5/8" N/A No Bid
6' 6" 3/4" 3/4" N/A No Bid

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8"  8" width: 6' 8" 5/8" 5/8" 7T1636 $77.58
6' 8" 5/8" 3/4" 7T1639 $76.78

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4"  8" width: 6' 8" 3/4" 5/8" 7T1634 $90.32
6' 8" 3/4" 3/4" 7T1638 $93.40

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8"  6" width: 7' 6" 5/8" 5/8" 7T1645 $65.70
7' 6" 5/8" 3/4" 7T1626 $62.52

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4"  6" width: 7' 6" 3/4" 5/8" N/A No Bid
7' 6" 3/4" 3/4" N/A No Bid

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8"  8" width: 7' 8" 5/8" 5/8" 7T1643 $90.23
7' 8" 5/8" 3/4" 7T1624 $89.43

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4"  8" width: 7' 8" 3/4" 5/8" 7T1623 $105.65
7' 8" 3/4" 3/4" 7T1625 $108.43

Exceptions: None

BIDDER: Valk Manufacturing Company
Length Width Thickness Amount Bid 

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8"  6" width: 6' 6" 5/8" $56.70

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4"  6" width: 6' 6" 3/4" $77.00

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8"  8" width: 6' 8" 5/8" $81.49

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4"  8" width: 6' 8" 3/4" $94.98

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8"  6" width: 7' 6" 5/8" $66.15

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4"  6" width: 7' 6" 3/4" $89.80

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8"  8" width: 7' 8" 5/8" $95.00

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4"  8" width: 7' 8" 3/4" $110.80
 
Exceptions: None
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