BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 2 (BCR-2024-2)
Harwell and Company, LLC Ammons & Blackmon Construction, LLC Mobile Asphalt Company, LLC Asphalt Services, Inc.
Alternate 1 - Fourteen Roads - All Labor and Material TOTAL: S 2,227,941.77 TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: S 1,618,517.12 |TOTAL: S 2,067,646.25
Lay D i 1,163,191.77 Lay D 5 529,781.10 |Lay Di H O BID Lay D R 830,461.50
Alternate 2 - Fourteen Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall . $ - oy o 3 PAM ) N yoown $

Provide Plant Mix Indexed Asphalt Cost: $1,048,792.40 Indexed Asphalt Cost: $1,048,792.40]Indexed Asphalt Cost: $0.00]Indexed Asphalt Cost: $1,048,792.40
TOTAL: $2,211,984.17 TOTAL: S 1,578,573.50 |TOTAL: $0.00 TOTAL: S 1,879,253.90

Bid Bond Included YES YES YES YES YES

Contract Included YES YES YES YES YES

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

|, MARK ACREMAN, P.E., ASSISTANT COUNTY ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE

%&&yﬁv Q@W S /Q / 14 REFERENGEN PREAEET,

MARK ACREMAN, P.E. Date o




Ammons & Blackmon Construction, LLC

Mobile Asphalt Company, LLC

Asphalt Services, Inc.

Alternate 1- FOURTEEN ROADS - All Labor and Material Harwell and Company, LLC
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME TTEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 939 s 5125
410H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVIGE EACH 1 B 17.25000 | 5
B00A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM [ s 320000 [ 3
703A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 68 s 8755
701A-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5' WIDE) MILE 2 s 218750 | 3
701A-309 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 $ 2,18750 | §
701A-304 | BROKEN YELLOW. CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE i B 137500 | 5
HW24020 DRISKELL RD FROM CONWAY RD TO COUNTY RD 85 701C-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 5 106250 | 5
701C-003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 s 1.50000 | 5
703D-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 68 s 425]s
7400000 | PILOT CAR EACH i s 660000 | 5
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 25 s 15000 |
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 25 s 15000 | 5
B8C-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON s s 13600 | 5 151,368.00
BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 25 s 5500 | 5
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME TTEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 469 B 512]s
410H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 B 1150000 | 5
B00A-000 |  MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 B 320000 [ 5
701A-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5 WIDE) MILE ) s 2,18750 | 5
701A-309 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 B 2.18750 |
701A-304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5 WIDE) MILE T s 137500 [ 5
HW24018 CONWAY RD FROM COUNTY RD 68 TO DRISKELL RD 701C-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 B 1.06250 |
701C-003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 s 1.500.00 [ $
703A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 50 s 8755
703D-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 50 s 4253
7400-000 | PILOT CAR EACH 1 B 440000 [ 5
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 25 s 15000 | 5
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 557 |s 136.00 | 5
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME TTEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 282 s 5125 1,44384
HW24017 CONWAY RD GROM DRISKELL RD TO EOM Ho0A000) 1 MOBILIZAION LUME.SUM L J 320000 1 8
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 25 5 15000 [ 5
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 334 5 13000 [ 5
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 331 5 5125
500A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 3,20000 | 5
o352 e CRER DR EROM O UNTYRE S5 O MALARG BR w24a3% |  SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 38" = = P 10506
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B s
703A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 2 B 5755
703D-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 22 5 25 s
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. | DESGRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 73 s 512[s
HW24026 PUBLISHER LN FROM OUTLOOK DR TO EXPLORER DR 5004000 MOBILIZATION LUMESUM 1 $ 320000 L §
w2aA33 |  SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 358" TON 7
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B H 15000 | §
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME TTEM NO. |DESGRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 259 512 B
HW24023 MALLARD DR FROM OUTLOOK DR TO EXPLORER DR SO0A000 | NOBILIZATION LOME:SUM 1 $ 320000 1 §
w2an33 | SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 38" ToR P
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX. ESAL RANGE A/B s 14000 | 5
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION ONIT QY UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 713 5125
HW24025 OUTLOOK DR FROM MALLARD DR TO MALLARD DR S00AD00 | MOBILIZATION LOME SUM i $ 3.200.00 |
w2ana3s | SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAVER, 358" Ton o
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/ s 14000 | 3
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 62 512 5
00A-000 |  MOBLLIZATION LUMP SUM i 3200 B
HW24013 AGCESSAYEFROMCOUNTY RD 85 TO'0UTLODKIDR w2aAa30 |  SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 38" — P
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B s 15000 | 3
703A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 2 s 8755
703D-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 2 B 255
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT QY UNIT PRICE BID PRICE |
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 200 s 5123 1,484.80 [
HW24015 CANVASBACK DR FROM OUTLOOK DR TO MALLARD DR BODAO00 | MOBILIZATION EOMP SUM 1 $ 320000 | §
w2ana3 |  SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 38" Ton 28
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX. ESAL RANGE A/8 s 14000 | 3

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
$ 0 400153 3,756.00 625| $ 5,868.75
$ = 001153 0.01 5.280.00 | § 5.280.00
$ - 14,000.00 | § 14,000.00 11,900.00 | $ 11,900.00
3 s 70083 476.00 10.00 | § 680.00
3 < 1.755.00 | 3 3,510.00 1.850.00 | $ 3.700.00
] - 1,755.00 | 3 1,755.00 1,850.00 | $ 1.850.00
S = 1,105.00 | 3 1,105.00 1.200.00 | § 1.200.00
$ = 855.00 | $ 1,710.00 950.00 | § 1.800.00
3 = 1.205.00 | § 3,615.00 1,300.00 | § 3,900.00
$ = 300(s3 204.00 400§ 272.00
3 3 0013 0.01 4.500.00 | $ 4.500.00
B - 1s 135.00 | 3 3.37500 | § 138.00 | § 3.450.00
3 = $ 135.00 | § 337500 | § 138.00 | $ 3.450.00
$ = $ 96.00 | $ 108,848.00 | $ 126.00 | $ 140,238.00
$ = $ 20.00 | 500.00 | § 50.00 | § 1,250.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
$ i 4003 1.876.00 | $ 3,048.50
$ = 0013 001] $ 2.800.00 2,800.00
3 = 7.300.00 | 730000 | § 7.500.00 7.500.00
S i 1,755.00 | § 1,755.00 | § 1,850.00 1,850.00
3 - 1.755.00 | § 1,755.00 | § 1.850.00 1,850.00
s - 1,105.00 | $ 1.105.00 1,200.00 1.200.00
$ - 855.00 | $ 1,710.00 950.00 1,900.00
$ - 1,205.00 | $ 2,410.00 1,200.00 2.400.00
s - 7.00 [ $ 420.00 10.00 600.00
$ - 3005 180.00 4.00 240.00
3 = 00153 0.01 5,000.00 5.000.00
3 - $ 135.00 | § 3,375.00 135.00 3.375.00
3 = $ 100.00 | § 55,700.00 126.00 | § 70.182.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
3 = 4003 1,128.00 650 | $ 1.833.00
$ - 3,800.00 | § 3,800.00 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
$ - 135.00 | 5 3,375.00 135.00 | § 3,375.00
s - 100.00 | 3 33,400.00 124.00 | § 41.416.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
B - 1s 4005 132400 | $ 650 | 8 2,151.50
B - 13 3,500.00 | 3 350000 [ § 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
$ S 3 115.00 [ $ 30,015.00 | $ 124.00 | § 32,364.00
$ =z $ 70083 15400 | $ 10.00 | § 220.00
$ - 13 3003 66.00 [ $ 400 8 88.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
3 = $ i 3 292.00 | $ 2 $ 474.50
3 - $ 500.00 | § 50000 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
3 - $ 11500 | § 655500 | $ 130.00 | § 7.410.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
S o) $ 400 |3 1,036.00 | $ $ 1.683.50
$ ol $ 2,500.00 | § 2,500.00 | $ 1.850.00 | $ 1,850.00
3 g $ 115.00 | $ 26,33500 | $ 124.00 | § 28,396.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
3 d $ 400 |3 285200 | § 650 | § 4,634.50
3 - $ 6,000.00 | § 600000 | $ 7.700.00 | $ 7.700.00
S - 1S 115.00 | $ 64,74500 | $ 124.00 | § 69.812.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
$ - 1s 4005 24800 [ § . $ 403.00
] - $ 1,500.00 | $ 1.500.00 | $ 1.500.00 | § 1,500.00
3 N $ 115.00 [ 8 563500 | $ 135.00 | $ 6.615.00
$ & $ 7.00 (3 154.00 | $ 10.00 | § 220.00
$ < $ s 3 66.00 | $ 400§ 88.00
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
$ = $ 1 3 1,180.00 | § 650 | § 1.885.00
$ - $ 2,500.00 | $ 250000 | $ 3.000.00 | $ 3.000.00
] - $ 11500 [ § 2633500 | $ 12400 ] $ 28,396.00




PROJECT NO.

ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION

ROAD NAME UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 921 3 5128
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 17.250.00 | $
B00A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 3.20000 | §
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 22 $ 875]%
701A-227 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 3 6.606.25 | $
701A-230 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 6.606.25 | $
HW24021 £ COUNTY RD 68 FROM ST HWY 58 TO COUNTY RD 68 701B-300 DOTTED, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE LF 375 $ 4003
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 $ 1,062.50 | $
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 22 $ 425(8%
705A-037 PAVEMENT MARKERS, CLASS A-H, TYPE 2-D EACH 103 S 1250 | §
7400-000 PILOT CAR EACH 1 3 6.600.00 | $
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 50 3 150.00 | §
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 50 $ 150.00 | $
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1081 3 136.00 | § 148,376.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT QrYy UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 3993 3 5128 20,444.18
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 40.250.00 | 3
B00A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 3,200.00 | §
701A-227 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 8 $ 6.606.25 | $
701A-230 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 6 $ 6.606.25 | $
701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 4 $ 1.375.00 | $
701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 8 $ 1.062.50 | $
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 10 3 1,500.00 | §
HW24018 COUNTY RD 68 FROM E COUNTY RD 68 TO BUC-EE'S BLVD 703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 170 3 875(5%
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 170 3 425( %
705A-032 PAVEMENT MARKERS, CLASS A-H, TYPE 1-B EACH 204 3 B75(%
705A-037 PAVEMENT MARKERS, CLASS A-H, TYPE 2-D EACH 130 3 B875(%
705A-038 PAVEMENT MARKERS, CLASS A-H, TYPE 2-E EACH 43 :3 875|%
7400-000 PILOT CAR EACH 1 3 15,400.00 | $
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 100 3 14000 | $
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 100 3 14000 | §
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 4735 3 136.00 | § 643,960.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT QrY UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 930 3 5128 4,761.60
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 3 17.250.00 | $
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 3 3.200.00 | §
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 66 $ 875|8
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 s 2,187.50 | §
701A-309 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 $ 2,187.50 | §
701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 $ 1,375.00 | §
HW24014 BLACK DEVINE RD FROM ST HWY 58 TO CABINET SHOP RD 701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 1,062.50 |
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 1,500.00 | §
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 66 3 425| %
7400-000 PILOT CAR EACH 1 3 6,600.00 | $
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1102 S 136.00 | $ 149,872.00
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 25 H 150.00 | $
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 25 3 150.00 | $
BC-800 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 273 3 320053
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 938 3 5128
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 3 17.250.00 | §
B600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 3 3,200.00 | §
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 80 3 875]8
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 3 2,187.50 | $
701A-309 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 3 2,187.50 | §
HW24019 COUNTY RD 71 N FROM COUNTY RD 64 TO COUNTY RD 68 701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 3 1,375.00 [ §
701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 3 1,082.50 |
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 1,500.00 | $
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 80 3 425|8
7400-000 PILOT CAR CH 1 3 6,600.00 | $
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 25 $ 150.00 | $
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1113 3 136.00 | $ 151,368.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE b
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 521 3 5128 2,667.52
B00A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 3,200.00 | §
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 3 2,187.50 | $
HW24024 OAKDALE RD FROM BBE TO COUNTY RD 64 701A-308 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 3 218750 | §
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 3 1,500.00 | §
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 25 3 150.00 | §
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 817 3 136.00 | 83,012.00 |
TOTAL $  2,227,941.77

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
3 L $ 3 3,684.00 5,986.50
S - $ 00153 0.01 5,500.00 5,500.00
S = $ 15,500.00 | $ 15,500.00 14.000.00 14,000.00
$ 700(5s 154.00 9.00 198.00
$ 5,305.00 | § 10,610.00 5,300.00 10.600.00
$ 5,305.00 | $ 10,610.00 5,300.00 10.600.00
$ 20053 750.00 250 937.50
$ 855.00 | § 3,420.00 1,300.00 5,200.00
$ 3.00|5% 66.00 4.00 88.00
$ 10.00 | § 1,030.00 10.00 1.030.00
$ 001]5% 0.01 4.500.00 4.500.00
$ 105.00 | $ 5,250.00 135.00 6.750.00
$ 105.00 | $ 5,250.00 135.00 6.750.00
- $ 94.00 | 102,554.00 126.00 137.466.00

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
S - $ 15.972.00 | § 25,954.50
S - 001]$ 001] 8 22,500.00 22,500.00
60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 42,000.00 42,000.00
5,305.00 | $ 42,440.00 | § 5,185.00 41,480.00
5,305.00 | $ 31,83000 | § 5,185.00 31.110.00
1.105.00 | $ 442000 | § 1,200.00 4,800.00
855.00 | $ 6.840.00 | $ 950.00 7.600.00
1.205.00 | $ 12,050.00 | $ 1,300.00 13,000.00
700(s 1,190.00 10.00 1,700.00
3005 510.00 4.00 680.00
700(s 1,428.00 10.00 2,040.00
7005 910.00 10.00 1.300.00
7008 301.00 10.00 430.00
001(5s 0.01 6,500.00 | $ 6.500.00
105.00 | 3 10,500.00 135.00 | § 13,500.00
105.00 | $ 10,500.00 135.00 | § 13,500.00
- 94.00 | § 445,090.00 126.00 | $ 596,610.00

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
3 - $ S 3.,720.00 6,045.00
$ - $ 001[S 0.01 6.500.00 6.500.00
13,000.00 | § 13,000.00 12,750.00 12,750.00
700 |53 462.00 10.00 660.00
1.755.00 | $ 3,510.00 1,850.00 3.700.00
1,755.00 | § 1,755.00 1.850.00 1,850.00
1,105.00 | § 1,105.00 1,200.00 1,200.00
855.00 | $ 1.710.00 950.00 1,900.00
1,205.00 | $ 2,410.00 1,300.00 2,600.00
300(S 198.00 4.00 264.00
001($ 0.01 5,500.00 5.500.00
96.00 | $ 105,792.00 | $ 126.00 138.852.00
135.00 | $ 337500 ] $ 135.00 3.375.00
135.00 | § 337500 | $ 135.00 3.375.00
- 2000 | s 5.460.00 | § 50.00 13.650.00

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
$ o 4005 3,752.00 6.097.00
$ = 00158 0.01 6.000.00 6.000.00
3 = 13,000.00 | 13,000.00 10,000.00 10.000.00
3 = 700(s 560.00 10.00 800.00
£ - 1,755.00 | $ 3,510.00 1.850.00 3,700.00
$ - 1,755.00 | $ 1,755.00 1.850.00 1,850.00
$ - $ 1,105.00 | $ 1,105.00 1.200.00 1,200.00
3 - 855.00 | § 1,710.00 950.00 1,900.00
$ = 1.205.00 | $ 2,410.00 1.300.00 2,600.00
$ = 3008 240.00 4.00 320.00
$ - 0.01]% 0018 6.300.00 6.300.00
135.00 | § 337500 | $ 135.00 3.375.00
= 96.00 | $ 106.848.00 | $ 126.00 140,238.00

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
3 - 3 2,084.00 6.50 3.386.50
£ - 8,000.00 | 5 8,000.00 7,500.00 7.500.00
3 - 1.755.00 | $ 3,510.00 1,850.00 3,700.00
S & 1.755.00 | 3.510.00 1.850.00 3,700.00
3 - 1.205.00 | § 4,820.00 1,300.00 5,200.00
3 = 135.00 | § 3.37500| § 135.00 3,375.00
3 = 96.00 | $ 5923200 | $ 122.00 75,274.00
NO BID $ 1,618,517.12 $  2,067,646.25




Alternate 2 - NINETEEN ROADS - All Labor and Material Except County provided asphalt as noted by *

Harwell and Company, LLC Jokin G Walton Ammons & LLC Moblle Asphalt Company, LLC Asphalt Services, Inc.
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO, |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qiy UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TAGK COAT GALLON 930 $ 512§ 4,807.68 $ 6008 5,034.00 $ $ 6.50 | § 6,103.50
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 17,260.00 | $ 17,250.00 $ 1,670,00 | $ 1,670,00 $ $ 760000 | $ 7,600.00
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 3,200.00 | § 3,200.00 $ 2,262.00 | § 2,262,00 $ $ 12,5000 | § 12,600.00
703A:002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 68 3 875 6 5905.00 $ ) 7.70] ¢ 623,60 $ $ 10.00 [ § 680.00
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 [ 2.187.60 | $ 4,375.00 3 $ 102500 | § 3,850.00 3 $ 1,850:00 | $ 3,700.00
701A-300 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS {H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 $ 2,187.60 | § 2,187.50 $ $ 102500 | § 1,025.00 $ 5 1,850.00 | § 1,850.00
701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS iH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) ILE 1 $ 1,875.00 | § 1,375.00 $ 5 1,210.00 | § 1,210.00 $ $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200,00
HW24020 DRISKELL RD FROM CONWAY RD TO COUNTY RD 65 701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW. [ 2 $ 1.062.60 | $ 2,126:00 $ $ 935.00 | $ 1.870.00 3 [ 950,00 | & 1,800.00
7010003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW IE 3 $ 1,600.00 [ § 4,500.00 ) 5 1,320.00 | § 3,060.00 $ $ 1,300.00 [ § 3,000.00
7030:001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 68 $ 425 ¢ 280.00 % $ 330 [ § 224.40 $ $ 400] § 272,00
7400-000 PILOT CAR EACH i 3 6,600.00 | § 6,600.00 3 5 1,113.00 [ § 1,118.00 [ $ 5,500.00 | § 6,600.00
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 25 3 65.00 | § 1,626.00 $ $ 60.00 | § 1,250.00 $ $ 60.00 | § 1,260.00
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 25 5 68500 | § 1,625.00 3 50.00 [ § 1,260.00 [ 60.00 | § 1,250,00
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON [IXEE B 51.00 | $ 66,763.00 $ 13,80 | § 16,350.40 $ 2600 § 28,038.00
BC-000 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 25 $ 65,00 | § 1,625.00 $ 10000 [ § 2,500.00 $ 4500 [ § 1,125.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE
405A:000 TACK COAT GALLON 460 $ 5128 2,401.28 $ $ 6.00 [ § 2,814.00 $ $ 650 | $ 3,048.50
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,600.00 $ $ 836,00 | $ 838,00 $ $ 550000 | § 5,500.00
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 3,200.00 [ § 3,200.00 5 $ 1,067.00 | $ 1,967.00 $ ) 9,500.00 | $ 9,500.00
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, GLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 $ 218760 | $ 2,187.50 $ ] 1,025.00 | § 1,026,00 $ $ 1,850.00 | § 1,850.00
701A:300 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 3 2,187.60 | § 2,187.50 5 $ 1,625.00 | § 1,625,00 [} ] 1,850.00 | § 1:850.00,
701A7304 BROKEN YELLOW, GLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 5 1,376.00 | § 1,375.00 $ $ 1,21000 [ § 1,210.00 $ ) 1,200.00 | § 1,200.00
HW24016 CONWAY RD FROM COUNTY RD 68 TO DRISKELL RD 7010-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 3 1,062.60 | $ 2,126.00 3 $ 935,00 | $ 1,870.00 $ $ 050,00 | § 1,800.00
7010003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 3 1,600.00 | § 3,000.00 $ $ 1,820.00 | $ 2,640.00 $ ] 1,200.00 | § 2,400.00
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, GLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 60 $ 876] % 525,00 $ [ 770[$ 462,00 $ $ 10.00 [ $ 600.00
7030001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 60 3 425§ 265.00 [ 3 3.30]% 198,00 ) [ 400§ 240.00
7400000 PILOT CAR EACH 1 $ 4400.00 | § 4,400.00 $ $ 557,00 | § 657,00 $ % 500000 | § 5,000.00
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MiX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 2% $ 65.00 | § 1,625.00 3 50.00 | $ 1,250.00 B 5000 | & 1,250.00
BC-723 BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MiX - PER TON TON 557 5 5100 | § 28,407.00 $ 3 1380 [ $ 7,680.60 $ $ 2400 | § 13,38.00
PROJEGT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. | DESORIPTION UNIT qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 282 5129 1,443.84 $ $ .00 [ § 1,602.00 $ [} .50 | ¢ 1,833,00
HW24017 GONWAY RD GROM DRISKELL RD TO EOM 600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 3,20000 [ § 3,200.00 ] $ 847.00 | $ 647.00 $ $ 3,00000 | § 3,00000
BC-723L BALDWIN GOUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MiX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 25 65.00 | § 1,626.00 § $ 50.00 | § 1,260.00 $ $ 3500 § 87500
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 334 65.00 | $ 18,370.00 $ 5 2060 | § 6,880.40 $ $ 2250 $ 7,515.00
PROJECT NO, ROAD NAME TTEM NO, | DESGRIPTION UNIT qTv UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID FRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE GNIT PRICE BID PRIGE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 331 $ 612]¢ 1,604.72 $ § 600§ 1,886.00 $ $ K 2,151.50
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 [ 3,20000 | § 3,200.00 [ 3 035.00 | $ 035,00 [ 3 3,000.00 | § 3,000.00
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 3/8"
Hw2d022 EXPLORER DR FROM COUNTY RD 85 TO MALLARD DR 4240938 | \MAXIMUM AFEREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B TON i Kd b I 14,355,00 $ $ 26.40 | 8 689040 s s 2250 8 5872.50
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, OLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 22 $ 875]% 162.50 3 s 7.70] 8 169.40 $ $ 1000 § 220.00
7030001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 22 [ 26| ¢ 03.50 $ $ 30§ 72.60 $ $ 400] $ 88.00
PROJEGT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO, |DESGRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE UNIT PRICE BID. PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE
405A-000 TAGK COAT GALLON 73 $ 512§ 373,76 $ $ 600§ 438.00 ) $ 8.50] § 474.50
HW24028 PUBLISHER LN FROM OUTLOOK DR TO EXPLORER DR 600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 § 3,20000 | § 3,200.00 $ ] 16100 | § 161.00 $ $ 1,20000 | $ 1,200.00
PPy SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS GONGRETE WEARING SURFAGE LAYER, 378" ToN 57
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/ $ 65.00 | § 3,706.00 $ $ 26.40) ¢ 1,604.80 $ $ 3000 $ 1,710.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME iTEM NO. |DESGRIPTION UNIT aTy UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE B8ID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 269 5 512§ 1,326.08 B $ 6.00 | § 1,654.00 $ 5 650 § 1,683,60
HW24023 MALLARD DR FROM OUTLOOK DR TO EXPLORER DR 600A000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM i 3 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 $ $ 11400 [ § 114,00 $ $ 2.500.00 | $ 2,600.00
124A5% SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONGRETE WEARING SURFAGE LAYER, 376" Ton 220
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MiX, ESAL RANGE A/B ] 55.00 | § 12,605.00 $ $ 28.40 % 6,045.80 $ 3 2250 | § 6,162.60
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE
405A-000 TAOK COAT GALLON 713 $ 51218 3,660.66 5 $ 5.00 | § 4,278.00 [ ] 850 % 4,634,650
HW24025 OUTLOOK DR FROM MALLARD DR TO MALLARD DR 600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM [ 0 3,20000 | § 3,200.00 $ $ 18100 [ § 181.00 $ $ 3,00000 [ § 3,000.00
124AT30 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 376" ToN 503
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/8 $ 55.00 30,965.00 $ $ 1380 | § 7,769.40 $ $ 2260 | $ 12,667.60
PROJEGT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESGRIPTION UNIT qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRIGE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 62 $ 612]§ 317.44 $ $ 6.00 [ § 372.00 § 5 650 § 403.00
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM [ $ 3,20000 | § 3,200.00 $ $ 978,00 | $ 076.00 $ $ 1,200.00 [ $ 1,200,00
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFAGE LAYER, 4/8"
HW24013 ACCESS AVE FROM COUNTY RD 65 TO OUTLOOK DR 4247336 MAKIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE M. EoAr. RANGE /B TON 4 4 500 | & 2,185.00 $ $ 26.40 | § 1,203.60 $ $ 30.00 | § 1,470.00
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 22 $ 876 ¢ 192.50 $ 5 770 % 160,40 $ $ 10.00 | $ 220.00
. 703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 22 $ 25| 8 03.50 $ $ 30 [ $ 72.60 $ $ 400] § 88.00
PROJECT NO, ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESGRIPTION UNIT QT UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 200 $ 5.12] ¢ 1,484.80 $ $ 800§ 1,740.00 $ $ 8.50 | § 1,886.00
HW24015 CANVASBACK DR FROM OUTLOOK DR TO MALLARD DR 600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP UM 1 $ 3,20000 | $ 3,200.00 $ $ 17.00 [ $ 117.00 $ 5 1,20000 | § 1,200.00
424A 330 SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONGRETE WEARING. SURFAGE LAYER, 3/8" ToN 22
MAXIMUM AFFREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/8 $ 5500 | $ 12,695.00 $ $ 284009 6,045.60 $ $ 2250 | $ 5,162.60




PROJECT NO, ROAD NAME ITEM NO, [DESORIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE URIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE
405A-000 TACK GOAT GALLON 621 $ 512[¢ 4,715.62 $ - Is 6008 5,626.00 3 - s 650 | § 5,086.50
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 17,260.00 [ § 17,260.00 $ - I3 1,637.00 | § 1,637.00 $ - s 7,600.00 | § 7,600.00
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM [ 3 3,200.00 | § 3,200.00 $ - I3 471200 [ § 471200 $ - | 14,000.00 | $ 14,000:00
703A-002 TRAFFIG CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 22 $ 875§ 102.50 $ 7.70 160,40 $ 0.00] § 198:00
701A227 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC-STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 6,606.25 | $ 13,212.60 $ 5,814.00 11,628.00 $ 5,300.00 ] § 10,600:00
701A-230 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIG STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 660626 | $ 13,212.50 3 5,814.00 11,828:00 $ 5,300.00 | § 10,600.00
Hw24o21 E COUNTY RD 68 FROM ST HWY 59 TO GOUNTY RD 66 701B-300 DOTTED, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE - 1 375 s 40018 1,500.00 5 2.20 825.00 3 250 § 0937.50
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIG STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 $ 1,062,50 { $ 4,250,00 3 935.00 3,740.00 $ 1,300.00 [ $ 5,200.00
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC GONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 22 s 425 (% ©3.50 3 330[$ 72.60 $ 400 | § 88,00
705A-037 PAVEMENT MARKERS, CLASS A-H, TYPE 2-D EAGH 103 s 12:60 | § 1,287.50 $ 1100 |8 1,133.00 $ 1000 § 1,030.00
7400-000. PILOT CAR EACH 1 B 6,600.00 [ § 6,600.00 $ 1,001.00 | § 1,001.00 $ 4,600.00 | § 4,500.00
BC-723P BALDWIN GOUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 50 $ 8500 | $ 3,260,00 $ 50.00 | § 2,600.00. $ 5000 | $ 2,600.00
8C-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 50 $ 85.00 | § 3,260.00 $ 60.00 | § 2,500.00 $ 50.00 | § 2,600.00
8C-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1091 $ 51.00 | § 55,841.00 $ - |s 1380 | § 15,065:80 $ - 1 2800 8 28,369,00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO, |DESGRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE 81D PRIGE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A:000 TAGK COAT GALLON 3093 $ 512 [ $ 20,444.16 $ - |s 6.00($ 23,958,00 $ -1 8508 26,054.50
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EAGH 1 $ 40,250.00 | § 40,250.00 $ - Is 7,103.00 | $ 7,103.00 $ - s 25,000.00 | § 25,000.00
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 $ 7,192.00 | § 7,182.00 $ 47,000.00 | $ 47,000,00
701A-227 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 8 $ 6,606.25 | $ 52,650.00 $ 5814.00 | § 46,512.00 $ 518500 | & 41,480.00
701A-230 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS'2, TYPE A TRAFFIG STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 6 $ 6,606.25 [ § 30,637.50 $ 5:814.00 | $ 34,884:00 $ 518500 | § 31,110.00
701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC'STRIPE (5" WIDE} MILE 4 $ 1,37500 | § 5,500.00 $ 1,210.00 | $ 4,840.00 $ 1,20000 | § 4,800.00
7010002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 8 $ 1,062.50 | § 8,600.00 $ 93500 [ § 7,480.00 $ 85000 | § 7,860.00
7016-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 10 s 1,500.00 | § 15,000.00 $ 1,320.00 | § 13,200.00 s 1,300.00 | $ 13,000.00
HW24018 COUNTY RD 68 FROM E GOUNTY RD 68 TO BUC-EE'S BLVD 703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, OLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 170 $ 875|% 1,487,50 $ 77008 1,309.00 3 10.00]§ 1,700.00
7030-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 170 $ 425§ 722,50 3 330 [ 561.00 $ 400§ 680.00
705A-032 PAVEMENT MARKERS; GLASS A-H, TYPE 1-B EACH 204 3 875§ 1,785:00 s 770 $ 1,570.80 $ 10008 2,040,00
705A:037 PAVEMENT MARKERS, CLASS A-H, TYPE 2-D EACH 130 $ 8758 1,137.60 3 7708 1,001.00 $ 1000 § 1,300.00
705A-038 PAVEMENT MARKERS, CLASS A-H, TYPE 2-E EACH 4 $ 875§ 378.25 $ 77018 331.40 $ 1000 § 430,00
7400-000 PILOT GAR EACH 1 $ 15,400.00 | $ 15,400.00 $ 4,735.00 | § 4,735.00 $ 850000 | § 8,600.00
BC-723P BALDWIN GOUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING « PER TON TON 100 s 65.00 [ § 6,500,00 $ 50.00 | § 5,000.00 $ 5000 | § 5,000.00
8C-723L BALDWIN.COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 100 B 65.00 | § 6,600.00 s 50,00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 50.00 | $ 5,000.00
BO-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 4735 s §1.00 | § 241,485.00 $ - s 1380 [ § 66,343,00 s - |s 28001 & 123,110.00
PROJEGT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. [PESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRIGE UNIT PRICE 8ID PRICE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 930 s 512 | § 4,761.60 $ - s 600]§ 5,580.00 $ - s 6.60 | § 6,045.00
410H-000 |, MATERIAL REMIXING DEVIGE EAGH 1 $ 17,260,00 | § 17,250.00 3 I ) 1,863.00 | § 1,653.00 $ - {s 7,500.00 | § 7,500.00
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP'SUM 1 s 3,20000 | § 3,200.00 $ 2,203,00 [ $ 2,203.00 $ 12,760.00 | § 12,760.00
703A-002 TRAFFIC GONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPEA SQUARE FEET 66 $ 8758 577.50 $ 7.70 | § 508.20 s 1000 § 680.00
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS {H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 2,187.50 | § 4,375.00 $ 1,025.00 | § 3,860.00 $ 1,860.00 | § 3,700.00
701A-300 SOLID YELLOW, GLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC.STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 1 $ 2,187.50 | § 2,187.50 $ 1,925.00 [ § 1,625,00 $ 1,850.00 | § 1,850.00
701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 1 3 1,375.00 | § 1,376.00. $ 1,21000 [ & 1,210.00 $ 1,20000 | § 1,200.00
Hw24014 BLACK DEVINE RD FROM ST HWY 60 TO CABINET SHOP RD 701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 1,062.60 | § 2,126.00 $ 935.00 | § 1,870.00 $ 850.00 | § 1,800.00
701G-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC. STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 ) 1,600.00 | § 3,000.00 s 1,32000 | § 2,840.00 $ 1,300.00 [ § 2,600,00
7030001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 66 $ 426 8 280:50 $ 33018 217.80 $ 400 8 264,00
7400-000 PILOT GAR EACH 1 $ 6,600.00 | § 6,600.00 5 110200 | $ 1,102.00 $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,600,00
B8C-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1102 $ 61.00 | § 66,202,00 3 1380 | § 15,207.80 $ 2600 28,652.00
BC-723P BALDWIN GOUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 25 ) 65.00 | § 1,625.00 B 50.00 | § 1,250,00 3 50.00 | $ 1,250.00
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 25 $ 6500 | $ 1,626,00 % 5000 | § 1,260.00 $ 5000 [ $ 1,250.00
§C-600 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 273 $ 3200 $ 8,738,00 $ - 18 2500 | ¢ 6,825.00 $ - 1 4500 | § 12,285.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME JTEM NO, | DESCRIPTION UNIT qrY UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRIGE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE /
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 038 [} 512§ 4,802.56 $ - Is 6.00 ¢ 5,628.00 $ - s 660 | § 6,007.00
410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 17,260.00 | § 17,250.00 $ - Is 1,113:00 | § 1,113.00 $ - s 8,000.00.] $ 8,000.00
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 ) 3,20000 [ § 3,200,00 $ - s 2,169.00 | § 2,169.00 $ - s 12,00000 | § 12,000,00
703A-002 TRAFFIG CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 80 ) 8758 700.00 $ - s 7708 616.00 3 - 13 1000 $ 800.00
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5 WIDE) MILE 2 $ 2,187.50 [ § 4,376.00 $ - s 182500 | § 3,850.00 % - 18 1,850.00 [ § 3,700.00
701A-300 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE [ $ 2,187.50 | § 2,187.50 $ R 1,026.00 | $ 1,625.00 $ - |3 1,850.00 | $ 1,850.00
HW24010 COUNTY RD 71 N FROM COUNTY RD 64 TO COUNTY RD 68 701A<304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 $ 1,875.00 | $ 1,376.00 $ - s 1,210:00 | § 1,210.00 $ - s 1,200.00' } $ 1,200.00
7015002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 3 1,062.60 | § 2,125.00 $ - s 03500 [ $ 1,870.00 $ - |8 950,00 | § 1,800.00
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 $ 1,600.00 | § 3,000.00 $ - s 1,82000 | $ 2,640,060 $ - 1 1,30000 | § 2,600.00
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 80 $ 4258 340.00 $ - 1s 330 | 8 264,00 $ - 1s 400§ 320.00
7400-:000 PILOT CAR EACH 1 $ 6,600.00 | § 6,600.00 $ ) 1,113.00 | $ 1,113.00 $ - |s 7,000.00 | $ 7,000:00
80-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 2% $ 85.00 [ § 1,625.00 $ 50.00 | § 1,250.00 $ 50.00 [ $ 1,250.00
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 113 $ 51.00 | § 58,763.00 $ - s 1380 | ¢ 15,350.40 $ - I3 26.00 | § 26,938.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. [DESGRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRIGE BID PRICE UNIT FRIGE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRIGE BID PRIGE
405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 621 $ 512 | § 2,667.52 $ - 13 8,00 | $ 3,126.00 18 R ] 660 | § 3,386.60.
600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 3 3,20000 | § 3,200.00 $ - 18 2,005.00 [ $ 2,005.00 $ - s 450000 | § 4,600.00
701A301 SOLID WHITE, GLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE] MILE 2 $ 2,187.50.| § 4,875.00 $ - s 1,826.00 | § 3,850.00 $ - 13 1,850.00 | § 3,700.00
HW24024 OAKDALE RD FROM BBE TO COUNTY RD 64 701A-300 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 2 $ 2,187.50 | § 4,375.00 $ - |s 1,025.00 | § 3,860.00 $ K 186000 | $ 3,700.00
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIG STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 $ 1,600.00 | § 8,000.00 $ B 1,320,00 | § 6,280.00 $ B ) 1,300.00 | § 5,200,00
BC-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 25 3 65,00 | § 1,826.00 $ - 1s 60.00 | § 1,250.00 $ - |s 30.00 | $ 760.00
8G-728 BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON - _TON a17 $ 51.00 [ $ 31,467.00 $ - s 1380 [ § 8,614.60 $ - s 2260 | § 13,882,60
TOTAL $  1,163,191.77 NO BID $ 529,781.10 NO BID $ 830,461.50
$ 1,161,691.40 3 527,687.30 $ 830,461.50
$ {1,500.37) s 2,093.80 $ -






