
COMPETITIVE BID #WG25-13 BID TABULATION 
Provision of Heavy Duty All Steel Trailer Tires

BIDDER: Sweat Tire Southern Tire Mart, LLC
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber 

Co.
ST225/75R15 – G All Steel STR (14 Ply Rating)

Model: Samson - V88150-2
TRAILERMASTER TMST13A

Special Order Request Pricing 
When Needed

Amount Bid/Each: $108.80 $128.00 NO BID

Days/ARO: 2-3 DAYS 3-4 DAYS

ST235/80R16 – H All Steel STR (16 Ply Rating)

Model: Synergy - SY2155 GLADIATOR ALL STEEL
Special Order Request Pricing 

When Needed

Amount Bid/Each: $135.69 $129.00 NO BID

Days/ARO: 2-3 DAYS 3-4 DAYS

ST225/75R15 LR (14 Ply Rating) All Steel Trailer *10 Ply Rating
Master ST PRO + All Steel STR

Model: Synergy - SYT3008

Amount Bid/Each: $71.76

Days/ARO: 2-3 DAYS

ST235/80R16 LR H (16 Ply Rating) All Steel Trailer
Master ST Pro + All Steel STR

Model: Synergy - SY2155
GLADIATOR ALL STEEL

Special Order Request Pricing 
When Needed

Amount Bid/Each: $135.69 $129.00 NO BID

Days/ARO: 2-3 DAYS 3-4 DAYS

ST235/80R16 G ALL STEEL (16 Ply Rating) *14 Ply Rating

Model: Transeagle - TA15
GLADIATOR ALL STEEL

Special Order Request Pricing 
When Needed

Amount Bid/Each: $122.06 $129.00 NO BID

Days/ARO: 2-3 DAYS 3-4 DAYS

245/70R 17.5 LR E (18 Ply Rating) 

Model: Advance - V876546
ZENNA AP-250

Goodyear 139823740 
245/70R17.5 J KMAX T ULT 

INMETRO TL

Amount Bid/Each: $162.16 $175.00 $369.32

Days/ARO: 2-3 DAYS 3-4 DAYS delivery within 10 days

215-75-R17.5

Model: Arisan - TH96150
GLADIATOR QR40-ST

Goodyear 756246567 
215/75R175 H G114 LP STTL

Amount Bid/Each: $129.75 $135.00 $266.77

Days/ARO: 2-3 DAYS 3-4 DAYS delivery within 10 days

Exceptions:  Sweat Tire also bid on ST225/75R15 LR (14 Ply Rating) All Steel Trailer Master ST PRO + All Steel STR that was listed in the bid  
specifications but was omitted from the bid response form.  *Ply rating differences were noted on two of the tires.
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