
COMPETITIVE BID #WG25-22 BID TABULATION
Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories

BIDDER:  Dana Safety Supply BIDDER:  Gulf States Performance, LLC BIDDER: A & A Auto Parts Stores, Inc.
GROUP #1 GROUP #1 GROUP #1
SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS

Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid
5.5 Foot Regular Bed No Bid 5.5 Foot Regular Bed $650.00 5.5 Foot Regular Bed $0.00
6.5 Foot Regular Bed No Bid 6.5 Foot Regular Bed $700.00 6.5 Foot Regular Bed $0.00
6.5 Foot Utility Bed No Bid 6.5 Foot Utility Bed $850.00 6.5 Foot Utility Bed $0.00

ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each EN3225 $495.00 each ECCCO EW3225 $289.00 each

BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901 BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901 BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each 79010901 $495.00 each BETTER BUILT 79010901 $473.00 each

BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902 BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902 BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each 79010902 $525.00 each BETTER BUILT 79010902 $473.00 each

CAMLOCKER TOOLBOX MATTE BLACK FOR CREW CAB CAMLOCKER TOOLBOX MATTE BLACK FOR CREW CAB CAMLOCKER TOOLBOX MATTE BLACK FOR CREW CAB
SILVERADO SILVERADO SILVERADO
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each S71LPLMB $995.00 each UWS TBSD69ALPM $469.00 each

F-150 F-150 F-150
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each S71LPRLMB $995.00 each UWS TBSD69AMB $472.00 each

F-250 F-250 F-250
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each S71LPRLMB $995.00 each UWS TBSD72LBTAB $635.00 each

RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each 502313 $420.00 each RIGID 502313 $269.00 each

DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PART XF4 TONNEAU COVER DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PART XF4 TONNEAU COVER DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PART XF4 TONNEAU COVER
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each XF4 $1,599.00 each DECKED XF4 $1,408.72 each

TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each VX12022-VX22029 $1,250.00 each No Bid each

ROUGH COUNTRY RETRACTABLE BED COVER 46120581A ROUGH COUNTRY RETRACTABLE BED COVER 46120581A ROUGH COUNTRY RETRACTABLE BED COVER 46120581A
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid

No Bid each 46120581A $1,095.00 each No Bid each

Exceptions:  None Exceptions:  Labor Rate $135 per Hour if Required Exceptions:  None

1



BIDDER:  Dana Safety Supply BIDDER:  Gulf States Performance, LLC BIDDER: A & A Auto Parts Stores, Inc.
GROUP #2 GROUP #2 GROUP #2

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODELS 2021+ RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODELS 2021+ RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODELS 2021+
FORD F150 FORD F150 FORD F150
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid
RAM-VB-195-SW1 $236.86 each Kit No Bid each No Bid each

Base Mount Amount Bid Base Mount Amount Bid Base Mount Amount Bid
each No Bid each No Bid each

FORD EXPLORER AND INTERCEPTOR UTILITY FORD EXPLORER AND INTERCEPTOR UTILITY FORD EXPLORER AND INTERCEPTOR UTILITY
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid
RAM-VB-202-A-SW1 $252.89 each Kit No Bid each No Bid each

Base Mount Amount Bid Base Mount Amount Bid Base Mount Amount Bid
each No Bid each No Bid each

CHEVROLET TAHOE CHEVROLET TAHOE CHEVROLET TAHOE
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid
RAM-VB-203-SW1 $235.03 each Kit No Bid each No Bid each

Base Mount Amount Bid Base Mount Amount Bid Base Mount Amount Bid
each No Bid each No Bid each

BROTHER POCKETJET PJ823-VK IN 
CAR PRINTER INCLUDING POWER 
CABLE PART AND USB CABLE

BROTHER POCKETJET PJ823-VK IN CAR PRINTER 
INCLUDING POWER CABLE PART AND USB CABLE

BROTHER POCKETJET PJ823-VK IN CAR PRINTER 
INCLUDING POWER CABLE PART AND USB CABLE

Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid
DJ823-VK $511.83 each No Bid each No Bid each
Cable LB3692-003
RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid
RAM-VPR-101 $41.21 each No Bid each No Bid each
   
E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE
Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid
M260 $497.95 each M260 and USB No Bid each M260 and USB No Bid each
Cable EN8000

Exceptions/Notes: Exceptions/Notes: Exceptions/Notes:
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