

COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-34 - BID TABULATION
Provision of Paint Striping Materials

BIDDER: Crown USA Inc.		Supply Location: Foley, AL			
Item Description	Amount Bid PICKED-UP		Amount Bid DELIVERED		
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 0.68	per pound	\$ 0.72	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 0.95	per pound	\$ 0.99	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 0.97	per pound	\$ 1.01	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 4.00	per pound	\$ 4.04	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	\$ 0.68	per pound	\$ 0.72	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	\$ 0.95	per pound	\$ 0.99	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	\$ 0.97	per pound	\$ 1.01	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 4.00	per pound	\$ 4.04	per pound	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	\$ 14.84	Gallon	\$ 15.84	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	\$ 15.36	Gallon	\$ 16.36	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 73.80	Each	\$ 74.80	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 76.30	Each	\$ 77.30	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 79.75	Each	\$ 80.75	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 79.75	Each	\$ 80.75	Each	
Exceptions: NONE					

BIDDER: Ennis-Flint, Inc.		Supply Location: Ennis, TX			
Item Description	Amount Bid PICKED-UP		Amount Bid DELIVERED		
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	No Bid	Gallon	\$ 11.50	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	No Bid	Gallon	\$ 11.60	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	\$ 72.50	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	\$ 73.00	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	\$ 78.00	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	\$ 79.15	Each	
Exceptions: NONE					

BIDDER: The Pittsburgh Paints Co.		Supply Location: Mobile, AL			
Item Description	Amount Bid PICKED-UP		Amount Bid DELIVERED		
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 1.09	per pound	\$ 1.09	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 3.41	per pound	\$ 3.41	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	\$ 1.09	per pound	\$ 1.09	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 3.41	per pound	\$ 3.41	per pound	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	No Bid	Gallon	No Bid	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	No Bid	Gallon	No Bid	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Exceptions: NONE					

BIDDER: Swarco Industries, LLC		Supply Location: Columbia, TN			
Item Description	Amount Bid PICKED-UP		Amount Bid DELIVERED		
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 0.63	per pound	\$ 0.67	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 0.93	per pound	\$ 0.96	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	\$ 0.95	per pound	\$ 0.98	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	\$ 0.63	per pound	\$ 0.67	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	\$ 0.93	per pound	\$ 0.96	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	\$ 0.95	per pound	\$ 0.98	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	No Bid	Gallon	No Bid	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	No Bid	Gallon	No Bid	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	No Bid	Each	No Bid	Each	
Exceptions: NONE / Note: Due to Supply Location it is not feasible to travel for Picked-Up.					

BIDDER: LBS Enterprises, LLC d/b/a Alistates Coatings Co.		Supply Location: Gladewater, TX			
Item Description	Amount Bid PICKED-UP		Amount Bid DELIVERED		
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in 50-90 lb Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 1</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 3</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard <u>Type 4</u> , Drop on Application, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.)	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Glass Bead: Visilok <u>Type 1</u> D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets	No Bid	per pound	No Bid	per pound	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	\$ 11.25	Gallon	\$ 12.95	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC Storage System	\$ 11.25	Gallon	\$ 12.95	Gallon	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 60.00	Each	\$ 68.00	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 60.00	Each	\$ 68.00	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 61.95	Each	\$ 70.00	Each	
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage System	\$ 54.75	Each	\$ 62.95	Each	
Exceptions: Not registered with Alabama Secretary of State, per invitation to bid, companies must be registered.					