COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-34 - BID TABULATION
Provision of Paint Striping Materials

BIDDER: Crown USA Incorporated

BIDDER: Ennis-Flint, Inc.

. Amount Bid Amount Bid . Amount Bid Amount Bid
Item Description Item Description
PICKED-UP DELIVERED PICKED-UP DELIVERED
. ication, p : ype 1, ication, ; i
GI?ss Sgheres AASHTO-Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, s 0.62 per pound s 0.65 per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTOIStandard Type 1, Drop on Application, No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application, . . Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application, X "
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets No Bid per pound No id per pound Shipped in 50-90 1b Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets No id per pound No Bid per pound
Glass Spheres: yp ication, . . Glass Spheres: ) ication, ) )
GI?ss S| heres AASHTO-Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, No Bid per pound No Bid per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTOIStandard Type 4, Drop on Application, No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Filass Bead: VIS.I|Ok Type 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped No Bid per pound No Bid per pound FSIass Bead: V|54|I0k Type 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
in 50-90 |b Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
X ication, p : ype 1, ication, ; i
GI?ss Sgheres AASHTO Standard Type 1- Drop on Application s 0.62 per pound s 0.65 per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTO Standard Type 1. Drop on Application, No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.) Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application, . . Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application, X .
No Bid er pound No Bid er pound No Bid er pound No Bid er pound
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.) perp perp Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.) perp perp
Glass Spheres: yp ication, . . Glass Spheres: , ication, ) )
GI?ss S| heres AASHTO Standard Type 4- Drop on Application No Bid per pound No Bid per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTO Standard Type 4. Drop on Application, No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.) Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)
Filass Bead: Visilok Tyge 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped No Bid per pound No Bid per pound FSIass Bead: Visilok Type 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC s 14.69 Gallon s 15.13 Gallon Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid Gallon s 13.50 Gallon
Storage System Storage System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC s 1521 Gallon s 15.65 Gallon Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid Gallon S 14.00 Gallon
Storage System Storage System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage s 73.05 Each s 74.05 Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each s 77.50 Each
System System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage s 75.55 Each s 76.55 Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid £ach S 80.00 Each
System System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage s 79.00 Each s 20.00 Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each s 85.00 Each
System System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage s 79.00 Each s 20.00 Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid £ach S 80.00 Each
System System
Exceptions: NONE Exceptions: NONE
BIDDER: PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc. BIDDER: Swarco Industries LLC
. Amount Bid Amount Bid . Amount Bid Amount Bid
Item Description Item Description
PICKED-UP DELIVERED PICKED-UP DELIVERED
p! : ype 1, ication, p : ypel, ication,
GI?ss S| heres AASHTO-Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, s 0.62 per pound s 0.62 per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTOIStandard Type 1, Drop on Application, s 0.64 per pound s 0.64 per pound
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application, Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application,

B - . 0.99 d 0.99 d - s N 1.25 d 1.25 d
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets $ perpoun $ per poun Shipped in 50-90 1b Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets $ per poun $ perpoun
Glass Spheres: Type 4, ication, pl : ype 4, ication,

GI?ss S| heres AASHTO-Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, s 105 per pound s 1.05 per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTOIStandard Type 4, Drop on Application, s 125 per pound s 125 per pound
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Filass Bead: Vis.ilok Type 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped s 325 per pound s 3.5 per pound FSIass Bead: Viﬁilok Type 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
in 50-90 |b Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: Typel, ication, pl : ype 1, ication,
GI?ss S| heres AASHTO Standard Type 1- Drop on Application s 0.62 per pound s 0.62 per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTO Standard Type 1. Drop on Application, s 0.64 per pound s 0.64 per pound
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.) Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application, Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 3, Drop on Application,

0.99 er pound 0.99 er pound 1.25 er pound 1.25 er pound
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.) $ perp $ perp Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 lbs.) $ perp $ perp
Glass Spheres: Type 4, ication, pl : ype 4, ication,
GI?ss S| heres AASHTO Standard Type 4- Drop on Application s 1.05 per pound s 1.05 per pound Glgss N r.\eres AASHTO Standard T e4. Drop on Application, s 125 per pound s 125 per pound
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.) Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)
Filass Bead: Visilok Tyge 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped s 325 per pound s 3.5 per pound FSIass Bead: Visilok Type 1 D-2 Intermix System or Equivalent, Shipped No Bid per pound No Bid per pound
in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets in Bulk Sacks on Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid Gallon No Bid Gallon Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid Gallon No Bid Gallon
Storage System Storage System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid Gallon No Bid Gallon Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid Gallon No Bid Gallon
Storage System Storage System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each
System System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each
System System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each
System System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid Each No Bid Each

System

Exceptions: NONE

System

Exceptions: NONE
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