

COMPETITIVE BID #WG20-11 Award Listing

Pavement Markers and Bituminous Adhesive

Effective January 21, 2020 through January 21, 2021

BIDDER: Ennis-Flint, Inc.			
	Amount Ordered Per Marker		
Class A	1-100	101-1000	1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
1-B Mono-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-A Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-B Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-C Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-D Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-E Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
Class A-H Abraskion Resistant Lens Surface	0-100	101-1000	1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
1-B Mono-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-A Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-B Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-C Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-D Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-E Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
Class C Temporary Markers	0-100	101-1000	1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
1-B Mono-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-A Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-B Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-C Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-D Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
2-E Bi-Directional	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00
Fire Lite Hydrant Spotter-Blue Marker Class A-H	0-100	101-1000	1001-5000
Type 2	\$1.20	\$1.10	\$1.00

BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE (E-Bond)		Amount Ordered in Gallons		
Pavement Markers Adhesive	1/2 gal	1-20 gal	21-50 gal	51-150 gal
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Temporary Markers Adhesive	1/2 gal	1-20 gal	21-50 gal	51-150 gal
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid