COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-20 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Pavement Markers and Bituminous Adhesive

M‘BFDBEH: Ennis-Flint Inc

Delivered Picked UP
Quantity per Order (Markers) Quantity per Order (Markers
fass & 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000( 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 NoBid| No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional $1.30 §1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional $1.30 51.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Class A-H Abrasion Resistant Lens Surface 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000 | 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional $1.30 51.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid | No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
ﬁass C Temporary Markers 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000| 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
ﬁ!ass A-H Fire-Lite Hydrant Spotter-Blue Marker 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000 | 1001-5000
|Type 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid No Bid
|BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE (E-Bond) uantity per Order (Gallons) Delivered uantity per Order (Gallons) Picked-u
[Pavement Marker Adhesive 1/2gal | 1-20gal | 21-50gal | 51-150gal |1/2gal] 1-20gal | 21-50gal |51-150 gal
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
| Temporary Markers Adhesive 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal | 51-150gal |1/2gal| 1-20gal | 21-50gal |51-150gal
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE
| (Per Pound)
AVEMENT
ARKER No Bid
HESIVE

REFLECTIVE FLEXIBLE ROAD TABS

[Le_r Each)

No Bid

Exceptions: None




COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-20 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Pavement Markers and Bituminous Adhesive

REFLECTIVE FLEXIBLE ROAD TABS

(Per Each)
ORARY -
REFLECTIVE
D TABS No Bid
ellow/Yellow
" X 2"

Exceptions: Variation to Bituminous Adhesive - Pavement Marker Adhesive Per Pound

1. .95 Ib. / 55 Ib. Blocks/ 36 Block per Pallet
2. Pallet - Minimum Order per Manufacturer

BIDDER:  Gulf Material Safes, LLC Delivered Picked UP
Quantity per Order (Markers) Quantity per Order {(Markers)
ﬁﬂ‘aﬁs A 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000 | 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
ass A-H Abrasion Resistant Lens Surface 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000| 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional $2.65 $2.40 $1.80 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional $2.65 $2.40 $1.80 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional §2.70 $2.45 $1.85 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional $2.70 $2.45 $1.85 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional $2.70 $2.45 $1.85 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional $2.70 52.45 $1.85 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional $2.70 $2.45 $1.85 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
‘fass € Temporary Markers 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000| 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| NoBid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Class B-H Fire-Lite Hydrant Spotter-Biue Marker 1-100 101-1000 | 1001-5000 1-100 | 101-1000| 1001-5000
IType 2 $2.70 $2.45 $1.85 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
|BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE (E-Bond) uantity per Order [Gallons) Delivered uantity per Order (Gallons) Picked-up
'avement Marker Adhesive \ 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50gal | 51-150gal | 1/2 gal| 1-20gal 21-50 gm 51-150 gal
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
rrmnpwaw Markers Adhesive 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal | 51-150gal |1/2 gal| 1-20 gal 21-50 gal [51-150 gal
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE
{Per Pound)
AVEMENT
ARKER 0.95
ADHESIVE




