COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-21 BID TABULATION
Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories

BIDDER: Floyd's Exhaust & Performance Accessories, Inc.

BIDDER: ProLogic ITS, LLC

[SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS

Amount Bid
5.5 Foot Regular Bed $600.00
6.5 Foot Regular Bed $650.00
6.5 Foot Utility Bed $800.00
ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR
Model Amount Bid
Code 3 #EW3225 $470.00 each

BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901
Model Amount Bid
B8 $488.68 each

BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902
Model Amount Bid
No Model Listed $498.52 each

RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS
Model Amount Bid
No Model Listed $422.29 each

DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PAR DF-4 TONNEAU COVER
Model Amount Bid
New Model XF4 $1,599.99 each

TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK
Model Amount Bid
UX12022-UX22029 $1,259.65 each

ROUGH COUNTRY RETRACTABLE BED COVER 46120581A

[SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS

Amount Bid
5.5 Foot Regular Bed No Bid
6.5 Foot Regular Bed No Bid
6.5 Foot Utility Bed No Bid
ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR
Model Amount Bid
N/A No Bid each

BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901
Model Amount Bid
N/A No Bid each

BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902
Model Amount Bid
N/A No Bid each

RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS
Model Amount Bid
N/A No Bid each

DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PAR DF-4 TONNEAU COVER
Model Amount Bid
N/A No Bid each

TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK
Model Amount Bid
N/A No Bid each

ROUGH COUNTRY RETRACTABLE BED COVER 46120581A

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODELS 2015 - 2021+

Model Amount Bid YEAR/Model
RAM-VB-187-SW1 Computer Mount No Bid each

RAM-VB-193-5W1 Computer Mount No Bid each

RAM-B-203-SW1 Computer Mount No Bid each

Base Mount Amount Bid

RAM-VB-187 Base Mount No Bid each

RAM-VB-193NR Base Mount No Bid each

RAM-VB-203 Base Mount No Bid each

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODEL 2015 - 2021+

Model Amount Bid YEAR/ Model
RAM-VB-195-SW1 Computer Mount No Bid each

RAM-VB-206-SW1 Computer Mount No Bid each

RAM-VB-202-ASW1 Computer Mount No Bid each

Base Mount Amount Bid Year
RAM-VB-195 Base Mount No Bid each

RAM-VB-206 Base Mount No Bid each

BROTHER POCKETJET PJ823-VK IN CAR PRINTER INCLUDING POWER CABLE PART AND USB CABLE PART
Model Amount Bid

Pockejet 823 Printer PJ823-VK No Bid each
Base Mount Amount Bid
No Bid No Bid

RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT

Model Amount Bid
No Bid No Bid
Base Mount Amount Bid
RAM-VPR-101 Vehicle Printer Base No Bid

E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE

Model Amount Bid
M260 Card Reader M210/M260 No Bid each
with USB Cable - CNB00O

Base Mount Amount Bid
RAM-234-3 RAM Tough Tray Spring Loz No Bid each

Laptop Holder - Universal Tray

Exceptions/Notes: None

Model Amount Bid Model Amount Bid
46410551A-46120581A $999.95 each N/A No Bid each
Exceptions: None Exceptions: None
BIDDER: Floyd's Exhaust & Performance Accessories, Inc. BIDDER: Prologis ITS, LLC
GROUP #2 GROUP #2

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODELS 2015 - 2020

Model Amount Bid

RAM-VB-187-SW1 Computer Mount $177.08 each
RAM-VB-193-5W1 Computer Mount $275.01 each
RAM-B-195-SW1 Computer Mount $173.74 each
Base Mount Amount Bid

RAM-VB-187 Base Mount $35.71 each
RAM-VB-193NR Base Mount $95.45 each
RAM-VB-195 Base Mount $37.87 each

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODEL 2021+

Model Amount Bid
RAM-VB-203-5W1 Computer Mount $191.97 each
RAM-VB-206-A-SW1 Computer Mount $18138 each
RAM-VB-202-A-SW1 Computer Mount $182.14 each
Base Mount Amount Bid
RAM-VB-203 Base Mount $41.82 each
RAM-VB-206 Base Mount $34.14
RAM-VB-206 Base Mount $34.14 each

BROTHER POCKETJET PJ823-VK IN CAR PRINTER INCLUDING POWER CABLE PART AND USB CABLE PART

Model Amount Bid
PJ823-VK $419.47 each
Base Mount Amount Bid

No Bid

RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT

Model Amount Bid

RAM-VPR-101 $32.10

Base Mount Amount Bid
No Bid

E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE

Model Amount Bid
M260 and USB $446.24 each
Base Mount Amount Bid

No Bid each

Exceptions/Notes: None




