
BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 1RA (BCR-2024-1RA) 

Ammons & Blackmon Construction, LLC H.O.Weaver & Sons Inc Wiregrass Construction Company, Inc 
Alternate 1-Two Roads -All Labor and Material TOTAL: 

Lay Down: 
Alternate 2 -Two Roads -All Labor and Material Except County Shall 

Indexed Asphalt Cost: 
Provide Plant Mix 

I 
I 

TOTAL: 

Bid Bond Included I 
Contract Included I 

' . ' 

NOBID 

$ 

$ 
$ 

YES 

YES 

TOTAL: $ 1,618,997.11 TOTAL: 

429,213.©0 Lay Down: NO BID Lay Down: 

885,868.80 Indexed Asphalt Cost: NO BID Indexed Asphalt Cost: 

1,315,081.80 TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL: 

I YES 

I YES 
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ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE: 

$ 1,582,532.40 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

YES 

YES 

I, FRANK LUNDY, P.E., COUNTY ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED 

-:7-' / �- f
PROJECT. 

r� � 11-12-202<-J
FRANK LUNDY, P.E. Date 

Mobile Asphalt Company, LLC 

TOTAL: $ 1,642,997.82 

Lay Down: NO BID 

Indexed Asphalt Cost: NO BID 

TOTAL: NO BID 

YES 

YES 



Alternate 1 • TWO ROADS- All Labor and Material Ammons & Blackmon Construction, LLC 

PROJECT NO, ROAD NAME ITEM NO, DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE BID PRICE 
209a-000 MAILBOX RESET, SINGLE EACH 207 $ 
406A-OOO TACK COAT GALLON 6895 $ 

408A-052 PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) SQYD 300 $ 
410H-OOO MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 

4248-648 SUPEPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER,WIDENING, 1 TON 1268 1/2 MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/8 
$ 

600A-OOO MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 384 

HW24001 COUNTY RD 1 FROM US HWY 98 TO EOM 701A-227 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE /6" WIDE) MILE 12
701A-230 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 10 
701A-244 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 4 
7010-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 6 
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 14 
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 384 
7400-000 PILOT OAR EACH 1 
B0-723P BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING· PER TON TON 100 
BC-723L BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING• PER TON TON 100 $ 
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 7547 $ 

BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 270 $ 

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE BID PRICE 
406A-OOO TACK COAT GALLON 1455 
410H-OOO MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 
600A-OOO MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 
703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 217 
701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1 H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WI Do) MILE 3 
701A-309 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 3

HW24003 US HWY 98 FROM COUNTY RD 1 TO GREENO RD 701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (6" WIDE) MILE 1 
701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 
701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 
703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 217 
7400-000 PILOT CAR EACH 1 $ 
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1726 $ 

BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 60 $ 

NOBID 

$ 

H.O.Waavar & Sons Inc 

UNIT PRICE 
228.46 

4.59 

25.70 
38 206.99 

118.33 
22 345.19 

6.70 
4 888.24 
4 688.24 
2 968.04 
1 060.44 
1 088.34 

3.35 
24 175.29 

201.00 
226.97 
113.08 

76.04 
UNIT PRICE 

4.59 
6 969.84 

14 260.58
6.70 

1 646.46 
1 646.46 

920.91 
1 060.44 
1 088.34 

3.35 
3 982.47

110.35 
82.12 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

BID PRICE 
47 291.22 $ 

31 648.06 $ 

7 710.00 $ 

38 206.99 $ 

148 859.14 $ 
22 345.19 $ 

2 572.80 $ 

66 258.88 $ 
46 882.40 $ 
11 832.16 $ 

5 302.20 
15 236.76

1 286.40 
24 175.29 
20 100.00
22 697.00 $ 

853 414.76 $ 
20,630.80 $ 

BID PRICE 
6 678.45 $ 
5 969.84 $ 

14 260.58 $ 
1 453.90 $ 

4 939.38 $ 

4 939.38 $ 
920.91 $ 

1 060.44 $ 
3 265.02 $ 

726.95 $ 
3 982.47 $ 

190 353.75 $ 
4,106.00 $ 

1,618,997.11 
1,618,997.151 

(0.04) 

Wiregrass Construction Company, Inc 

UNIT PRICE 
158.29 $ 

4.40 $ 

19.82 $ 

36 911.24 $ 

202.82 $ 

31 047.91 $ 

6.60 $ 
4 620.00 $ 

4 620.00 $ 
2 915.00 $ 

1 045.00 $ 
1 072.50 $ 

3.30 $ 
$ 

207.46 $ 

124.04 $ 
100.73 $ 
93.29 

UNIT PRICE 
4.40 

10 546.07 
17 938.58 

6.60 
1 622.50 
1 622.50 

907,50 
1 045.00 
1 072.60

3.30 

103.12 
93.29 

$ 

$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 

BIO PRICE 
32 766.03 $ 

30 338.00 $ 

6 946.00 $ 
36 911.24 $ 

255 147.66 $ 
31 047.91 $ 
2 534.40 $ 

55 440.00 $ 

46 200.00 
11 660.00 

6 225.00 
15 016.00 
1 267.20 

$ 

20 746.00 $ 

12 404.00 $ 
760 209.31 $ 

25, 188,30 $ 

BID PRICE 
6 402.00 $ 

10 646.07 $ 
17 938.58 $ 

1 432.20 $ 

4 867.50 $ 
4 867.50 $ 

907.50 $ 
1 045.00 $ 

3 217.50 $ 

716.10 $ 
$ 

177 882.00 $ 
4,664.50 $ 

1,582,532.40 

Mobllo Asphalt Company, LLC 

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE 
165.00 $ 34 155.00 

4.55 $ 31 372.25 

11.00 $ 3 300.00 
42 200.00 $ 42 200.00 

110.30 $ 138 757.40 
133 000.00 $ 133 000.00 

6.00 $ 2 304.00 
4 215.00 $ 50 580.00 
4 215,00 42 150.00 
2 660.00 10 640.00 

956.00 4 775.00 
980.00 13 720.00 

3.00 1 152.00 
6 000.00 $ 6 000.00

111.11 $ 11 111.00 
111.11 $ 11 111.00
111.11 $ 838 547.17 
66.50 $ 17,955,00 

UNIT PRICE BID PRICo 
4.55 $ 6 620.25 

6 500.00 $ 6 500.00 
25 000.00 $ 25 000.00 

6.00 $ 1 302.00 
1 480,00 4 440.00 
1 480.00 4 440.00 

830.00 830.00 
955.00 955.00
980.00 2 940.00 

3.00 651.00
1 500.00 1 500.00 

111.11 191 684.75 
66.50 $ 3,325.00 

$ 1,642,997.82 



Alternate 2 • TWO ROADS- All Labor and Material Except County provided Asphalt as noted by* 

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. OESCRIPTION UNIT 

209a•0D0 MAILBOX RESET, SINGLE EACH 

405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 

408A-052 PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) SQYD 

410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 

4248-648 
SUPEPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER.WIDENING, I 

TON 
1/2 MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/8 

600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 

703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 

HW24001 COUNTY RD 1 FROM US HWY 98 TO EOM 701A-227 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 

701A-230 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 

701A-244 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 

701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 

701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)•YELLOW MILE 

7030-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 

7400-000 PILOT CAR EACH 

BC-723P" BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 

BC-723L" BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 

BC-723" BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 

BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT 

405A-OOO TACK COAT GALLON 

410H-OOO MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 

600A-OOO MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 

703A-002 TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 

701A-301 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1 H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 

701A-309 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 
HW24003 US HWY 98 FROM COUNTY RD 1 TO GREENO RD 701A-304 BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1 H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 

701C-002 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 

701C-003 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 

703D-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 

7400-000 PILOT CAR EACH 

BC-723" BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 

BC-900 DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 

QTY 

207 s 
6895 s 

300 
iii 

1 $ 

1258 

1 

384 
12 

10 

4 

5 

14 

384 

1 

100 

100 
7547 

270 

QTY 

1455 

1 

1 

217 

3 

3 

1 

1 

3 

217 

1 
1725 

50 $ 

Ammons & Blackmon Construction, LLC 

UNIJPRICE 

30,00 

6.00 

3.00 

1,1321.00 

20.00 
6 973.00 

. 7.70 

6 335.00 
5 335.00 

3 437.60 

550.00 

680.00 

2.20 

6 605.00 
50.00 
50.00 
13.50 
20,00 

UNIT.PRICE 

6.00 

2 588,00 

3 879.10 

7.70 

1 925.00 

1 925,00 

·1 100.00 
550.00 
880.00 

2.20 

1 725.00 

13.50 

20.00 

s 

s 

$ 
s 

s 
� 

I 

$ 
� 

BID PRICE 

. 

6 210.00 

41 370.00 

900.00 
11 321,00 

25 160,00 
6 973.00 

2 956.80 

54,020.00, 
63 350.00 
13 750.00 

2 750.00 

12 320.00 
844.80 

8605.00 

5 000.00 

5 000.00 
101664.50 

5 400.00 
BID PRICE 

8730.00 

2 568.00 
3 679.10 
1 670.90 
5l75.00 

sn5.oo, 
1 100.00 

550.00 
2 640.00 

477_40 

1725.00 

23 287.50 

1 000.00 

A29 213.00 

H.O.Waaver & Sons Inc Wiregrass Construction Company, Inc Mobile Asphalt Company, LLC 

UNIT PRICE BIO PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE 810 PRICE 

UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BIO PRICE 

NOBID NDBID NOBID 


