COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-16 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Motor Grader Blades

BIDDER: Thompson Tractor Co., Inc.

Length Width Thickness Bolt Amount Bid
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" 6" width: 6' 6" 5/8" 5/8" 771633 $47.85
6' 6" 5/8" 3/4" 771637 $50.34
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4" 6" width: 6' 6" 3/4" 5/8" N/A No Bid
6' 6" 3/4" 3/4" N/A No Bid
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" 8" width: 6' 8" 5/8" 5/8" 771636 $67.57
6' 8" 5/8" 3/4" 771639 $66.88
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4" 8" width: 6' 8" 3/4" 5/8" 771634 $78.68
6' 8" 3/4" 3/4" 771638 $81.36
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" 6" width: 7' 6" 5/8" 5/8" 7T1645 $57.23
7' 6" 5/8" 3/4" 771626 $54.46
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4" 6" width: 7' 6" 3/4" 5/8" N/A No Bid
7' 6" 3/4" 3/4" N/A No Bid
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" 8" width: 7' 8" 5/8" 5/8" 771643 $78.60
7' 8" 5/8" 3/4" 771624 $77.90
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4" 8" width: 7' 8" 3/4" 5/8" 771623 $92.03
7' 8" 3/4" 3/4" 771625 $94.46
Exceptions: None
BIDDER: Valk Manufacturing Company
Length Width Thickness Amount Bid
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" 6" width: 6' 6" 5/8" $86.50
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4" 6" width: 6' 6" 3/4" $107.71
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" 8" width: 6' 8" 5/8" $129.02
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 3/4" 8" width: 6' 8" 3/4" $156.12
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" 6" width: 7' 6" 5/8" $100.92
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4" 6" width: 7' 6" 3/4" $125.66
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" 8" width: 7' 8" 5/8" $150.52
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 3/4" 8" width: 7' 8" 3/4" $182.14

Exceptions: None
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BIDDER: Wear Parts & Equipment Co., Inc.
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Exceptions:

1. Minimum order is 1 bundle of ten blades for a single shipment delivered to a single destination;
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no split orders or mixed bundles.

2. Small orders ship via box truck with liftgate service. Orders of $6500+ will ship via flatbed.

3. Large orders of $6500+ must ship to a single shop but may be of mixed blade types.

4. Small orders are generally in stock and ship 1-2 days ARO. Large orders of back orders will be on
factory lead times. All lead times subject to change.
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Amount Bid

$100.59

$116.17

$130.37

$155.44

$112.71

$130.87

$149.13

$181.58

5. Pricing is valid for six months from bid opening date. New quote required at that time. If we

can hold prices firm for another six months, we will do so.

*Note: Per bid specifications prices must be firm for twelve months.




	Sheet1

