
COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-29 BID TABULATION 
Provision of Emulsified Asphalt (Bituminous Materials) 

BIDDER: Hunt Refining Company BIDDER: Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc. 
FOB FOB FOB FOB 

CSS-1 600 No Bid No Bid CSS-1 600 No Bid No Bid 
CSS-1H 600 No Bid No Bid CSS-1H 600 No Bid No Bid 
CRS-2 600  $ 2.11  $ 2.55 CRS-2 600 No Bid No Bid 
CRS-2H 600  $ 2.25  $ 2.69 CRS-2H 600 No Bid No Bid 
CQS-1H 600 No Bid No Bid CQS-1H 600 No Bid No Bid 
AE-P 600 No Bid No Bid AE-P 600 No Bid No Bid 
MC-70 600 No Bid No Bid MC-70 600 No Bid No Bid 
CRS-1H 600  $ 2.11  $ 2.55 CRS-1H 600 No Bid No Bid 
CRS-1H (Drop Tank) 5,000 No Bid  $ 2.70 CRS-1H (Drop Tank) 5,000 No Bid No Bid 

NTSS-1HM 3,000  $ 3.25  $ 3.40 NTSS-1HM 3,000  $            4.00  $             4.80 

NTSS-1HM (Drop Tank) 5,000 No Bid  $ 3.65 NTSS-1HM (Drop Tank) 5,000  $            4.00  $             4.80 

Estimated Quantity FOB FOB Estimated Quantity FOB FOB 
 (5 Gallon Buckets) Picked up by Delivered to  (5 Gallon Buckets) Picked up by Delivered to 

Baldwin County Baldwin County Baldwin County Baldwin County 
(Price per 5 Gallon Bucket) (Price per 5 Gallon Bucket) (Price per 5 Gallon Bucket) (Price per 5 Gallon Bucket) 

CSS-1H: 5 Gallon Bucket Minimum of 16 
buckets per order No Bid No Bid CSS-1H: 5 Gallon Bucket Minimum of 16 

buckets per order  $          80.00  $          95.00 

Supply Location: 1855 Fairlawn Road, Tuscaloosa, AL 35401 (All Products except NTSS-1HM) Supply Location: 10480 Reichold Road, Gulfport, MS 39503 
835 Cochrane Causeway, Mobile AL 36602 (NTSS-1HM) 

Exception(s): None Exception(s): SS-1H Buckets vs. CSS-1H Buckets 
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