
COMPETITIVE BID #WG24-30 - AWARD LISTING
Dumpster/Garbage Collection and Disposal Services 
Effective:  June 18, 2024 - June 18, 2026

BIDDER: BCC Waste Solutions, LLC

QUANTITY SIZE
FREQUENCY 
PER WEEK

UNIT PRICE 
PER WEEK

TOTAL PRICE 
PER WEEK

1 Baldwin Co. Courthouse 8-yd 3 $21.12 $63.36
1 Building Maintenance 4-yd 1 $10.56 $10.56
1 Sheriff's Barn 4-yd 1 $10.56 $10.56
1 Legislative Office 2-yd 1 $5.28 $5.28
1 Adminstration Building 6-yd 2 $15.84 $31.68
1 Annex V, Revenue Building 8-yd 2 $21.12 $42.24
1 Archives Building 4-yd 1 $10.56 $10.56
1 Annex VI Building 8-yd 2 $21.12 $42.24
1 Emergency Management Agency 4-yd 1 $10.56 $10.56
1 Central Annex Building 8-yd 2 $21.12 $42.24
1 Cliff's Landing 8-yd 1 $21.12 $21.12
1 Live Oak Landing 8-yd 1 $21.12 $21.12
1 Coroner Office 2-yd 1 $5.28 $5.28
1 Highway Department 8-yd 1 $21.12 $21.12
1 ICW Boat Launch 8-yd 1 $21.12 $21.12
1 Area 200 Highway Barn 8-yd 2 $21.12 $42.24
1 Baldwin Co. Sheriff’s Office Admin 6-yd 1 $15.84 $15.84
1 Baldwin Co. Revenue Comm – Appraisal Dept. 2-yd 1 $5.28 $5.28
1 Juvenile Detention Center 8-yd 1 $21.12 $21.12
1 Baldwin County Sheriff’s Facility 4-yd 1 $10.56 $10.56

WEEKLY GRAND TOTAL $454.08
X 52 weeks

ANNUAL GRAND TOTAL 23,612.16$   

2-yd container 5.28$       
4-yd container 10.56$     
6-yd container 15.84$     
8-yd container 21.12$     
39-yd Compactor No Bid

Size 1/Week 2/Week 3/Week 4/Week 5/Week
2-yd $5.28 $10.56 $15.84 $21.12 $26.40
4-yd $10.56 $21.12 $31.68 $42.24 $52.80
6-yd $15.84 $31.68 $47.52 $63.36 $79.20
8-yd $21.12 $42.24 $63.36 $84.48 $105.60

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Bond: Yes
Exceptions: No bid submitted on Compactor 39-yd.

BCC Waste Solutions, LLC
13040 Underwood Road
Summerdale, AL  36580
ATTN:  Josh Maharrey
(251) 923-6070
josh@bccwastesolutions.com

LOCATION

UNIT PRICING FOR POSSIBLE FUTURE PLACEMENTS

CHARGES FOR EXTRA DUMPS (AMOUNTS BID ARE PER DUMP)

Compactor 
39-yd 
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