
COMPETITIVE BID #WG25-21 Bid Tabulation
Provision of Pavement Markers and Bituminous Adhesive

BIDDER:   Ennis-Flint, Inc. Delivered Picked UP
PAVEMENT MARKERS
Class A 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class A-H Abrasion Resistant Lens Surface 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional $1.30 $1.20 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class C Temporary Markers 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class A-H Fire-Lite Hydrant Spotter-Blue Marker 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
Type 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE 
Pavement Marker Adhesive 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Temporary Markers Adhesive 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE
Pavement Marker Adhesive

REFLECTIVE FLEXIBLE ROAD TABS

Exceptions: None

Quantity per Order (Markers)

Quantity per Order (Gallons) Delivered

Quantity per Order (Markers)

Quantity per Order (Gallons) Picked-up

(Per Pound) Delivered (Per Pound) Picked-up

TEMPORARY REFLECTIVE ROAD TABS (Yellow/Yellow 4" 
x 2")

No Bid No Bid

(Per Each) Delivered (Per Each) Picked-up

No Bid No Bid



COMPETITIVE BID #WG25-21 Bid Tabulation
Provision of Pavement Markers and Bituminous Adhesive

BIDDER:   
Safety Zone Holdings, Inc. dba 

Safety Zone Specialists Delivered Picked UP
PAVEMENT MARKERS
Class A 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class A-H Abrasion Resistant Lens Surface 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional $2.25 $2.25 $2.25 Apex 921 AR 1-C No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional $2.25 $2.25 $2.25 Apex 921 AR 1-A No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional $2.35 $2.35 $2.35 Apex 921 AR 2-A No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional $2.65 $2.65 $2.65 Apex 921 AR A-C No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional $2.35 $2.35 $2.35 Apex 921 AR R-C No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional $2.35 $2.35 $2.35 Apex 921 AR 2-A No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class C Temporary Markers 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
1-A Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-B Mono-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-A Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-B Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-C Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-D Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-E Bi-Directional No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class A-H Fire-Lite Hydrant Spotter-Blue Marker 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000 1-100 101-1000 1001-5000
Type 2 $2.80 $2.80 $2.80 Apex 921 2-Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid

BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE 
Pavement Marker Adhesive 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Temporary Markers Adhesive 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal 1/2 gal 1-20 gal 21-50 gal 51-150 gal

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BITUMINOUS ADHESIVE
Pavement Marker Adhesive

REFLECTIVE FLEXIBLE ROAD TABS

Exceptions: Listed Apex Models.

Quantity per Order (Markers) Quantity per Order (Markers)

Quantity per Order (Gallons) Delivered Quantity per Order (Gallons) Picked-up

(Per Pound) Delivered (Per Pound) Picked-up
No Bid No Bid

(Per Each) Delivered (Per Each) Picked-up
TEMPORARY REFLECTIVE ROAD TABS (Yellow/Yellow 4" 
x 2") $0.75 Apex CS 2-Y No Bid
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