
COMPETITIVE BID #WG25-15 Award Listing
Provision of Roadway Pipe - Concrete - Circular & Arch
Effective:  March 22, 2025 - March 22, 2026

Alabama Pipe & Supply
Delivered/Picked Up

Amount
15" RCP C-3 $23.19

15" BEVELED END SECTION $644.05
18" RCP C-3 $25.94

18" BEVELED END SECTION $680.31
21" RCP C-3 No Bid
24" RCP C-3 $38.11

24" BEVELED END SECTION $859.47
27" RCP C-3 No Bid
30" RCP  C-3 $56.94

30" BEVELED END SECTION No Bid
36" RCP C-3 $74.01

36" BEVELED END SECTION No Bid
42" RCP C-3 $104.27
48" RCP C-3 $137.26
54" RCP C-3 $152.61
60" RCP C-3 $183.22
66" RCP C-3 No Bid
72" RCP C-3 $220.19
84" RCP C-3 No Bid
96" RCP C-3 $510.00

18"x11" RCP C-3 ARCH $42.25
18"X11" BEVELED END SECTION $726.00

22"X13" RCP C-3 ARCH $43.54
22"X13 BEVELED END SECTION $794.00

29"X18" RCP C-3 ARCH $62.80
29"x18" BEVELED END SECTION $826.00

36"x23" RCP C-3 ARCH $89.06
36"X23" BEVELED END SECTION No Bid

44"x27" RCP C-3 ARCH $115.24
44"X27" BEVELED END SECTION No Bid

51"x31" RCP C-3 ARCH $148.00
58" X 36" RCP C-3 ARCH $192.10
65" X40" RCP C-3 ARCH $210.00
73"X45" RCP C-3 ARCH $285.00
88"X54" RCP C-3 ARCH $375.00

EXTRA GASKET MATERIAL BY THE BOX
1" X 42" STRIPS OF $151.00

MASTIC/GASKET MATERIAL
IN BOX EQUALING 88"

1 1/2" X 42" STRIPS OF $495.00
MASTIC/GASKET MATERIAL

IN BOX EQUALING 88'

2" X 42" STRIPS OF No Bid
MASTIC/GASKET MATERIAL

IN BOX EQUALING 88'

One Box of 75 Popits $131.25

Supply Location: 
Alabama Pipe & Supply - 5721 Hwy 90 W, Theodore, AL 36582
ATTN:  Rodney Breland
rodney@alabamapipe.com
(251) 656-6666 Phone
(251) 653-1279 Fax

Description 



Competitive Bid # WG25-15 Award Listing
Provision of Roadway Pipe - High Density Polyethylene Corrugated Pipe
Effective:  March 22, 2025 - March 22, 2026

Fortiline Waterworks
Delivered/Picked Up

Amount
4" $1.77
6" $3.45
8" $6.09

10" $7.41
12" $7.53
15" $9.74
18" $12.92
24" $20.86
30" $31.16
36" $41.66
42" $53.98
48" $67.66

Supply Location:  Fortiline Waterworks - 104 investment Lane, Summerdale, AL 36530
ATTN:  Scott McGowan
scott.mcgowan@fortiline.com
(251) 945-1177 Phone

Diameter



Competitive Bid # WG25-15 Award Listing
Provision of Roadway Pipe - High Performance Polypropylene Pipe 
Effective:  March 22, 2025 - March 22, 2026

Fortiline Waterworks
Delivered/Picked Up

Amount
12" $12.09
15" $14.19
18" $18.08
24" $30.47
30" $55.12
36" $58.87
42" $77.38
48" $105.46
60" $167.37

Supply Location:  Fortiline Waterworks - 104 Investment Lane, Summerdale, AL 36530
ATTN:  Scott McGowan
scott.mcgowan@fortiliine.com
(251) 945-1177 Phone

Diameter
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