You may use your own form provided all information requested below, including
the "I certify... " statement, and signatures, are on your form. Do not use
colored print or shaded cells.

CERTIFIED TABULATION OF BIDS

Project: Courthouse Covered Entry for Baldwin County
Commission PH&J #2302GV

As tabulated below, bids were received:

DCM Project No.:
PSCA Project No. (if applicable):
Amount of Available Funds:

DCM Form B-6
Revised August 2021

Date: Monday September 23, 2024 Time: 2:00 PM
Place: 257 Hand Ave. Annex III Purchasing Conference Rm., Bay Minette, AL
Tindle Constructi Wavarly Joy Gordon Construction Gulf South Rogers & Willard
Contractor Stuart Construction | JNB Services ! o Hetion; Construction of Y RIOLGON SO, c Bl 0g R
LLC LLC Contracting, LL.C Inc.
Alabama, LLC
Sty No Bid No Bid The Ohio (\‘asua]ly No Bid The Gray ?asuafty & Surety No Bid Hartford Fire
Insurance Company Company Insurance
All Addenda Acknowledged Yes Yes Yes
Acknowledge Allowances Included in
. Yes Yes Yes
Base Bid
Base Bid on Proposal $2,615.,600.00 $1,946.552.00 $2.533,600.00
Alternate 1; Interior Work $184,400.00 $402,808.00 $392,500.00
Add/Deduct on Envelope $0.00 $75,000.00 $0.00
Total Base Bid + Alternate 1 $ -l 3 $ 2,800,000.00] $ $ 2,424.360.00 % - % 2,926,100.00

No discrepancies

1. Add on envelope not initialed.
2. Changes made on Proposal
Form not initialed.

3. Alternate #1 on Proposal Form
and Sales Tax Form not marked as

No discrepancics

Remarks q Add or Deduct (calculating as an tod
ape Add due to scope of work HOLE!
involved).
4. Contractors license expired
8/31/2024 and has not been
renewed as of the date if this bid.
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