
Effective:  March 18, 2025 - March 18, 2026

PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY
Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only

CRUSHED GRAVEL
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 56.00 74.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE 
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #4 No Bid No Bid 56.00 68.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 50.00 No Bid
ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 56.00 74.15 56.00 68.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 50.00 No Bid
ALDOT #67 No Bid No Bid 56.00 74.15 56.00 68.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid
ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 58.00 70.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #89 No Bid No Bid 59.00 77.15 58.00 70.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #8910 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.25 66.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 No Bid
ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION
ALDOT CLASS 1 63.00 83.05 No Bid No Bid 72.00 84.00 No Bid No Bid 36.00 58.00 58.00 No Bid No Bid 57.00 No Bid No Bid 95.00 No Bid 62.00 No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 2 63.00 83.05 No Bid No Bid 72.00 84.00 No Bid No Bid 36.00 58.00 58.00 No Bid No Bid 57.00 No Bid No Bid 95.00 No Bid 62.00 No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.00 No Bid

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE 63.00 83.05 No Bid No Bid 72.00 84.00 No Bid No Bid 30.00 53.00 53.00 No Bid No Bid 51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.

2" X 0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 2" COBBLES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE
825-A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00 66.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 No Bid
825-B No Bid No Bid 50.00 58.15 54.00 66.00 No Bid No Bid 23.00 45.00 45.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 No Bid

3/4" Base
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE

2" MINUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00 40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WHITE SAND - WASHED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1767 Africatown Bridge Orange Beach, AL

1944 Bay Bridge Cutoff Road 50 Sawmill Road

Low Bid Price is highlighted in YELLOW
Secondary Bid is highlighted in RED
Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the Prime Bidder.

Slats Lucas Aggregates - 
22601 Canal Road

Couch Aggregates Slats Lucas AggregatesStephens Trucking

22801 Canal Road

Orancge Beach, ALOrange Beach, AL

Supply Locations Supply Locations
Couch - Orange Beach, AL

Sylacauga, AL Titus, AL

Southern Red Rock - Sylacauga, AL
Supply Locations Supply Locations

Bay Bridge, Mobile Blakeley, Mobile Saraland, AL Theodore, AL

Supply Locations

O'Neal - Saraland

Pride - Mobile, AL (Blakeley) Maylene - Saraland
50 Sawmill Road

Crushed Aggregates Bid WG25-10  Area 100  Award Listing  
Vulcan Materials Company, Inc. Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. C.R. Pate Logging, Inc.

Pride/Calera- Mobile, AL (Bay Bridge) Loxley Terminal - Loxley AL

Evergreen, AL

13909 Darby Lane

Loxley, AL

Supply Locations
Brooklyn Limestone - Evergreen, AL

1980 Oil Well Road



Effective:  March 18, 2025 - March 18, 2026

PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY
Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only

CRUSHED GRAVEL
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 56.00 68.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE 
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 56.00 70.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 57.10 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 50.00 No Bid
ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 56.00 68.10 56.00 70.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 57.10 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 50.00 No Bid
ALDOT #67 No Bid No Bid 56.00 68.10 56.00 70.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 57.10 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 50.00 No Bid
ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 58.00 72.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #89 No Bid No Bid 59.00 71.10 58.00 72.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #8910 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.25 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.10 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 No Bid
ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION
ALDOT CLASS 1 63.00 77.25 No Bid No Bid 72.00 86.75 No Bid No Bid 36.00 64.00 58.00 No Bid No Bid 60.10 No Bid No Bid 95.00 No Bid 62.00 No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 2 63.00 77.25 No Bid No Bid 72.00 86.75 No Bid No Bid 36.00 64.00 58.00 No Bid No Bid 60.10 No Bid No Bid 95.00 No Bid 62.00 No Bid
ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.00 No Bid

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE 63.00 77.25 No Bid No Bid 72.00 86.75 No Bid No Bid 30.00 53.00 53.00 No Bid No Bid 54.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.

2" X 0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 2" COBBLES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE
825-A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00 68.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.10 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 No Bid
825-B No Bid No Bid 50.00 62.10 54.00 68.75 No Bid No Bid 23.00 52.00 45.00 No Bid No Bid 54.10 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 No Bid

3/4" Base
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE

2" MINUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00 44.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WHITE SAND - WASHED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1767 Africatown Bridge Orange Beach, AL

1944 Bay Bridge Cutoff Road 50 Sawmill Road

Low Bid Price is highlighted in YELLOW
Secondary Bid is highlighted in RED
Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the Prime Bidder.

Pride - Mobile, AL (Blakeley) Maylene - Saraland
Supply Locations Supply Locations Supply LocationsSupply Locations Supply Locations

Bay Bridge, Mobile Blakeley, Mobile Saraland, AL

Crushed Aggregates Bid WG25-10  Area 200  Award Listing
Vulcan Materials Company, Inc. Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Theodore, AL Evergreen, AL

C.R. Pate Logging, Inc. Stephens Trucking Couch Aggregates Slats Lucas Aggregates

Orancge Beach, ALLoxley, AL Orange Beach, ALSylacauga, AL Titus, AL

Supply Locations
Brooklyn Limestone - Evergreen, AL Southern Red Rock - Sylacauga, AL Couch - Orange Beach, AL Slats Lucas Aggregates - 

22601 Canal Road

Pride/Calera- Mobile, AL (Bay Bridge) Loxley Terminal - Loxley AL 22801 Canal Road
13909 Darby Lane

1980 Oil Well Road
O'Neal - Saraland

50 Sawmill Road



Effective:  March 18, 2025 - March 18, 2026

PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY PICK-UP DELIVERY
Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only

CRUSHED GRAVEL
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 56.00 74.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE 
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #4 No Bid No Bid 56.00 74.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 59.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 50.00 60.00
ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 56.00 74.95 56.00 74.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 59.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 50.00 60.00
ALDOT #67 No Bid No Bid 56.00 74.95 56.00 74.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 59.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00 60.00
ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 58.00 76.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ALDOT #89 No Bid No Bid 59.00 77.95 58.00 76.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #8910 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.25 72.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 58.00
ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION
ALDOT CLASS 1 63.00 84.50 No Bid No Bid 72.00 90.50 No Bid No Bid 36.00 65.00 58.00 No Bid No Bid 62.00 No Bid No Bid 95.00 No Bid 62.00 74.00
ALDOT CLASS 2 63.00 84.50 No Bid No Bid 72.00 90.50 No Bid No Bid 36.00 65.00 58.00 No Bid No Bid 62.00 No Bid No Bid 95.00 No Bid 62.00 74.00
ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.00 74.00

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE 63.00 84.50 No Bid No Bid 72.00 90.50 No Bid No Bid 30.00 60.00 30.00 No Bid No Bid 56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.

2" X 0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 2" COBBLES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE
825-A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00 72.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 56.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 58.00
825-B No Bid No Bid 50.00 68.95 54.00 72.50 No Bid No Bid 23.00 52.00 45.00 No Bid No Bid 56.00 No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 48.00 58.00

3/4" Base
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE

2" MINUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.00 48.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WHITE SAND - WASHED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1767 Africatown Bridge Orange Beach, AL

1944 Bay Bridge Cutoff Road 50 Sawmill Road

Low Bid Price is highlighted in YELLOW
Secondary Bid is highlighted in RED
Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the Prime Bidder.

O'Neal - SaralandPride/Calera- Mobile, AL (Bay Bridge)

50 Sawmill Road
Couch - Orange Beach, ALPride - Mobile, AL (Blakeley) Maylene - Saraland

Supply Locations Supply Locations

Bay Bridge, Mobile Blakeley, Mobile Saraland, AL

Crushed Aggregates Bid WG25-10  Area 300  Award Listing
Vulcan Materials Company, Inc. Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Theodore, AL Evergreen, AL

C.R. Pate Logging, Inc. Couch Aggregates Slats Lucas Aggregates

Orancge Beach, AL

Supply Locations Supply Locations Supply Locations Supply Locations

Titus, ALLoxley, AL Orange Beach, ALSylacauga, AL

Stephens Trucking

Slats Lucas Aggregates - 

Loxley Terminal - Loxley AL

1980 Oil Well Road

13909 Darby Lane

22601 Canal Road

22801 Canal Road

Brooklyn Limestone - Evergreen, AL Southern Red Rock - Sylacauga, AL


	Area 100
	Area 200
	Area 300 

