
COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-25 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials
Award Listing - Solid Sod Prime =

Effective:  April 8, 2026 - April 8, 2027 Secondary =

BIDDER: Cleverdon Farms, Inc. BIDDER: D Volovecky Farms, LLC

Sod Type Cuts
Price Bid per 
Square Yard 

Delivered

Price Bid per 
Square Yard                  

Picked-up
Sod Type Cuts

Price Bid per 
Square Yard 

Delivered

Price Bid per 
Square Yard                  

Picked-up

Centipede Block $2.40 $1.90 Centipede Block $1.70/*$1.65 $1.65/*1.60
Centipede Mini Rolls $2.40 $1.90 Centipede Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Centipede 30" Rolls (42") $2.40 $1.90 Centipede 30" Rolls (42") $1.65/*1.60 $1.60/*$1.55
Bermuda/Tifton Block $2.75 $2.25 Bermuda/Tifton Block No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls $2.75 $2.25 Bermuda/Tifton Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls (42") $2.75 $2.25 Bermuda/Tifton 30" Rolls (42") No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid Celebrations Bermuda Block No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid Celebrations Bermuda Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid Celebrations Bermuda 30" Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Block $3.70 $3.20 St. Augustine Block No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid St. Augustine Mini Rolls No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine 30" Rolls (42") $3.70 $3.20 St. Augustine 30" Rolls (42") No Bid No Bid

Pick-up Location: Foley, Summerdale, Bon Secour Pick-up Location: Within 2 miles of 10139 Volovecky Drive, Daphne, AL 36526
Exceptions: Magnum Big Roll Sod Harvester Only cuts 42" wide rolls Exceptions: Big Roll Harvester Only cuts 42" rolls 33.33 Square Yards per roll.
33.33 Square Yards per roll. *Cost Using 25% Recycled Materials

Cleverdon Farms, Inc. D Volovecky Farms, LLC
15250 George Younce Road 26949 Rigsby Road
Foley, AL  36535 Daphne, AL  36526
ATTN:  Donald R. Grantham ATTN:  Daniel Volovecky
donald@cleverdonfarms.com voloveckydaniel@gmail.com
(251) 943-1170 (251) 518-6151



COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-25 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials
Award Listing - Grass Seeds
Effective:  April 8, 2026 - April 8, 2027

BIDDER: Baldwin Feed and Seed LLC

Seed Type Price Bid per Pound 
Delivered  AREA 100

Price Bid per Pound 
Picked-Up AREA 100

Price Bid per Pound 
Delivered AREA 200

Price Bid per Pound 
Picked-Up AREA 200

Price Bid per Pound 
Delivered AREA 300

Price Bid per Pound 
Picked-Up AREA 300

Annual Ryegrass 1.30 0.95 1.30 0.95 1.30 0.95
Tall Fescue 1.89 1.54 1.89 1.54 1.89 1.54
Crimson Clover 1.60 1.25 1.60 1.25 1.60 1.25
Brown Top Millet 1.17 0.82 1.17 0.82 1.17 0.82
Unhulled Bermuda Grass 8.95 8.60 8.95 8.60 8.95 8.60
Hulled Bermuda Grass 11.45 11.10 11.45 11.10 11.45 11.10
Pensacola Bahia Grass 4.60 4.25 4.60 4.25 4.60 4.25
Centipede 23.45 23.10 23.45 23.10 23.45 23.10
Kentucky 31 Fescue 1.85 1.50 1.85 1.50 1.85 1.50
Weeping Lovegrass 7.80 7.45 7.80 7.45 7.80 7.45
Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 2.80 2.45 2.80 2.45 2.80 2.45
PreMix Summer Seed Blend 3.00 2.65 3.00 2.65 3.00 2.65
     Crimson Clover 4.75%, Brown Top Millet 19%, Hulled Bermuda Grass 5%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 16%, 
     Kentucky 31 Fescue 48%, Annual Lespedeza (Kobe) 2%
PreMix Winter Seed Blend 2.90 2.55 2.90 2.55 2.90 2.55
     Crimson Clover 9%, Gulf Rye 13%, Unhulled Bermuda Grass 9%, Pensacola Bahia Grass 9%, Kentucky 31 Fescue 50%

Pick-up Location: 108 West Railroad St., Bay Minette, AL 36507

Baldwin Feed and Seed, LLC
108 W Railroad Street
Bay Minette, AL  36507
ATTN:  Dee Propst
baldwinfeed@bellsouth.net
(251) 937-9166
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-25 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials
Award Listing - Fertilizer
Effective:  April 8, 2026 - April 8, 2027

BIDDER: Evans & Company, Inc.

Fertilizer Type
Price Bid per 

Pound          
Delivered

Price Bid per 
Pound                       

Picked-up
13-13-13 0.50 0.50
10-10-10 No Bid No Bid
8-8-8 0.50 0.50
Agricultural Lime (Bag) 0.25 0.25

Agricultural Lime (Bulk) - Price per Ton No Bid No Bid

Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile
Exceptions: None

Evans & Company, Inc.
7930 Zeigler Blvd.
Mobile, AL  36608
ATTN:  Pamela Brunson
pam@evansandcompanyinc.com
(251) 633-6008



COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-25 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials
Award Listing - Silt Fence
Effective:  April 8, 2026 - April 8, 2027

BIDDERS: 

Description Product Bid
Price Bid           
Delivered

Price Bid               
Picked-up

Unit of Measure

Type "A" Silt Fence Kit Mirafi 140NL 1.24 1.24 Per Linear Foot
Type "B" Silt Fence Kit SF 90 0.29 0.29 Per Linear Foot
6' C-Flex T Fencing Tenax 1.33 1.33 Per Linear Foot
8' C-Flex T Fencing Tenax 1.42 1.42 Per Linear Foot
Wattles (12 in.) Straw  2.00 2.00 Per Linear Foot
Wattles (20 in.) Straw  2.65 2.65 Per Linear Foot
Sediment Logs (12 in.) Curlex 3.05 3.05 Per Linear Foot
Sediment Logs (20 in.) Curlex 4.05 4.05 Per Linear Foot
Type S3 RECPs - 3 Month A.E.C. S/N Straw 0.35 0.35 Per Square Yard
Type S3 RECPs - 12 Month A.E.C. S/N Straw 0.35 0.35 Per Square Yard
Type S2 RECPs - 12 Month A.E.C. D/N Straw 0.49 0.49 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - 24 Month Curlex II 0.79 0.79 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - 36 Month Curlex III 0.99 0.99 Per Square Yard
Type S1 RECPs - Perm TRM V 2.35 2.35 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 12 Month D/N Straw 0.49 0.49 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 24 Month 70/30 Straw/Coco. 0.69 0.69 Per Square Yard
Type C2 RECPs - 36 Month Coconut 1.05 1.05 Per Square Yard
Type C6 RECPs - Perm TRM V 2.35 2.35 Per Square Yard
Type C10 RECPs - Perm TRM V 2.35 2.35 Per Square Yard

Sod Staples
11 Gauge Galvanized 
Steel- 1,000/box

65.00 65.00
Per Box

Nonwoven Geotextile 4.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) Mirafi 140 0.89 0.89 Per Square Yard
Nonwoven Geotextile 8.0 ox/sy (Filter fabric) Mirafi 180 1.39 1.39 Per Square Yard
Woven Geotextile (Filter fabric) Mirafi 500X 0.76 0.76 Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 1 Mirafi 2XT 2.15 2.15 Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 2 Mirafi 5XT 2.20 2.20 Per Square Yard
Soil Slope Reinforcement Type 3 Mirafi 7XT 2.75 2.75 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 1 "Geogrid" BX1100 or equal 1.70 1.70 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 2 "Geogrid" BX1200 or equal 2.10 2.10 Per Square Yard
Soft Soil Reinforcements Type 3 "Geogrid" BX1500 or equal 4.30 4.30 Per Square Yard

Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile
Exceptions: None

Evans & Company, Inc.
7930 Zeigler Blvd.
Mobile, AL  36608
ATTN:  Pamela Brunson
pam@evansandcompanyinc.com
(251) 633-6008

Evans & Company, Inc.



COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-25 - Provision of Erosion Control Materials
Award Listing - Standard Flexamats - Tied Concrete Block Mats
Effective:  April 8, 2026 - April 8, 2027

BIDDERS: Evans & Company, Inc.

Dimensions (L x W)
Price Bid per Square Foot 

Delivered
Price Bid per Square Foot  

Picked-up
8' x 30' 4.95 4.95
8' x 40' 4.95 4.95
8' x 50' 4.95 4.95
12' x 30' 4.95 4.95
12' x 40' 4.95 4.95
12' x 50' 4.95 4.95
16' x 30' 4.95 4.95
16' x 40' 4.95 4.95
16' x 50' 4.95 4.95

Anchors (price per unit) 4.50 4.50

Pick-up Location: 7930 Zeigler Blvd, Mobile
Exceptions: Evans & Company, Inc. pricing does not include 
freight charges, Freight Cost is $2,100.00 per truck load. 

Evans & Company, Inc.
7930 Zeigler Blvd.
Mobile, AL  36608
ATTN:  Pamela Brunson
pam@evansandcompanyinc.com
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