HW24096

LILLIAN RECREATION CENTER
BID TABULATION
BALDWIN COUNTY

ALDOT ———— UNIT PLAN R.H. Deas Building Co., LLC Harris Contracting Services James Bros. Excavating, Inc. i
ITEN ND. ary pl:;lcl;-; TOTAL AMOUNT PLI;TC”I-E TOTAL AMOUNT PL‘;,;JCI:L TOTAL AMOUNT
205A—001 REMOVAL OF STRUCTURES (INCL SLAB) EA 1 $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00] $ 10,000.00| $ 10,000.00 | $ 2,000.00| $ 2,000.00| &
210A—000 | UNCLASSIFIED EXCAVATION cYy 230 $ 15.00 | $ 3,450.00] $ 25.00 | § 5,750.00 | $ 25.00( $ 5,750.00
210D—001 BORROW EXCAVATION (LOOSE TRUCKBED MEASUREMENT) Cy 300 $ 1750 | $ 5,250.00] $ 50.00 | § 15,000.00 | $ 30.00| § 9,000.00 §
230B—000 | ROADBED PROCESSING FOR PARKING AREA EA 1 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00] $ 5,000.00 | § 5,000.00 | § 1,500.00( $ 1,500.00 |
301A—012 CRUSHEDAGGREGATEBASE COURSE, TYPEB, PLANTMIXED, 6" COMPACTED THICKNESS SY 250 $ 3425| § 8,562.50] $ 130.00 | $ 32,500.00 | § 35.00( § 8,750.00
301A—016 | CRUSHED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE, TYPE B, PLANT MIXED, 7" COMPACTED THICKNESS Sy 40 $ 4775 | $ 1,910.00] $ 140.00 | $ 5,600.00 | § 53.00| § 2,120.00
450A—013 | PLAIN CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT, 6 INCHES THICK Sy 320 $ 9500 § 30,400.00 $ 70.00 | $ 22,400.00 | $ 90.00| $ 28,800.00 {
600A—000 | MOBILIZATION LS 1 $ 21,500.00 | $ 21,500.00) $ 25,000.00 $ 25,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 $ 16,000.00
641A—564 | 1 INCH P.V.C WATER SERVICE LINE LAID LF 20 $ 550 | $ 110.00| $§ 100.00| $ 2,000.00 | $ 65.00( 1,300.00
641A—568 2INCH P.V.C WATER SERVICE LINE LAID LF 315 $ 750 $ 2,362.50] $ 25.00| $ 7,875.00| $ 82.00| § 25,830.00
641J—510 2 INCH GATE VALVE WITH BOX EA 3 $ 50.00 | $ 150.00| $ 2,000.00| $ 6,000.00 | $ 3,378.00| $ 10,134.00 | §
6410—520 2 INCH WATER METER AND BOX SET EA 1 $ 35000 | § 350.00] $ 5,000.00( $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,875.00| $ 6,875.00
650A—000 | TOPSOIL CcY 100 $ 4975 | § 4,975.00 $ 30.00( $ 3,000.00 | § 35.00| § 3,500.00
652A—100 SEEDING AC 1 $ 1,250.00 | § 1,250.00] $ 1,500.00] $ 1,500.00 | $ 775.00| $ 775.00
654A—001 SOLID SODDING (BERMUDA) Sy 300 $ 6.75| $ 2,025.00f $ 15.00 | $ 4,500.00 NO BID NO BID
663C—000 | TREE PROTECTION FENCING LF 300 $ 10.00 | $ 3,000.00f $ 7.00($% 2,100.00 | $ 4.00( 1,200.00
665J—002 SILT FENCE LF 400 $ 6.00| $ 2,400.00f $ 6.00( $ 2,400.00 | $ 550| $ 2,200.00
6650—001 SILT FENCE REMOVAL LF 400 $ 250 | § 1,000.00] $ 1.00] § 400.00 | $ 250| $ 1,000.00
6659—002 WATTLE LF 100 $ 10.00 [ $ 1,000.00{ $ 20.00 | $ 2,000.00 | § 1400 | $ 1,400.00
701G—249 SOLID WHITE, CLASS 2, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE LF 100 $ 750 § 750.00] 10.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 8.00| % 800.00
791D—000 [ OUTDOOR SHELTERS EA 1 $ 61,000.00 | $ 61,000.00] $ 170,000.00 | § 170,000.00 | $ 120,430.00 | $ 120,430.00
1000—SIGN| SIGNS LS 1 $ 650.00 [ $ 650.00| $ 2,000.00 | § 2,000.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,500.00 |
1000A—HB [ HOSE BIBS (WOODFORD R34 YARD HYDRANT OR ALTERNATE EQUAL) EA 2 $ 75.00 | $ 150.00] $ 300.00 | § 600.00 | $ 1,262.50 | $ 2,525.00
1000A—SB STRIPING (BLUE) ADA PARKING LS 1 $ 1,000.00 | § 1,000.00f $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 750.00
1001—LR LIGHTING UPGRADES (APZA 60 LED POST TOP LIGHT, VANDAL RESISTANT, EXTREME LIGHT) LS 1 $ 20,700.00 | $ 20,700.00] $ 10,000.00 | § 10,000.00 | $ 17,648.00 | $ 17,648.00
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R.H. Deas Building Co., LLC Harris Contracting Services James Bros. Excavating, Inc.
ALDOT PLAN
ITEM NO HEM BESCRIPTION HNIT QTY UNIT UNIT UNIT 3
PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT PRIGE TOTAL AMOUNT BRICE TOTAL AMOUNT ;
1002—LN LIGHTING POLE AND LUMINAIRE LS 1 $ 10,925.00 | $ 10,925.00| $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 61,236.00 | $ 61,236.0
1004—PE PLUMBING AND ELECTRICAL FOR PRECAST BATHROOM LS 1 $ 45,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 $ 1,000,000.00 | $  100,000.00 | $ 9,482.00 | $ 9,482.0!
1005—SP SEPTIC SYSTEM (TANK/FIELD LINES/PLUMBING/ABANDONMENT) LS 1 $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00| $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 24,500.00 | $ 24,500.00
1007A—000 | CONCRETE WHEEL STOP EA 6 $ 75.00 | $ 450.00] $ 200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 750.00 | §
641L-500 CONCRETE FOR WATER MAINS (included in Addendum #3) cY 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 750.00 | $ 1,500.00 | §
654A-001 SOLID SODDING (BERMUDA) (included in Addendum #3) 5% 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 875| $ 8,750.0
656A-010 MULCHING (included in Addendum #3) ACRE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,350.00 | $ 1,350.00 | $
Total Bid Amountj ¢ 251,820.00 § $ 469,825.00 | $ 379,355.00 |
Differencel §  251,790.00 $ 30.00] $  469,000.00 $ 825.00
Bid Bond Included YES YES YES
Contract Returned NO YES YES
Addendum] NO YES YES

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

1, MARK ACREMAN, P.E., ASSISTANT COUNTY ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE THIS IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT.

Hsb. Gronsisssn religlzs”

MARK ACREMAN, P.E. Date
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