Competitive Bid #WG25-16 Provision of Rental Equipment - | Rental BIDDERS
Bid Tabulation for Picked-Up Period
EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Sunbelt Rentals, Thompson United Rentals (North
Co,, Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.
6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump Daily $360.00 $130.00 No Bid $975.00 No Bid $473.00
w/100ft.suction hose&200ft. Weekly $960.00 $378.00 No Bid $2,250.00 No Bid $1,329.00
discharge hose Monthly $2,400.00 $1,034.00 No Bid $7,800.00 No Bid $3,833.00
2 in. Electric Submerge Pump Daily No Bid $68.00 No Bid $95.00 No Bid $127.00
w/200 ft. hose Weekly No Bid $189.00 No Bid $175.00 No Bid $347.00
Monthly No Bid $446.00 No Bid $395.00 No Bid $918.00
Mud Pump Daily No Bid $105.00 No Bid $125.00 No Bid $51.00
Weekly No Bid $294.00 No Bid $330.00 No Bid $123.00
Monthly No Bid $599.00 No Bid $685.00 No Bid $371.00
12 ft. Wood Grinder w/ Operator Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powered by Diesel, Minimum Reach 27' Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/Capabilities of lifting 5000 Ibs. Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper Daily No Bid $536.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $529.00
or equal Weekly No Bid $1,349.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,319.00
Monthly No Bid $3,255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,111.00
Quoting for 12"
Curtain Burner 30ft. Daily $680.00 $735.00 $595.00 $675.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly $1,800.00 $1,680.00 $1,445.00 $1,550.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly $4,500.00 $4,494.00 $3,745.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid
3500 Watt Honda Generator Daily No Bid $68.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid $68.00
or equal Weekly No Bid $252.00 No Bid $170.00 No Bid $210.00
Monthly No Bid $541.00 No Bid $345.00 No Bid $540.00
CAT XQ230 Emergency Standby Generator Daily No Bid $966.00 No Bid $1,372.00 No Bid $808.00
or equal Weekly No Bid $2,284.00 No Bid $3,430.00 No Bid $1,623.00
Monthly No Bid $5,513.00 No Bid $8,582.00 No Bid $5,151.00
Diesel Powered Light Plants Daily $90.00 $142.00 No Bid $135.00 No Bid $125.00
w/four 1000 watt Metal Halide Weekly $250.00 $331.00 No Bid $285.00 No Bid $305.00
Flood Lights Monthly $625.00 $614.00 No Bid $545.00 No Bid $668.00




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Sunbelt Rentals, Thompson United Rentals (North

Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.
285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Daily No Bid $320.00 No Bid $325.00 No Bid $255.00
Compressor w/100 ft. of 1 in. air Weekly No Bid $761.00 No Bid $655.00 No Bid $624.00
hoses or equal Monthly No Bid $1,838.00 No Bid $1,470.00 No Bid $1,140.00
Quoting for 185 CFm
Gas Powered Portable Welding Daily No Bid $105.00 No Bid $170.00 No Bid $109.00
Machine - Medium Duty Weekly No Bid $257.00 No Bid $335.00 No Bid $273.00
Monthly No Bid $588.00 No Bid $735.00 No Bid $600.00
Quoting 250 amp LP/GAS
40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift Daily No Bid $404.00 No Bid $335.00 No Bid $395.00
Weekly No Bid $1,097.00 No Bid $875.00 No Bid $1,060.00
Monthly No Bid $2,310.00 No Bid $1,700.00 No Bid $2,316.00
Quoting 50' Towable
Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forklift Daily No Bid $231.00 No Bid $305.00 No Bid $235.00
or equal Weekly No Bid $578.00 No Bid $695.00 No Bid $667.00
Monthly No Bid $1,313.00 No Bid $1,395.00 No Bid $1,416.00
LP Gas Power Forklift Daily No Bid $231.00 No Bid $305.00 No Bid $235.00
or equal Weekly No Bid $578.00 No Bid $695.00 No Bid $667.00
Monthly No Bid $1,313.00 No Bid $1,395.00 No Bid $1,416.00
Quoting 5k Warehouse
32' Scissor Lift Daily No Bid $215.00 No Bid $220.00 No Bid $283.00
Weekly No Bid $467.00 No Bid $445.00 No Bid $674.00
Monthly No Bid $940.00 No Bid $695.00 No Bid $1,266.00
19’ Cab Shooting Boom Forklift 5500Ibs. Daily No Bid $389.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $373.00
Weekly No Bid $998.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,150.00
Monthly No Bid $2,153.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,450.00
Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.00 No Bid $293.00
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $545.00 No Bid $902.00
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,275.00 No Bid $2,041.00
Size 24" Walk behind track 16-27 HP
Trencher Daily No Bid $446.00 No Bid $215.00 No Bid $413.00
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid $1,134.00 No Bid $645.00 No Bid $1,157.00
Monthly No Bid $2,462.00 No Bid $1,400.00 No Bid $2,707.00
Ride on 35-49 HP Size 36" Ride on 32-50 HP
Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Sunbelt Rentals, Thompson United Rentals (North
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.
Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck-8' Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Long 24 CU Yard with Barn Door Tailgate Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boom Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Daily No Bid $777.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $2,573.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $5,723.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Daily No Bid $777.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $815.00
Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $2,573.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,963.00
Monthly No Bid $5,723.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,057.00
Volvo A25D- 25 ton 6x6 Articulated Daily $1,460.00 No Bid $1,395.00 $2,750.00 $1,980.00 No Bid
Off Road Truck or equal Weekly $3,960.00 No Bid $3,495.00 $3,400.00 $4,950.00 No Bid
Monthly $9,900.00 No Bid $8,995.00 $8,900.00 $11,610.00 No Bid
Volvo A25G
Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body Daily No Bid $777.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $661.00
or equal Weekly No Bid $2,573.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,770.00
Monthly No Bid $5,723.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,680.00
Quoting 5 yd Dump Truck
Cargo Truck 26ft. Extended Length Box Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Water Truck - 2000 Gallon Capacity Daily $540.00 $588.00 $495.00 $425.00 $2,440.00 $679.00
or equal Weekly $1,440.00 $1,764.00 $995.00 $1,200.00 $6,100.00 $2,073.00
Monthly $3,600.00 $3,386.00 $2,195.00 $2,400.00 $14,310.00 $4,577.00
Water Wagon - 500 Gallon Capacity Daily No Bid $168.00 No Bid $195.00 No Bid $151.00
or equal Weekly No Bid $557.00 No Bid $425.00 No Bid $452.00
Monthly No Bid $1,024.00 No Bid $850.00 No Bid $981.00
938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket Daily No Bid $835.00 $995.00 $800.00 $1,100.00 No Bid
w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket Weekly No Bid $2,200.00 $1,985.00 $2,600.00 $2,730.00 No Bid
or equal Monthly No Bid $6,038.00 $4,995.00 $7,300.00 $6,390.00 No Bid
Hitachi ZW180
Cat 966K Front End Loader or equal Daily $900.00 $1,050.00 $1,295.00 $1,650.00 $1,790.00 No Bid
Weekly $2,400.00 $2,678.00 $2,495.00 $4,200.00 $4,470.00 No Bid
Monthly $6,000.00 $8,558.00 $7,995.00 $11,600.00 $10,485.00 No Bid
Hitachi ZW310
Caterpillar 963D Track Loader with Daily No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
multipurpose bucket or equal Weekly No Bid $2,678.00 No Bid $4,200.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $8,558.00 No Bid $12,500.00 No Bid No Bid
Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/high capacity Daily No Bid $488.00 No Bid $585.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal Weekly No Bid $1,318.00 No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Sunbelt Rentals, Thompson United Rentals (North
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

Monthly No Bid $3,255.00 No Bid $3,100.00 No Bid No Bid
Cat 336GC Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily $1,340.00 $1,764.00 $1,245.00 $975.00 $1,880.00 $1,858.00
or equal Weekly $3,560.00 $4,190.00 $3,450.00 $3,750.00 $4,680.00 $4,998.00
Monthly $8,900.00 $11,550.00 $8,950.00 $10,000.00 $10,980.00 $12,499.00

Hitachi ZX350
Cat 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily $1,160.00 $1,764.00 $1,495.00 $900.00 $1,660.00 $1,656.00
or equal Weekly $3,080.00 $4,190.00 $2,745.00 $3,200.00 $4,140.00 $4,075.00
Monthly $7,700.00 $11,550.00 $7,450.00 $8,600.00 $9,720.00 $11,021.00

Hitachi ZX300
Cat 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily $1,040.00 $1,764.00 $995.00 $725.00 $1,370.00 $1,656.00
or equal Weekly $2,760.00 $4,190.00 $2,450.00 $2,550.00 $3,420.00 $4,075.00
Monthly $6,900.00 $11,550.00 $5,495.00 $7,600.00 $7,740.00 $11,021.00

Hitachi ZX250
Cat 322 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal Daily No Bid $1,764.00 No Bid No Bid $1,080.00 $1,261.00
Weekly No Bid $4,190.00 No Bid No Bid $2,690.00 $3,148.00
Monthly No Bid $11,550.00 No Bid No Bid $6,300.00 $8,317.00
XL4100 Gradall or equal Daily No Bid $1,370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,067.00
Weekly No Bid $3,197.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,833.00
Monthly No Bid $8,096.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,863.00
Cat 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C Daily $1,430.00 $1,764.00 No Bid $1,100.00 $2,290.00 $1,853.00
or equal 60 ft. reach Weekly $3,800.00 $4,190.00 No Bid $3,600.00 $5,720.00 $4,817.00
Monthly $9,500.00 $11,550.00 No Bid $10,900.00 $14,085.00 $11,232.00
Cat 349 Excavator Loader with multipurpose Daily $1,880.00 $1,764.00 No Bid $2,500.00 $2,750.00 No Bid
bucket or equal Weekly $5,000.00 $4,190.00 No Bid $5,200.00 $6,870.00 No Bid
Monthly $12,500.00 $11,550.00 No Bid $14,000.00 $16,110.00 No Bid
Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator) Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $215.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Cat 12M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,760.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,390.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,305.00 No Bid
Cat 12M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,760.00 No Bid
Blade or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,390.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,305.00 No Bid
CAT 140M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,600.00 $1,760.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,750.00 $4,390.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,500.00 $10,305.00 No Bid
CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,760.00 No Bid
Blade or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,390.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,305.00 No Bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Sunbelt Rentals, Thompson United Rentals (North
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

Cat D6K LGP Dozer or equal with Straight Blade Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,700.00 No Bid No Bid
Cat D6K LGP Dozer or equal with Tilt Blade Daily No Bid No Bid $995.00 $550.00 $1,320.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid $1,845.00 $1,875.00 $3,300.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid $5,195.00 $5,200.00 $7,740.00 No Bid

John Deere 700KLGP
Cat D6 LGP Dozer or equal with Straight Blade, Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $600.00 $2,140.00 No Bid
and A/C, Auto Reversing Fan Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,950.00 $5,330.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,650.00 $12,510.00 No Bid
Cat D4 LGP Dozer with 6-way Angle Blade or Daily No Bid No Bid $745.00 $600.00 $1,320.00 $1,020.00
equal with Cab and A/C Weekly No Bid No Bid $1,845.00 $1,950.00 $3,300.00 $2,752.00
Monthly No Bid No Bid $5,450.00 $5,650.00 $7,340.00 $6,864.00
Cat 416E Back Hoe or equal Daily No Bid $389.00 No Bid $425.00 No Bid $371.00
Weekly No Bid $1,013.00 No Bid $1,300.00 No Bid $990.00
Monthly No Bid $2,389.00 No Bid $2,175.00 No Bid $2,377.00
Cat 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd. capacity Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,775.00 No Bid
Pull behind Tractor Scraper Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 cu. yd. capacity or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $625.00 $445.00 $475.00 No Bid $382.00
width of 66 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $1,601.00 $1,345.00 $1,200.00 No Bid $1,010.00
Monthly No Bid $3,423.00 $3,450.00 $2,675.00 No Bid $2,114.00

Dynapac CC4200V1
8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $714.00 $495.00 $575.00 No Bid $844.00
width of 84 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $1,916.00 $1,395.00 $1,500.00 No Bid $2,046.00
Monthly No Bid $4,384.00 $3,395.00 $3,650.00 No Bid $5,206.00

Dynapac CC6200V1
9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller Daily No Bid $714.00 $595.00 No Bid No Bid $844.00
Weekly No Bid $1,916.00 $1,495.00 No Bid No Bid $2,046.00
Monthly No Bid $4,384.00 $3,995.00 No Bid No Bid $5,206.00

Dynapac CP1200
Cat CP 44 Sheepfoot Roller Daily No Bid $525.00 $445.00 $475.00 No Bid $605.00
w/blade or equal Weekly No Bid $1,328.00 $1,195.00 $1,200.00 No Bid $1,631.00
Monthly No Bid $2,945.00 $2,945.00 $2,675.00 No Bid $4,070.00

CA1500PP
Cat CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal Daily No Bid $625.00 $595.00 $575.00 $780.00 $885.00
Weekly No Bid $1,601.00 $1,395.00 $1,500.00 $2,100.00 $2,167.00
Monthly No Bid $3,423.00 $3,395.00 $3,650.00 $5,670.00 $5,408.00

CA2500PD
One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller Daily No Bid $226.00 $195.00 $325.00 No Bid $461.00
Weekly No Bid $641.00 $595.00 $725.00 No Bid $1,164.00
Monthly No Bid $1,575.00 $1,495.00 $1,685.00 No Bid $2,854.00




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Sunbelt Rentals, Thompson United Rentals (North

Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

Dynapac CC900

Minimum 114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/6ft. Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat 299D3 Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo) Daily $450.00 No Bid No Bid $585.00 No Bid $533.00
73hp or equal, Rubber Tracks Weekly $1,200.00 No Bid No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid $1,424.00
Monthly $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid $3,100.00 No Bid $3,206.00
Quoting Bobcat t870
Cat 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp Daily $315.00 $273.00 No Bid $425.00 No Bid $302.00
or equal Weekly $840.00 $667.00 No Bid $895.00 No Bid $971.00
Monthly $2,100.00 $1,706.00 No Bid $2,000.00 No Bid $2,225.00
Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Daily No Bid $70.00 No Bid $40.00 No Bid $60.00
Loader Weekly No Bid $222.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid $164.00
Monthly No Bid $526.00 No Bid $250.00 No Bid $373.00
Quoting 24" - smaller &
larger sizes will vary
Angle Broom for Skid Steer Daily No Bid $126.00 No Bid $110.00 No Bid $146.00
Loader Weekly No Bid $389.00 No Bid $325.00 No Bid $344.00
Monthly No Bid $809.00 No Bid $775.00 No Bid $880.00
Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $536.00 No Bid $300.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $1,628.00 No Bid $845.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $2,903.00 No Bid $2,155.00 No Bid No Bid
Forks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $47.00 No Bid $60.00 No Bid $62.00
Weekly No Bid $137.00 No Bid $160.00 No Bid $154.00
Monthly No Bid $288.00 No Bid $375.00 No Bid $371.00
Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $236.00 No Bid $275.00 No Bid $237.00
Weekly No Bid $677.00 No Bid $775.00 No Bid $674.00
Monthly No Bid $1,465.00 No Bid $1,900.00 No Bid $1,499.00
Tracks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $221.00 No Bid $150.00 No Bid $208.00
Weekly No Bid $630.00 No Bid $395.00 No Bid $431.00
Monthly No Bid $1,428.00 No Bid $1,000.00 No Bid $1,407.00
Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $221.00 No Bid $150.00 No Bid $208.00
Weekly No Bid $630.00 No Bid $395.00 No Bid $431.00
Monthly No Bid $1,428.00 No Bid $1,000.00 No Bid $1,407.00
Portable Screening Plant Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Sunbelt Rentals, Thompson United Rentals (North
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

Model 271 or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,850.00 No Bid

Milling Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Writgen 2000 or equivalent with operators Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid $1,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid $3,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid $7,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dynapac FC17000

Cat AP655F Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat AP1055F Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

AWD self-propelled 24' Boom mower with 50" Daily No Bid $126.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mulching head or equal Weekly No Bid $467.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $898.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Trimble Grade Control System GCS900 2D for Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.00
Dozers and Spectra Precision GL622N/GL6221R Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00
(dual grade) Automatic Grade Lasers or equal Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $415.00
Anderson HP 35 Trailer Mounted Hydra Platform or equal Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Under Bridge Inspection Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

EXCEPTIONS/NOTES:

Sunbelt Rentals - The rental rates may not include any applicable taxes, fuel charges, environmental fees, Rental Protection Plan, or any other applicable ancillary charges.
Addendum A-Equipment Rentals which details use, maintenance, fees, return of equipment, warranty and limitation of Sunbelt's liability.

United Rentals - Freight not included. Will vary depending on job site. Can negotiate. Monthly rates = 4 week rental. All equipment is subject to availability.
Specifications, paragraph six, page 6. The following sentence should be added to the end of paragraph six: It is understood and agreed that the County shall be responsible for all

damage or loss arising from the County's abuse, misuse or neglect of the equipment rented.

Specifications, paragraph seven, page 6. This paragraph should be amended to reflect that rental rates for 1 month shall be for a 4 week period, not 30 days.




Competitive Bid #WG25-16 Provision of Rental Rental BIDDERS
Equipment - Bid Tabulation for Delivered Period
EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Thompson United Rentals (North
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc. 3
Co,, Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.
6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump Daily $425.00 $380.00 No Bid $1,545.00 No Bid No Bid
w/100ft.suction hose&200ft. Weekly $1,100.00 $628.00 No Bid $2,820.00 No Bid No Bid
discharge hose Monthly $2,550.00 $1,284.00 No Bid $8,370.00 No Bid No Bid
$285 ea way added to bid
2 in. Electric Submerge Pump Daily No Bid $318.00 No Bid $345.00 No Bid No Bid
w/200 ft. hose Weekly No Bid $439.00 No Bid $425.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $696.00 No Bid $645.00 No Bid No Bid
$125 ea way added to bid
Mud Pump Daily No Bid $355.00 No Bid $375.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $544.00 No Bid $580.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $849.00 No Bid $935.00 No Bid No Bid
$125 ea way added to bid
12 ft. Wood Grinder w/ Operator Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powered by Diesel, Minimum Reach 27' Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/Capabilities of lifting 5000 Ibs. Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper Daily No Bid $786.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid $1,599.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $3,505.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Curtain Burner 30ft. Daily $800.00 $985.00 $695.00 $5,275.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly $1,920.00 $1,930.00 $1,495.00 $6,150.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly $4,620.00 $4,744.00 $3,945.00 $8,400.00 No Bid No Bid
$2300 ea way added to bid
3500 Watt Honda Generator Daily No Bid $318.00 No Bid $350.00 No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid $502.00 No Bid $420.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $791.00 No Bid $595.00 No Bid No Bid
$125 ea way added to bid
CAT XQ230 Emergency Standby Generator Daily No Bid $1,216.00 No Bid $1,872.00 No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid $2,534.00 No Bid $3,930.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $5,763.00 No Bid $9,082.00 No Bid No Bid
$250 ea way added to bid
Diesel Powered Light Plants Daily $150.00 $392.00 No Bid $435.00 No Bid No Bid
w/four 1000 watt Metal Halide Weekly $310.00 $581.00 No Bid $585.00 No Bid No Bid
Flood Lights Monthly $685.00 $864.00 No Bid $845.00 No Bid No Bid

$150 ea way added to bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Thompson United Rentals (North
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc. |
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.
285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Daily No Bid $570.00 No Bid $625.00 No Bid No Bid
Compressor w/100 ft. of 1 in. air Weekly No Bid $1,011.00 No Bid $955.00 No Bid No Bid
hoses or equal Monthly No Bid $2,088.00 No Bid $1,770.00 No Bid No Bid
$150 ea way added to bid
Gas Powered Portable Welding Daily No Bid $355.00 No Bid $420.00 No Bid No Bid
Machine - Medium Duty Weekly No Bid $507.00 No Bid $585.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $838.00 No Bid $985.00 No Bid No Bid
$125 ea way added to bid
40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift Daily No Bid $654.00 No Bid $605.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $1,347.00 No Bid $1,145.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $2,560.00 No Bid $1,970.00 No Bid No Bid
$135 ea way added to bid
Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forklift Daily No Bid $481.00 No Bid $595.00 No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid $828.00 No Bid $985.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,563.00 No Bid $1,685.00 No Bid No Bid
$145 ea way added to bid
LP Gas Power Forklift Daily No Bid $481.00 No Bid $595.00 No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid $828.00 No Bid $985.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,563.00 No Bid $1,685.00 No Bid No Bid
$145 ea way added to bid
32' Scissor Lift Daily No Bid $465.00 No Bid $510.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $717.00 No Bid $735.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,190.00 No Bid $985.00 No Bid No Bid
$145 ea way added to bid
19’ Cab Shooting Boom Forklift 5500Ibs. Daily No Bid $639.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $1,248.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $2,403.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $465.00 No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $815.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,545.00 No Bid No Bid
24" $135 ea way added to
bid
Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $485.00 No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $915.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,670.00 No Bid No Bid
36" $135 ea way added to
bid
Trencher Daily No Bid $696.00 No Bid $685.00 No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid $1,384.00 No Bid $1,140.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $2,712.00 No Bid $1,990.00 No Bid No Bid
48" r/o $145 ea way added
Ride on 35-49 HP to bid
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Thompson United Rentals (North
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc. |
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck-8' Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Long 24 CU Yard with Barn Door Tailgate Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boom Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Daily No Bid $1,027.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $2,823.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $5,973.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Daily No Bid $1,027.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $2,823.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $5,973.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Volvo A25D- 25 ton 6x6 Articulated Daily $1,690.00 No Bid $1,695.00 $9,750.00 $2,480.00 No Bid
Off Road Truck or equal Weekly $4,160.00 No Bid $3,795.00 $10,400.00 $5,480.00 No Bid
Monthly $10,100.00 No Bid $9,295.00 $15,900.00 $12,110.00 No Bid

Volvo A25G| $3500 ea way added to bid
Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body Daily No Bid $1,027.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid $2,823.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $5,973.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargo Truck 26ft. Extended Length Box Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Water Truck - 2000 Gallon Capacity Daily $600.00 $838.00 $595.00 $975.00 $2,940.00 No Bid
or equal Weekly $1,480.00 $2,014.00 $1,095.00 $1,750.00 $6,600.00 No Bid
Monthly $3,660.00 $3,636.00 $2,495.00 $2,950.00 $14,810.00 No Bid

$275 ea way added to bid
Water Wagon - 500 Gallon Capacity Daily No Bid $418.00 No Bid $445.00 No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid $807.00 No Bid $675.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,274.00 No Bid $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid
938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket Daily No Bid $1,085.00 $1,095.00 $6,600.00 $1,600.00 No Bid
w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket Weekly No Bid $2,450.00 $2,385.00 $8,400.00 $3,230.00 No Bid
or equal Monthly No Bid $6,288.00 $5,945.00 $13,100.00 $6,890.00 No Bid

Hitachi ZW180 $2900 ea way added to bid
Cat 966K Front End Loader or equal Daily $1,000.00 $1,300.00 $1,395.00 $8,250.00 $2,590.00 No Bid
Weekly $2,500.00 $2,928.00 $2,795.00 $10,800.00 $5,270.00 No Bid
Monthly $6,100.00 $8,808.00 $8,395.00 $18,200.00 $11,285.00 No Bid

Hitachi ZW310 $3300 ea way added to bid
Caterpillar 963D Track Loader with Daily No Bid $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
multipurpose bucket or equal Weekly No Bid $2,928.00 No Bid $14,200.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $8,808.00 No Bid $22,500.00 No Bid No Bid

$5000 ea way added to bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Thompson United Rentals (North
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc. |
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/high capacity Daily No Bid $738.00 No Bid $985.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal Weekly No Bid $1,568.00 No Bid $1,450.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $3,505.00 No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid

$200 ea way added to bid
Cat 336GC Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily $1,740.00 $2,014.00 $1,745.00 $7,575.00 $2,680.00 No Bid
or equal Weekly $3,960.00 $4,440.00 $3,950.00 $10,350.00 $5,480.00 No Bid
Monthly $9,300.00 $11,800.00 $9,450.00 $16,600.00 $11,780.00 No Bid

Hitachi ZX350 $3300 ea way added to bid
Cat 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily $1,560.00 $2,014.00 $1,795.00 $6,900.00 $2,460.00 No Bid
or equal Weekly $3,480.00 $4,440.00 $3,245.00 $9,200.00 $4,941.00 No Bid
Monthly $8,100.00 $11,800.00 $7,950.00 $14,600.00 $10,520.00 No Bid

Hitachi ZX300 $3000 ea way added to bid
Cat 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily $1,440.00 $2,014.00 $1,295.00 $6,725.00 $1,870.00 No Bid
or equal Weekly $3,160.00 $4,440.00 $2,750.00 $8,550.00 $3,920.00 No Bid
Monthly $7,300.00 $11,800.00 $6,950.00 $13,600.00 $8,240.00 No Bid

Hitachi ZX250 $3000 ea way added to bid
Cat 322 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal Daily No Bid $2,014.00 No Bid No Bid $1,580.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid $4,440.00 No Bid No Bid $3,190.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid $11,800.00 No Bid No Bid $6,800.00 No Bid
XL4100 Gradall or equal Daily No Bid $1,620.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $3,447.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $8,346.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C Daily $1,830.00 $2,014.00 No Bid $7,100.00 $3,090.00 No Bid
or equal 60 ft. reach Weekly $4,200.00 $4,440.00 No Bid $9,600.00 $6,520.00 No Bid
Monthly $9,900.00 $11,800.00 No Bid $16,900.00 $14,885.00 No Bid

$3000 ea way added to bid
Cat 349 Excavator Loader with multipurpose Daily $2,880.00 $2,014.00 No Bid $12,500.00 $4,250.00 No Bid
bucket or equal Weekly $6,000.00 $4,440.00 No Bid $15,200.00 $8,370.00 No Bid
Monthly $13,500.00 $11,800.00 No Bid $24,000.00 $17,610.00 No Bid

$5000 ea way added to bid
Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator) Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat 12M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,560.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,090.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,005.00 No Bid
Cat 12M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,560.00 No Bid
Blade or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,090.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,005.00 No Bid
CAT 140M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,600.00 $2,560.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,750.00 $5,090.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,500.00 $11,005.00 No Bid

$3000 ea way added to bid
CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,560.00 No Bid
Blade or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,090.00 No Bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Thompson United Rentals (North
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc. |
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,005.00 No Bid
Cat D6K LGP Dozer or equal with Straight Blade Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,050.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,200.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,700.00 No Bid No Bid

$3000 ea way added to bid
Cat D6K LGP Dozer or equal with Tilt Blade Daily No Bid No Bid $1,495.00 $6,550.00 $2,020.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid $2,345.00 $7,875.00 $4,060.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid $5,895.00 $11,200.00 $8,240.00 No Bid

John Deere 700KLGP| $3000 ea way added to bid
Cat D6 LGP Dozer or equal with Straight Blade, Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,600.00 $3,140.00 No Bid
and A/C, Auto Reversing Fan Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,950.00 $6,330.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,650.00 $13,510.00 No Bid

$2000 ea way added to bid
Cat D4 LGP Dozer with 6-way Angle Blade or Daily No Bid No Bid $775.00 $4,600.00 $2,020.00 No Bid
equal with Cab and A/C Weekly No Bid No Bid $2,145.00 $5,950.00 $4,000.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid $5,650.00 $9,650.00 $8,240.00 No Bid

$2000 ea way added to bid
Cat 416E Back Hoe or equal Daily No Bid $639.00 No Bid $825.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $1,263.00 No Bid $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $2,639.00 No Bid $2,575.00 No Bid No Bid

$200 ea way added to bid
Cat 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd. capacity Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pull behind Tractor Scraper Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 cu. yd. capacity or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $875.00 $795.00 $805.00 No Bid No Bid
width of 66 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $1,851.00 $1,445.00 $1,530.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $3,673.00 $2,975.00 $3,005.00 No Bid No Bid

Dynapac CC4200V1| $165 ea way added to bid
8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $964.00 $695.00 $905.00 No Bid No Bid
width of 84 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $2,166.00 $1,495.00 $1,830.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $4,634.00 $3,750.00 $3,980.00 No Bid No Bid

Dynapac CC6200V1| $165 ea way added to bid
9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller Daily No Bid $964.00 $895.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $2,166.00 $1,795.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $4,634.00 $4,485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dynapac CP1200

Cat CP 44 Sheepfoot Roller Daily No Bid $775.00 $595.00 $805.00 No Bid No Bid
w/blade or equal Weekly No Bid $1,578.00 $1,450.00 $1,530.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $3,195.00 $3,350.00 $3,005.00 No Bid No Bid

CA1500PP| $165 ea way added to bid
Cat CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal Daily No Bid $875.00 $695.00 $905.00 $1,180.00 No Bid
Weekly No Bid $1,851.00 $1,495.00 $1,830.00 $2,500.00 No Bid
Monthly No Bid $3,673.00 $3,750.00 $3,980.00 $6,070.00 No Bid

CA2500PD| $165 ea way added to bid
One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller Daily No Bid $476.00 $545.00 $655.00 No Bid No Bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Thompson United Rentals (North
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc. |
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.

Weekly No Bid $891.00 $1,025.00 $1,055.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,825.00 $1,995.00 $2,015.00 No Bid No Bid

Dynapac CC900| $165 ea way added to bid
Minimum 114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/6ft. Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat 299D3 Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo) Daily $650.00 No Bid No Bid $985.00 No Bid No Bid
73hp or equal, Rubber Tracks Weekly $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid $1,450.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly $3,200.00 No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid

$200 ea way added to bid
Cat 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp Daily $385.00 $523.00 No Bid $755.00 No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly $890.00 $917.00 No Bid $1,225.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly $2,150.00 $1,956.00 No Bid $2,330.00 No Bid No Bid

$165 ea way added to bid
Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Daily No Bid $320.00 No Bid $290.00 No Bid No Bid
Loader Weekly No Bid $472.00 No Bid $325.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $776.00 No Bid $500.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid
Angle Broom for Skid Steer Daily No Bid $376.00 No Bid $360.00 No Bid No Bid
Loader Weekly No Bid $639.00 No Bid $575.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,059.00 No Bid $1,025.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid
Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $786.00 No Bid $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $1,878.00 No Bid $1,095.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $3,153.00 No Bid $2,405.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid
Forks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $297.00 No Bid $310.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $387.00 No Bid $410.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $538.00 No Bid $625.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid
Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $486.00 No Bid $525.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $927.00 No Bid $1,025.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,715.00 No Bid $2,150.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid
Tracks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $471.00 No Bid $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $880.00 No Bid $645.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,678.00 No Bid $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid
Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $471.00 No Bid $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Weekly No Bid $880.00 No Bid $645.00 No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,678.00 No Bid $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid

$125 ea way added to bid




EQUIPMENT Cowin Equipment Herc Rentals, Pittman Tractor Thompson United Rentals (North
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc. |
Co., Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. Tractor Co., Inc. America), Inc.
Portable Screening Plant Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model 271 or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,850.00 No Bid
Milling Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Writgen 2000 or equivalent with operators Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid $4,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid $8,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dynapac FC17000
Cat AP655F Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat AP1055F Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AWD self-propelled 24' Boom mower with 50" Daily No Bid $376.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mulching head or equal Weekly No Bid $171.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid $1,148.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trimble Grade Control System GCS900 2D for Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dozers and Spectra Precision GL622N/GL6221R Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(dual grade) Automatic Grade Lasers or equal Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Anderson HP 35 Trailer Mounted Hydra Platform or equal Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Under Bridge Inspection Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

EXCEPTIONS/NOTES:
Sunbelt Rentals - The rental rates may not include any applicable taxes, fuel charges, environmental fees, Rental Protection Plan, or any other applicable ancillary charges.
Addendum A-Equipment Rentals which details use, maintenance, fees, return of equipment, warranty and limitation of Sunbelt's liability.

United Rentals - Freight not included. Will vary depending on job site. Can negotiate. Monthly rates = 4 week rental. All equipment is subject to availability.

Specifications, paragraph six, page 6. The following sentence should be added to the end of paragraph six: It is understood and agreed that the County shall be responsible for all
damage or loss arising from the County's abuse, misuse or neglect of the equipment rented.

Specifications, paragraph seven, page 6. This paragraph should be amended to reflect that rental rates for 1 month shall be for a 4 week period, not 30 days.




	WG25-16 - Bid Tab, Delivered
	Sheet1

	WG25-16 - Bid Tab, Picked-up
	Sheet1


