COMPETITIVE BID #WG26-24 BID TABULATION
Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories

BIDDER: Andrew's Diesel and Automotive Repair, LLC

BIDDER: Prologic ITS, LLC

GROUP #1

GROUP #1

SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS

Amount Bid
5.5 Foot Regular Bed $575.00
6.5 Foot Regular Bed $575.00
6.5 Foot Utility Bed $950.00
ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR
Model Amount Bid
HE-DR22 $304.15 each

CAMLOCKER TOOLBOX MATTE BLACK FOR CREW CAB

COLORADO

Model Amount Bid
S63LPMB $802.44 each
TACOMA

Model Amount Bid
S63LPFN-MB $802.44 each

CAMLOCKER TOOLBOX MATTE BLACK FOR CREW CAB

SILVERADO

Model Amount Bid
S71MB $801.03 each
F-150

Model Amount Bid
S71MB $801.03 each
F-250

Model Amount Bid
S71MB $801.03 each

RIGID LED POD LIGHT 502313 IN PAIRS
Model Amount Bid
502313 $326.10 each

DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PART XG6 AND XF4

Model Amount Bid
XG6 and XF4 $1,405.88 each

TONNEAU COVER: TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK

Model Amount Bid
448337 $993.50 each

ROUGH COUNTRY RETRACTABLE BED COVER 46120581A OR EQUIVALENT

FOR 2024+ SILVERADO OR 2024+ FORD F-150

Model Amount Bid
30482 $1,044.49 each

Exceptions: None

SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS

Amount Bid
5.5 Foot Regular Bed No Bid
6.5 Foot Regular Bed No Bid
6.5 Foot Utility Bed No Bid
ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR
Model Amount Bid
EW3225 $420.17 each

CAMLOCKER TOOLBOX MATTE BLACK FOR CREW CAB

COLORADO

Model Amount Bid
AA-CL-63-101-1 $785.39 each
TACOMA

Model Amount Bid
AA-CK-63-101-1 $785.39 each

CAMLOCKER TOOLBOX MATTE BLACK FOR CREW CAB

SILVERADO

Model Amount Bid
AA-CL-101-1 $785.39 each
F-150

Model Amount Bid
AA-CL-101-1 $785.39 each
F-250

Model Amount Bid
AA-CL-101-1 $785.39 each

RIGID LED POD LIGHT 502313 IN PAIRS
Model Amount Bid
502313 $478.48 each

DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PART XG6 AND XF4

Model Amount Bid
XG6 and XF4 $1,300.55 each

TONNEAU COVER: TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK

Model Amount Bid
448130 Silverato and 448339 F150 $940.57 each

ROUGH COUNTRY RETRACTABLE BED COVER 46120581A OR EQUIVALENT

FOR 2024+ SILVERADO OR 2024+ FORD F-150

Model Amount Bid
51120580 Silvertado and 51509550 F150 $1,711.91 each

Exceptions: Prologic ITS cannot commit to a 12-month fixed pricing period.
Per the bid specifications prices shall be firm for a period of 12 months.




BIDDER: Andrew's Diesel and Automotive Repair, LLC

BIDDER: Prologic ITS, LLC

GROUP #2

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODELS 2021+

FORD F150
Model Amount Bid

No Bid each
Base Mount Amount Bid

No Bid each

FORD EXPLORER AND INTERCEPTOR UTILITY

Model Amount Bid

No Bid each
Base Mount Amount Bid

No Bid each
CHEVROLET TAHOE
Model Amount Bid

No Bid each
Base Mount Amount Bid

No Bid each

BROTHER POCKETJET PJ823-VK IN CAR PRINTER INCLUDING POWER CABLE

GROUP #2

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODELS 2021+

AND USB CABLE OR EQUIVALENT

Model Amount Bid
No Bid each

E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE

Model Amount Bid
No Bid each

Exceptions/Notes:

FORD F150

Model Amount Bid
RAM-VB-195-SW1 $372.03 each
Base Mount Amount Bid
RAM-VB-195 $88.70 each

FORD EXPLORER AND INTERCEPTOR UTILITY

Model Amount Bid
RAM-VB-206-ASW1 $382.78 each
Base Mount Amount Bid
RAM-VB-206 $74.72 each
CHEVROLET TAHOE

Model Amount Bid
RAM-VB-203-SW1 $408.59 each
Base Mount Amount Bid
RAM-VB-203 $98.38 each

BROTHER POCKETJET PJ823-VK IN CAR PRINTER INCLUDING POWER CABLE

AND USB CABLE OR EQUIVALENT

Model Amount Bid
PJ823-VK $461.86 each

E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE
Model Amount Bid
M-260 $473.12 each

Exceptions: Prologic ITS cannot commit to a 12-month fixed pricing period.
Per the bid specifications prices shall be firm for a period of 12 months.
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