COMPETITIVE BID #WG23-41 - BID TABULATION
Provision of Paint Striping Materials

BIDDER: Ennis-Flint, Inc.

. Amount Bid Amount Bid
Item Description
PICKED-UP DELIVERED

Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, No Bid No Bid
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, No Bid No Bid
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 250 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid $3,437.50 each
Storage System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 250 Gallon Tote IBC No Bid $3,562.50 each
Storage System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid $78.25 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid $81.25 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid $86.25 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage No Bid
System $81.25 each
Exceptions: NONE
BIDDER: Crown USA, Inc.

. Amount Bid Amount Bid

Item Description
PICKED-UP DELIVERED
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, No Bid No Bid
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)
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Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application No Bid No Bid

Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 250 Gallon IBC Storage
System

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 250 Gallon IBC Storage
System

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage

$3,672.50 each

$3,802.50 each

$3,782.50 each

$3,912.50 each

$73.05 each $74.05 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage 75,55 each $76.55 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage $79.00 each $80.00 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage
System $79.00 each $80.00 each
Exceptions: NONE
BIDDER: Swarco Industries, LLC
Item Description Amount Bid Amount Bid
PICKED-UP DELIVERED

Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application,
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets

Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application,
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets

Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application,
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)

Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application,
Shipped in Bulk Sacks on Pallets (approximately 2000 Ibs.)

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 250 Gallon Tote IBC
Storage System

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 250 Gallon Tote IBC
Storage System

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage

System

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage
System

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage
System

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Black Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage
System

Exceptions: NONE

$0.62 per pound
$1.25 per pound
$0.62 per pound
$1.25 per pound

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.62 per pound
$1.25 per pound
$0.62 per pound
$1.25 per pound

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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