
COMPETITIVE BID #WG20-45A - Bid Tabulation
Provision of Police Vehicle Equipment (Brake Rotors/Pads) 

BIDDER: The Parts House BIDDER: Sandy Sansing Automotive
2012 - 2014 Tahoe 2010 - 2014 Tahoe 
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 580279P Amount Bid: $63.36 Model: 23144341 Amount Bid: $83.00

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1367PPH Amount Bid: $42.19 Model: 25910430 Amount Bid: $147.00

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 580422P Amount Bid: $56.39 Model: 23968231 Amount Bid: $79.00

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1194PPH Amount Bid: $38.53 Model: 19329677 Amount Bid: $106.00

2015 - 2019 Tahoe 2015 - 2020 Tahoe
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 580279P Amount Bid: $63.36 Model: 23144341 Amount Bid: $83.00

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1367APPH Amount Bid: $42.19 Model: 84218394 Amount Bid: $143.00

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 580422P Amount Bid: $56.39 Model: 84223345 Amount Bid: $77.00

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1707PPH Amount Bid: $23.88 Model: 84176464 Amount Bid: $70.00

2021 Tahoe 2021 Tahoe
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: AC-Delco OE 177-1254 Amount Bid: $186.12 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: AC-Delco OE 84847749 Amount Bid: $94.70 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: AC-Delco OE 177-1255 Amount Bid: $58.57 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: AC-Delco OE 84805877 Amount Bid: $48.71 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

2016 - 2017 Ford Explorer 2016 - 2020 Explorer
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 680982P Amount Bid: $69.65 Model: GG1Z-1125-A Amount Bid: $82.00

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1611APPH Amount Bid: $42.13 Model: BRSD-1611-A Amount Bid: $62.00

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 680983P Amount Bid: $47.34 Model: DG1Z-2C026-A Amount Bid: $61.00

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1612PPH Amount Bid: $32.26 Model: BRSD-1377 Amount Bid: $42.00

2018 - 2020 Ford Explorer 2016 - 2020 F-150
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 682142P Amount Bid: $76.60 Model: JL3Z-1125-A Amount Bid: $60.50

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1611APPH Amount Bid: $42.13 Model: BR5D-1414 (2016)/BR5D-2085(2017 - 2020)Amount Bid: $48.00

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 680983P Amount Bid: $47.34 Model: FL3Z-2C026-C Amount Bid: $86.00

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1612PPH Amount Bid: $32.26 Model: BRSD-1602 Amount Bid: $39.00

2016 - 2020 Ford F-150 Exceptions: Did not include a Bid Bond as was required in the Bid Specifications
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 680508P Amount Bid: $68.94

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP2087PPH Amount Bid: $41.84

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: Raybestos Police 682263P Amount Bid: $65.39

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: Raybestos Police SP1790APPH Amount Bid: $27.35

Exceptions: NONE
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BIDDER: Edwards Chevrolet Co., Inc. BIDDER: Advance Auto Parts
2012 - 2020 Tahoe 2012 - 2020 Tahoe
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: GM #19307052/AC-Delco #18A2661 Amount Bid: $65.92 Model: Carquest #G12555SD Amount Bid: $54.99

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: GM #19366010/AC-Delco #17D1MHPVF1367Amount Bid: $75.59 Model: Carquest #FLD1363P Amount Bid: $46.14

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: GM #19241843/AC-Delco #18A2332A Amount Bid: $56.53 Model: Carquest #G12545SD Amount Bid: $63.24

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: GM #19294262/AC-Delco #17D1404MHPVAmount Bid: $67.33 Model: Carquest #FLD1194 Amount Bid: $47.44

2021 Tahoe 2021 Tahoe
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: GM #84865905 Amount Bid: $75.00 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: GM #84847749 Amount Bid: $117.44 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: GM #84582015 Amount Bid: $46.25 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: GM #84474063 Amount Bid: $60.42 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

2018 Ford Explorer 2018 Ford Explorer
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: GM #19387163/AC-Delco #18A82142 Amount Bid: $121.84 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: GM #19366012/AC-Delco #17D161VF11AMHPAmount Bid: $82.43 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: GM #19310534/AC-Delco #18A2947 Amount Bid: $72.22 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: GM #19366013/AC-Delco #17D1612MHPVF1Amount Bid: $68.67 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

2018 Ford F-150 2018 Ford F-150
Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Front Rotors:  Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: GM #19307036/AC-Delco #18A2461A Amount Bid: $60.32 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Front Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: GM #19386677/AC-Delco #17D2087CH Amount Bid: $64.93 Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package Rear Rotors: Factory OEM Equipment or equivalent to PPV package
Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent Rear Pads: Wagner Severe Duty for Police Pursuit Vehicles or equivalent
Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid Model: No Bid Amount Bid: No Bid

Exceptions: Did not include a Bid Bond as was required in the Bid Specifications Exceptions: NONE
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