COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-05 - BID TABULATION

Labor & Incidental Materials for Roof Replacement at the BC Board of Education Building

BIDDER: Dobson Roofing |Brazos Ind. |Carters Contr. |E. Cornell Malone |Standard Roofing [Double AA Const. [Amerson Roofing [All South Subcont. |Thomas Roofing |Porter Roofing |Sunrise Contr. |Mandal's Inc.
BASE BID: $45,000.00| No Bid $96,369.00 $22,300.00 $147,250.00 $74,400.00 $33,051.00 No Bid No Bid $27,375.00 No Bid No Bid
Perform roof restoration to

BOE Administration Office

UNIT PRICING:

a. Remove & replace metal coping $100.00 $150.00 $60.00 $300.00 $150.00 $5.00 $128.50
with new 24" stretchout, 24 ga.

per ten (10) foot piece.

b. Replace deteriorated wood nailer $10.00 $1.00 $4.00 $3.50 $10.00 $2.50 $2.10
with pressure treated, to match existing,

dimension. Per Board Foot.

c. Remove & replace wet insulation & s $20.00 $6.00 $12.00 $3.50 $8.00 $10.00 $2.80
roofing, per Square Foot, in addition to base

bid quantities, credit unused portion.

d. Remove and replace deteriorated $12.00 $5.75 $6.00 $8.00 $5.00 $8.00 $2.25
plywood, substrate, 5/8" ext. grade

per Square Foot.

e. Add fasteners to reattach nailer per $2.00 $1.00 $2.00 $1.50 $3.00 $3.00 $0.75
IBC, Teks 5 or Tapcon. Per Linear Foot.

Alabama License No. 13043 14389 41604 21718 37758 18200 13934
Bid Bond: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




