COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-12 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SERVICES

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
LOCATION Jani-King | Service Master Jazzy Clean
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes

Per/Month
Criminal Investigation Division -Rdale $776.79 $498.00 No Bid
Law Enforcement Support Serv - Rdale $133.67 $381.00 No Bid
Law Enforcement Maintenance - Rdale $303.79 $411.00 No Bid
BRATS Agency-Robertsdale $572.69 $585.00 $506.64
Silverhill Barn & Maintenance Division $307.29 $471.00 $485.98
Park Building- Silverhill $207.96 $295.00 $318.39
Foley Hwy $346.45 $395.00 No Bid
Bay Minette Hwy $259.07 $298.00 No Bid

Per/Day
Criminal Investigation Division -Rdale $59.75 $38.31 No Bid
Law Enforcement Support Serv - Rdale $10.28 $29.31 No Bid
Law Enforcement Maintenance - Rdale $23.34 $31.62 No Bid
BRATS Agency-Robertsdale $44.05 $45.00 $42.22
Silverill Barn & Maintenance Division $23.64 $36.23 $40.50
Parks Building- Silverhill $24.00 $34.04 $26.53
Foley Highway $39.98 $45.58 No Bid
Bay Minette Hwy $29.89 $34.39 No Bid

Note:







