

COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-14 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Motorgrader Blades

BIDDER: Tractor & Equipment Co., Inc.		
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 6" width	\$51.46 5/8 thick	No Bid 3/4 thick
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 8" width	No Bid 5/8 thick	\$62.20 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width	\$85.40 5/8 thick	No Bid 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 8" width	No Bid 5/8 thick	\$92.68 3/4 thick

BIDDER: Thompson Tractor Company, Inc.		
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 6" width	\$40.12 5/8 thick	No Bid 3/4 thick
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 8" width	\$56.45 5/8 thick	\$51.65 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width	\$47.70 5/8 thick	\$46.03 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 8" width	\$66.18 5/8 thick	\$65.60 3/4 thick

BIDDER: Valk Manufacturing Company		
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 6" width	\$48.00 5/8 thick	\$60.00 3/4 thick
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 8" width	\$71.00 5/8 thick	\$85.00 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width	\$56.00 5/8 thick	\$70.00 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 8" width	\$83.00 5/8 thick	\$99.80 3/4 thick

BIDDER: Winter Equipment Company, Inc.		
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 6" width	\$44.37 5/8 thick	\$53.30 3/4 thick
Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8 " or 3/4" 8" width	\$75.30 5/8 thick	\$62.57 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width	\$51.77 5/8 thick	\$62.18 3/4 thick
Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 8" width	\$73.00 5/8 thick	\$87.84 3/4 thick
Exceptions: Yes		

Exceptions:

Winter Equipment Company, Inc. exception of FOB Delivery Bay Minette, Silverhill, and Foley

Lead time is 35 days ARO rather than 30 calendar days.

A \$120 LTL Freight Charge applies to shipments under truckload weight to each location.

Minimum \$5,000 order value required for direct shipments.

Prices: Due to Steel tariffs, they can currently hold pricing for 3 months.