COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-18 BID TABULATION
Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories

BIDDER: Pinnacle Networx BIDDER: Floyd's Exhaust & Performance Truck Accessories, Inc.
GROUP #1 GROUP #1
Spray in Bedliners for Pickup Trucks Spray in Bedliners for Pickup Trucks
Model: Model: Spray in Bedliner
Amount Bid: No Bid Amount Bid: 5.5 ft. & 6.5 ft. $350.00 each
ECCO EW 3225 25" ECCO LED Bar 8 ft. $400.00 each
Model: Utility 6.5 ft. & 8 ft. $650.00 each
Amount Bid: No Bid ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED Bar
Better Built Sec 70" Deep Single LID Crossover 79010901 Model: ECO EW3225
Meodel: Amount Bid: $420.00 each
Amount Bid: No Bid Better Built Sec 70" Deep Single LID Crossover 79010901
Better Built Sec 72" Deep Single LID Crossover 79010902 Model: BBSEC 79010901
Model: Amount Bid: $379.00 each
Amount Bid: No Bid Better Built Sec 72" Deep Single LID Crossover 79010902
Rigid LED POD Light 50231 in Pairs Model: BBSEC 79010902
Model: Amount Bid: $379.00 each
Amount Bid: No Bid raigid LED POD Light 50231 in Pairs
Decked Lockable Truck Storage Full Bed Unit PAR DF-4 Tonneau Model: Rigid 502313
Model: Amount Bid: $350.00 each
Amount Bid: No Bid Decked Lockable Truck Storage full Bed Unit PAR DF-4 Tonneau
Trifold Non-Lockable; Black Model:
Model: Amount Bid: $1,249.00 each
Amount Bid: No Bid Trifold Non-Lockable; Black

Model: UX 22019

Amount Bid: $979.00 each
GROUP #2
RAM Computer Mounts GROUP #2
Model: 2019 Chevy Tahoe Police Interceptor RAM Computer Mounts
Amount Bid: $345.00 each includes shipping Model:
Model: 2019 Ford F150 Ford Responder Amount Bid: No Bid
Amount Bid: $245.00 each includes shipping Brother Pocketjet 762 in Car Printer with Bluetooth
Model: 2019 Ford Police Utility Model:
Amount Bid: $245.00 each includes shipping Amount Bid: No Bid
Brother Pocketlet 762 IN Car Printer with Bluetooth RAM Plastic Printer Mount
Model: Model:
Amount Bid: $430.00 each Amount Bid: No Bid
RAM Plastic Printer Mount |E-Seek M-260 Card Reader and Cable
Model: Model:
Amount Bid: $55.00 each Amount Bid: No Bid
E-Seek M-260 Card Reader and Cable Desktop FUJITSU F17030 or Current Model
Model: Model:
Amount Bid: $449.00 each Amount Bid: No Bid
Desktop FUNTSU F17030 or Current Model
Model:
Amount Bid: $725.00 each

Exception: Ram Computer Mounts delivery 90-120 days



