COMPETITIVE BID #WG18-08 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP DAILY AMOUNT

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump w/100ft. Suction
Hose & 200ft Discharge Hose

2 in Electric Submerge Pump w/200 ft. Hose

Mud Pump

12ft Wood Grinder w/Operator Powered by Diesel

Minimum Reach 27ft. w/Capabilities of lifting
5000 Ibs

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper or equal
Curtain Burner 30ft.
3500 Watt Honda Generator or equal

Diesel Powered Light Plants w/four 1000 watt
Metal Halide Flood Lights

285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Compressor
w/100 ft. of 1 in. Air Hoses or equal

Gas Powered Portable Welding Machine
Medium Duty

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forlift or equal
Scissor Lift 19’

Trencher

Trencher

Trencher

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

COMPANY NAME

Hydra Service
United Rentals

Robertsdale Rent All
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman Tractor Company

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman TractorCompany

Pittman Tractor Company
Cowin Equipment

Sunbelt Rentals
Robertsdale Rent All

Cowin Equipment
United Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor

Sunbelt Rentals

Thompson Tractor 4" SKST Attachment
Sunbelt Rentals 2" Walk Behind
Thompson Tractor 4'Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 3' Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 4' Ride On

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
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$525.00 Prime
$661.00 Secondary

$35.00 Prime
$50.00 Secondary

$75.00 Prime
$75.00 Secondary

$4,995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$350.00 Prime
$945.00 Secondary

$595.00 Prime
$693.00 Secondary

$38.00 Prime
$45.00 Secondary

$92.00 Prime
$103.00 Secondary

$198.00 Prime
$220.00 Secondary

$54.00 Prime
$115.00 Secondary

$220.00 Prime
$300.00 Secondary

$224.00 Prime
$234.00 Secondary

$108.00 Prime
$125.00 Secondary

$147.00 Prime
$148.00 Secondary

$165.00 Prime
$180.00 Secondary

$332.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime



COMPETITIVE BID #WG18-08 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP DAILY AMOUNT

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck -8' Long
24 CU YD with Barn Door Tailgate Boom
Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck or equal

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Volvo A25D-25 ton 6x6 Articulated Off Road
Truck or equal

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body
or equal

938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket
w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket or equal

CAT 966K Front End Loader or equal
CAT 963D Track Loader with multipurpose
bucket or equal

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/ high capacity
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal

CAT 336E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal

XL4100 Gradall or equal

CAT 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C
or equal w/ 60ft. reach

CAT 349 Long Reach Exvacator with A/C
or equao w/60 ft reach

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator)

CAT 12M Motor Grader or equal

CAT 12M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

COMPANY NAME
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor
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No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,900.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$340.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

6 yd
$596.00 Prime
$795.00 Secondary

$1,366.00 Prime
$1,495.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$495.00 Prime
$785.00 Secondary

$849.00 Prime
$985.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$499.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$945.00 Prime
$1,346.00 Secondary

$775.00 Prime
$1,152.00 Secondary

$695.00 Prime
$907.00 Secondary

$995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,395.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1.,403.00 Prime
$1,495.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$100.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,222.00 Prime
$1,295.00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG18-08 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP DAILY AMOUNT

CAT 140M Motor Grader or Equal

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade or equa

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal
CAT 416E Back Hoe or equal

CAT 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd capacity or equal
Pull Behind Tractor Scraper 6 cu. yd.

capacity or equal

4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 66 in. or equal

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 84 in. or equal

9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller

CAT CP44 Sheepfoot Roller w/blade or equal
CAT CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller

114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor

4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor w/6ft

Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach

CAT 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo)

73HP or equal

CAT 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp or equal
Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Loader
Angle Broom for Skid Steer Loader

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader

Forks for Skid Steer Loader

Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader

COMPANY NAME

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Thompson Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Robertsdale Rent All
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Robertsdale Rent All

Thompson Tractor
Robertsdale Rent All

Thompson Tractor
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Robertsdale Rent All

Cowin Equipment
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$995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,295.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$545.00 Prime
$897.00 Secondary

$545.00 Prime
$918.00 Secondary

$255.00 Prime
$285.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$795.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$345.00 Prime
$491.00 Secondary

$395.00 Prime
$624.00 Secondary

$693.00 Prime
$795.00 Secondary

$345.00 Prime
$491.00 Secondary

$495.00 Prime

No Bid Secondary

$172.00 Prime
$174.00 Secondary

$400.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$290.00 Prime
$300.00 Secondary

$230.00 Prime
$250.00 Secondary

$20.00 Prime
$29.00 Secondary

$75.00 Prime
$107.00 Secondary

$183.00 Prime
$260.00 Secondary

$45.00 Prime
$50.00 Secondary

$183.00 Prime



COMPETITIVE BID #WG18-08 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP DAILY AMOUNT

Tracks for Skid Steer Loader

Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader

Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader or equal

Portable Screening Plant

Milling Machine Writgen 2000 or equivalent

with Operators

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader or equal

CAT AP600D Asphalt Spreader or equal

CAT AP1000D Asphalt Spreader or equal

25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck

13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck

COMPANY NAME
Sunbelt Rentals

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$196.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$120.00 Prime
$132.00 Secondary

$350.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1.995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

Big Truck Rental, LLC 5001 W Leman St., Tamp: Company is not registered with Alabama Secretary of State as a Foreign Corporatior

Holland Pump - 599 Hancock Rd, Fairhope, AL 36532 - Company is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State

Hydra Service Inc. - 23304 McAuliffe Drive, Robertsdale, AL 36567

Kingline Equipment - 19425 State Hwy 59, Summerdale, AL 36580

Robertsdale Rent All Inc., 22463 State Hwy 59 S. Robertsdale, AL 36567

Pittman Tractor - P.O. Box 26, Montrose, AL 36559

Thompson Tractor - 1950 East I-65 Service Rd N., Mobile, AL 36617

United Rentals - 19862 Co. Rd 20, Foley, AL 36535

Sunbelt Rentals - 2341 Deerfield Drive, Fort Mill, SC 29715 - 5905 Rangeline Rd. Mobile, AL

Cowin Equipment Co. Inc. - 35 Schillinger Rd N., Mobile, AL 36608

Exceptions:

Big Truck Rental LLC - County shall be responsible for all damage

or loss arising from the County's abuse, misuse or neglect of the equipment rented.

Rental Rates for 1 Month shall be for a 4 week period, not 30 days.

Once the initial one month rental period is met, a prorated weekly rate of $1700.00

is available. The Delivered rate does not include a one-time round trip transportation
charge of $1500.00. The Picked-Up rate assumes Baldwin County will also return the truck
at the end of rental term.

Sunbelts Rentals, Inc. - Delivery: Delivery shall be as soon as possible butn no more
than Twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of order, providing that equipment is available.
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP WEEKLY AMOUNT

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump w/100ft. Suction
Hose & 200ft Discharge Hose

2 in Electric Submerge Pump w/200 ft. Hose

Mud Pump

12ft Wood Grinder w/Operator Powered by Diesel

Minimum Reach 27ft. w/Capabilities of lifting
5000 Ibs

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper or equal

Curtain Burner 30ft.

3500 Watt Honda Generator or equal

Diesel Powered Light Plants w/four 1000 watt

Metal Halide Flood Lights
285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Compressor
w/100 ft. of 1 in. Air Hoses or equal

Gas Powered Portable Welding Machine

Medium Duty

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift

Toyota Model 7TFGU25 Forlift or equal

Scissor Lift 19'

Trencher

Trencher

Trencher

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

COMPANY NAME

Hydra Service
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals

Pittman Tractor Company
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman TractorCompany

Pittman Tractor Company
Cowin Equipment

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Cowin Equipment
United Rentals

United Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor RTX 250
Thompson Tractor 4'SKST Attach
Thompson Tractor 4' Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 3' Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 4'Ride On

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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$1,575.00 Prime
$1.897.00 Secondary

$140.00 Prime
$150.00 Secondary

$198.00 Prime
$220.00 Secondary

$19,985.00 Prime

No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,050.00 Prime
$2,995.00 Secondary

$1,635.00 Prime
$1,836.00 Secondary

$104.00 Prime
$178.00 Secondary

$245.00 Prime
$268.00 Secondary

$475.00 Prime
$545.00 Secondary

$152.00 Prime
$275.00 Secondary

$520.00 Prime
$795.00 Secondary

$540.00 Prime
$609.00 Secondary

$210.00 Prime
$254.00 Secondary

$355.00 Prime
$394.00 Secondary

$420.00 Prime
$496.00 Secondary

$934.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP WEEKLY AMOUNT

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck -8' Long
24 CU YD with Barn Door Tailgate Boom
Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck or equal

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Volvo A25D-25 ton 6x6 Articulated Off Road
Truck or equal

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body
or equal

938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket
w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket or equal

CAT 966K Front End Loader or equal

CAT 963D Track Loader with multipurpose
bucket or equal

Bobhcat T870 Track Loader w/ high capacity
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal

CAT 336E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal

XL4100 Gradall or equal

CAT 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C
or equal w/ 80ft. reach

CAT 349 Long Reach Exvacator with A/C
or equac w/60 ft reach

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator)

CAT 12M Motor Grader or equal

CAT 12M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

COMPANY NAME

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals
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No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$7,900.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$4,995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$790.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,162.00 Prime
$2,995.00 Secondary

$3,300.00 Prime
$3,631.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,495.00 Prime
$1,920.00 Secondary

$2,079.00 Prime
$2,495.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,361.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,835.00 Prime
$3,590.00 Secendary

$2,325.00 Prime
$3,060.00 Secondary

$1,935.00 Prime
$2,317.00 Secondary

$1.935.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3,735.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3,528.00 Prime
$3,785.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$200.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,495.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,995.00 Prime
$3,047.00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -

Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP WEEKLY AMCUNT

CAT 140M Motor Grader or Equal

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

COMPANY NAM

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade or equa Pitiman Tractor

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal

CAT 416E Back Hoe or equal

CAT 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd capacity or equal

Pull Behind Tractor Scraper 6 cu. yd.

capacity or equal

4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 66 in. or equal

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 84 in. or equal

9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller

CAT CP44 Sheepfoot Roller w/blade or equal
CAT CP 74 Sheepfoot Raller or equal

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller

114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor

4 Whee! Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor w/6ft

Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach

CAT 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo)

73HP or equal

CAT 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp or equal

Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Loader

Angle Broom for Skid Steer Loader

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader

Forks for Skid Steer Loader

Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader

Cowin Equipment

Pittman Traclor
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Robertsdale Rent All
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Thompson Tractor
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Thompson Tractor

Robertsdale Rent All
Thompson Tractor

Cowin Equipment
Sunbelt Rentals
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E

=

$3,495.00 Prime
No Bid Secendary

$3.495.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,195.00 Prime
$2,448.00 Secondary

$1,985.00 Prime
$2,448.00 Secondary

$673.00 Prime
$695.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,195.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$945.00 Prime
$1,272.00 Secondary

$985.00 Prime
$1,594.00 Secondary

$1,495.00 Prime
$1,836.00 Secondary

$1,145.00 Prime
$1,272.00 Secondary

$1.245.00 Prime

No Bid Secondary

$395.00 Prime
$500.00 Secondary

$1,200.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$728.00 Prime
$785.00 Secondary

$620.00 Prime
$680.00 Secondary

$40.00 Prime
$86.00 Secondary

$204.00 Prime
$285.00 Secondary

$489.00 Prime
$655.00 Secondary

$75.00 Prime
$90.00 Secondary

$489.00 Prime
$598.00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -

Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP WEEKLY AMOUNT

Tracks for Skid Steer Loader

Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader

Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader or equal
Portable Screening Plant

Milling Machine Writgen 2000 or equivalent
with Operators

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader or equal
CAT APB00D Asphalt Spreader or equal
CAT AP1000D Asphalt Spreader or equal

25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck

13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck

COMPANY NAME

Ne Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
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No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$339.00 Prime
$489.00 Secondary

$930.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$4,995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,950.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP MONTHLY AMOUNT

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump w/100ft. Suction
Hose & 200ft Discharge Hose

2 in Electric Submerge Pump w/200 ft. Hose

Mud Pump

12ft Wood Grinder w/Operator Powered by Diesel

Minimum Reach 27ft. w/Capabilities of lifting
5000 Ibs

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper or equal

Curtain Burner 30ft.

3500 Watt Honda Generator or equal

Diesel Powered Light Plants w/four 1000 watt
Metal Halide Flood Lights

285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Compressor
w/100 ft. of 1 in. Air Hoses or equal

Gas Powered Portable Welding Machine

Medium Duty

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forlift or equal

Scissor Lift 19'

Trencher

Trencher

Trencher

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

COMPANY NAME

Hydra Service
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
Robertsdale Rent All

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman Tractor Company

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman TractorCompany

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals
Cowin Equipment

Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Cowin Equipment

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Retals

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Thompson Tractor 4'SKST Aftachment
Pittman Tractor RTX 250
Thompson Tractor 4' Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 3' Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 4' Ride On

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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$4,725.00 Prime
$4,898.00 Secondary

$205.00 Prime
$250.00 Secondary

$398.0C¢ Prime
$480.00 Secondary

$99,000.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3,040.00 Prime
$9,500.00 Secondary

$3,672.00 Prime
$4,950.00 Secondary

$268.00 Prime
$378.00 Secondary

$510.00 Prime
$605.00 Secondary

$1,035.00 Prime
$1,377.00 Secondary

$416.00 Prime
$510.00 Secondary

$1,470.00 Prime
$1,725.00 Secondary

$1,316.00 Prime
$1,486.00 Secondary

$380.00 Prime
$545.00 Secondary

$935.00 Prime
$985.00 Secondary

$991.00 Prime
$1,304.00 Secondary

$1,990.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP MONTHLY AMOUNT

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck -8' Long
24 CU YD with Barn Door Tailgate Boom
Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck or equal

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Volvo A25D-25 ton 6x6 Articulated Off Road
Truck or equal

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body
or equal

938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket
w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket or equal

CAT 966K Front End Loader or equal
CAT 963D Track Loader with multipurpose
bucket or equal

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/ high capacity
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal

CAT 336E Excavator wiThumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal

XL4100 Gradall or equal

CAT 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C
or equal w/ 60ft. reach

CAT 349 Long Reach Exvacator with A/C
or equao w/60 ft reach

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator)

CAT 12M Motor Grader or equal

CAT 12M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

COMPANY NAME

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Thompsen Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor
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6 yd

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$29,800.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,050.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$5,005.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$8,262.00 Prime
$8,495.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$4,295.00 Prime
$4,886.00 Secondary

$4,926.00 Prime
$5,895.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,852.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$7,495.00 Prime
$8,466.00 Secondary

$6,195.00 Prime
$7,038.00 Secondary

$5,304.00 Prime
$5,694.00 Secondary

$7,945.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$9,995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$9,293.00 Prime
$9,950.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$300.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$6,945.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$7,558.00 Prime
$7,945.00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -

Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP MONTHLY AMOUNT

CAT 140M Motor Grader or Equal

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade or equa

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal

CAT 416E Back Hoe or equal

CAT 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd capacity or equal

Pull Behind Tractor Scraper 6 cu. yd.

capacity or equal

4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 66 in. or equal

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/icompaction
width of 84 in. or equal

9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller

CAT CP44 Sheepfoot Roller w/blade or equal
CAT CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller

114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor

4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor w/6ft

Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach

CAT 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo)

73HP or equal

CAT 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp or equal

Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Loader

Angle Broom for Skid Steer Loader

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader

Forks for Skid Steer Loader

Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader

COMPANY NAME

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittiman Tractor
No Bid

Cowin Equipment
United Rentals

Cowin Eguipment
Pittman Tractor

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Kingline Equipment
Robertsdale Rent All

No Bid
No Bid

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Thompson Tractor
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Thompson Tractor

Robertsdale Rent All
Thompson Tractor

Cowin Equipment
United Rentals
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$7,245.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$7.545.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$4,998.00 Prime
$5,871.00 Secondary

$4,998.00 Prime
$5,845.00 Secondary

$1,377.00 Prime
$1,495.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,950.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,795.00 Prime
$3,029.00 Secondary

$3,495.00 Prime
$3,594.00 Secondary

$3,945.00 Prime
$4,590.00 Secondary

$2,745.00 Prime
$3,029.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,145.00 Prime
$3,450.00 Secondary

$2,300.00 Prime
$2,500.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,760.00 Prime
$1,807.50 Secondary

$1,320.00 Prime
$1,436.00 Secondary

$60.00 Prime
$171.00 Secondary

$540.00 Prime
$612.00 Secondary

$1,224.00 Prime
$1,530.00 Secondary

$160.00 Prime
$205.00 Secondary

$1,224.00 Prime
$1,349.00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -

Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
PICKED-UP MONTHLY AMOUNT

Tracks for Skid Steer Loader

Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader

Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader or equal
Portable Screening Plant

Milling Machine Writgen 2000 or equivalent
with Operators

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader or equal
CAT AP600D Asphalt Spreader or equal
CAT AP1000D Asphalt Spreader or equal

25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck

13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck

COMPANY NAME

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Thompsaon Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Na Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$995.00 Prime
$1,051.00 Secondary

$2,385.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$13,995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$8,950.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

Big Truck Rental, LLC 5001 W Lemon St., Tamp: Company is not registered with Alabama Secretary of State as a Foreign Corpaoratior

Holland Pump - 599 Hancock Rd, Fairhope, AL 36532 - Company is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State

Hydra Service Inc. - 23304 McAuliffe Drive, Robertsdale, AL 36567

Kingline Equipment - 19425 State Hwy 59, Summerdale, AL 36580

Robertsdale Rent All Inc., 22463 State Hwy 59 S. Robertsdale, AL 36567

Pittman Tractor - P.O. Box 26, Montrose, AL 36559

Thompson Tractor - 1950 East |-65 Service Rd N., Mobile, AL 36617

United Rentals - 19862 Co. Rd 20, Foley, AL 36535

Sunbelt Rentals - 2341 Deerfield Drive, Fort Mill, SC 29715 - 5905 Rangeline Rd. Mobile, AL

Cowin Equipment Co. Inc. - 35 Schillinger Rd N., Mobile, AL 36608

Exceptions:

Big Truck Rental LLC - County shall be responsible for all damage

or loss arising from the County's abuse, misuse or neglect of the equipment rented.

Rental Rates for 1 Month shall be for a 4 week period, not 30 days.

Once the initial one month rental period is met, a prorated weekly rate of $1700.00

is available. The Delivered rate does not include a one-time round trip transportation
charge of $1500.00. The Picked-Up rate assumes Baldwin County will also return the truck
at the end of rental term.

Sunbelts Rentals, Inc. - Delivery: Delivery shall be as soon as possible butn no more
than Twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of order, providing that equipment is available.
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED DAILY AMOUNT

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump w/100ft. Suction
Hose & 200ft Discharge Hose

2 in Electric Submerge Pump w/200 ft. Hose

Mud Pump

COMPANY NAME

Hydra Service
United Rentals

Hydra Service Inc.
Sunbelt Rentals

Hydra Service Inc.
Sunbelt Rentals

12ft Wood Grinder w/Operator Powered by Diesel

Minimum Reach 27ft. w/Capabilities of lifting
5000 Ibs

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper or equal

Curtain Burner 30ft.

3500 Watt Honda Generator or equal

Diesel Powered Light Plants w/four 1000 watt

Metal Halide Flood Lights

285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Compressor
w/100 ft. of 1 in. Air Hoses or equal

Gas Powered Portable Welding Machine

Medium Duty

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forlift or equal

Scissor Lift 19'

Trencher

Trencher

Trencher

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Pittman Tractor Company
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman TractorCompany

Pittman Tractor Company
Cowin Equipment

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompsoen Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Robertsdale Rent All 4'

Sunbelt Rentals 2' Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 3' Walk Behind
Thompson Tractor 4*Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 4' Ride On

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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$725.00 Prime
$861.00 Secondary

$140.00 Prime
$200.00 Secondary

$140.00 Prime
$225.00 Secondary

$5.495.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$500.00 Prime
$1.145.00 Secondary

$795.00 Prime
$1.093.00 Secondary

$188.00 Prime
$256.00 Secondary

$278.00 Prime
$§303.00 Secondary

$370.00 Prime
$398.00 Secendary

$204.00 Prime
$325.00 Secondary

$430.00 Prime
$450.00 Secondary

$424.00 Prime
$434.00 Secondary

$318.00 Prime
$325.00 Secondary

$225.00 Prime
$298.00 Secondary

$330.00 Prime
$375.00 Secondary

$532.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -

Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED DAILY AMOUNT

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck -8' Long

24 CU YD with Barn Door Tailgate Boom
Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck or equal

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Truck
orequal

Volvo A25D-25 ton 6x6 Articulated Off Road
Truck or equal

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body
orequal

838K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket
w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket or equal

CAT 966K Front End Loader or equal

CAT 963D Track Loader with multipurpose
bucket or equal

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/ high capacity
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal

CAT 336E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal
XL4100 Gradall or equal
CAT 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C

or equal w/ 60ft. reach

CAT 349 Long Reach Exvacator with A/C
or equao w/60 ft reach

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator)
CAT 12M Moter Grader or equal
CAT 12M Motor Grader with Front Blade

or equal

CAT 140M Motor Grader or Equal

COMPANY NAME
No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Thompson Tractor 6yd
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Ne Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Cowin Equipment
United Rentals

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tracter

Pittman Tractor
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No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,250.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,085.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$550.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$796.00 Prime
$895.00 Secendary

$1,866.00 Prime
$1,895.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$895.00 Prime
$1,035.00 Secondary

$1,099.00 Prime
$1,285.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$649.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,645.00 Prime
$1,846.00 Secondary

$1,445.00 Prime
$1,652.00 Secondary

$1,279.00 Prime
$1,295.00 Secondary

$1.495.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,945.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2.111.00 Prime
§2.203.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$200.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,295.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,622.00 Prime
$1,695.00 Secondary

$1.495.00 Prime



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED DAILY AMOUNT

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

COMPANY NAME

No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade or equa Pittman Tractor

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal

CAT 416E Back Hoe or equal

CAT 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd capacity or equal

Pull Behind Tractor Scraper 6 cu. yd.

capacity or equal

4 - 8 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 66 in. or equal

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 84 in. or equal

9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller

CAT CP44 Sheepfoot Roller w/blade or equal
CAT CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller

114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor

4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor w/6ft

Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach

CAT 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo)

73HP or equal

CAT 2268 Skid Steer Loader 59 hp or equal

Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Loader

Angle Broom for Skid Steer Loader

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader

Forks for Skid Steer Loader

Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader

United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals
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No Bid Secondary

$1,695.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1.045.00 Prime
$1,297.00 Secondary

$1,015.00 Prime
$1,418.00 Secondary

$495.00 Prime
$496.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,395.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$625.00 Prime
$741.00 Secondary

$695.00 Prime
$874.00 Secondary

$1,193.00 Prime
$1,295.00 Secondary

$619.00 Prime
$741.00 Secondary

$714.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$322.00 Prime
$364.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secendary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$490.00 Prime
$520.00 Secondary

$440.00 Prime
$452.00 Secondary

$229.00 Prime
$240.00 Secondary

$225.00 Prime
$340.00 Secondary

$410.00 Prime
$470.00 Secondary

$195.00 Prime
$257.00 Secondary

$346.00 Prime
$435,00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20

DELIVERED DAILY AMOUNT COMPANY NAME
Tracks for Skid Steer Loader No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Sunbelt Rentals $270.00 Prime

Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader or equal

Portable Screening Plant

United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor

$332.00 Secondary

$560.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,995.00 Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
Milling Machine Writgen 2000 or equivalent No Bid Ne Bid Prime
with Operators No Bid No Bid Secondary

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader or equal

Pittman Tracter

$1.250.00 Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
CAT AP800D Asphalt Spreader or equal No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
CAT AP1000D Asphalt Spreader or equal Ne Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary

Big Truck Rental, LLC 5001 W Lemon St., Tamp: Company is not registered with Alabama Secretary of State as a Foreign Corporatio

Holland Pump - 599 Hancock Rd, Fairhope, AL 36532 - Company is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State.

Hydra Service Inc. - 23304 McAuliffe Drive, Robertsdale, AL 36567

Kingline Equipment - 19425 State Hwy 59, Summerdale, AL 36580

Robertsdale Rent All Inc., 22463 State Hwy 59 S. Robertsdale, AL 36567

Pittman Tractor - P.O. Box 26, Montrose, AL 36559

Thompson Tractor - 1950 East I-65 Service Rd N., Mobile, AL 36617

United Rentals - 19862 Co. Rd 20, Foley, AL 36535

Sunbelt Rentals - 2341 Deerfield Drive, Fort Mill, SC 29715 - 5905 Rangeline Rd. Mobile, AL

Cowin Equipment Co. Inc. - 35 Schillinger Rd N., Mobile, AL 36608

Exceptions:

Big Truck Rental LLC - County shall be responsible for all damage

or loss arising from the County's abuse, misuse or neglect of the equipment rented.

Rental Rates for 1 Menth shall be for a 4 week period, not 30 days.

Once the initial one month rental period is met, a prorated weekly rate of $1700.00

is available. The Delivered rate does not include a one-time round trip transportation
charge of $1500.00. The Picked-Up rate assumes Baldwin County will also return the truck
at the end of rental term.

Sunbelts Rentals, Inc. - Delivery: Delivery shall be as soon as possible butn no more
than Twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of order, providing that equipment is available.
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED WEEKLY AMOUNT

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump w/100ft. Suction
Hose & 200ft Discharge Hose

2 in Electric Submerge Pump w/200 ft. Hose

Mud Pump

COMPANY NAME

Hydra Service
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Hydra Service Inc.

Hydra Service Inc.
Sunbelt Rentals

12ft Wood Grinder w/Operator Powered by Diesel

Minimum Reach 27ft. w/Capabilities of lifting
5000 Ibs

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper or equal

Curtain Burner 30ft.

3500 Watt Honda Generator or equal

Diesel Powered Light Plants w/four 1000 watt

Metai Halide Fiood Lights

285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Compressor
w/100 ft. of 1 in. Air Hoses or equal

Gas Powered Portable Welding Machine

Medium Duty

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forlift or equal

Scissor Lift 19'

Trencher

Trencher

Trencher

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Pittman Tractor Company
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman TractorCompany

Pittman Tractor Company
Cowin Equipment

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment

United Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor RTX250
Sunbelt Rentals 2' Walk Behind
Thompson Tractor 4' Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 3" Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 4' Ride On

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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$1,775.00 Prime
$2,097.00 Secondary

$300.00 Prime
$320.00 Secondary

$320.00 Prime
$370.00 Secondary

$21,495.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secendary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,200.00 Prime
$3,450.00 Secondary

$1,950.00 Prime
$2,236.00 Secondary

$254.00 Prime
$378.00 Secendary

$534.00 Prime
$545.00 Secondary

$675.00 Prime
$755.00 Secondary

$302.00 Prime
$485,00 Secondary

$730.00 Prime
$945,00 Secondary

$740.00 Prime
$809.00 Secondary

$420.00 Prime
$454.00 Secondary

$495.00 Prime
$566.00 Secondary

$630.00 Prime
$646.00 Secondary

$1,134.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -

Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED WEEKLY AMOUNT
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck -8' Long

24 CU YD with Barn Door Tailgate Boom
Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck or equal

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Volvo A25D-25 ton 6x8 Articulated Off Road
Truck or equal

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body
or equal

938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket
w/2.5 cu, yd. multipurpose Bucket or equal

CAT 966K Front End Loader or equal
CAT 963D Track Loader with multipurpose
bucket or equal

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/ high capacity
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal

CAT 336E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal
XL4100 Gradall or equal
CAT 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C

or equal w/ 60ft. reach

CAT 349 Long Reach Exvacator with A/C
or equao w/60 ftreach

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator)
CAT 12M Motor Grader or equal
CAT 12M Motor Grader with Front Blade

or equal

CAT 140M Motor Grader or Equal

COMPANY NAME

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tracter
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

No Bid
No Bid

Pitirnan Tractor
United Rentals

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittrman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor

6 yd
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No Bid Prime
Ne Bid Secendary

$8,100.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$5.295.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,000.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,362.00 Prime
$3,295.00 Secondary

$3,900.00 Prime
$4,131.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,995.00 Prime
$2,170.00 Secondary

$2,329.00 Prime
$2,995.00 Secendary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,611.00 Prime
No Bid Secendary

$3,335.00 Prime
$4,090.00 Secondary

$2,945.00 Prime
$3,560.00 Secondary

$2,325.00 Prime
$2,567.00 Secondary

$3.385.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$4.235.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$4,328.00 Prime
$4,450.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$300.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2.995.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3.447.00 Prime
$3,495.00 Secondary

$3.945.00 Prime



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED WEEKLY AMOUNT

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

COMPANY NAME
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade or equa Pittman Tractor

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal

CAT 416E Back Hoe or equal

CAT 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd capacity or equal

Pull Behind Tractor Scraper 6 cu. yd.

capacity or equal

4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 66 in. or equal

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 84 in. or equal

9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller

CAT CP44 Sheepfoot Roller w/blade or equal
CAT CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller

114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor

4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor w/6ft

Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach

CAT 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo)

73HP or equal

CAT 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp or equal

Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Loader

Angle Broom for Skid Steer Loader

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader

Forks for Skid Steer Loader

Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader

Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Thompson Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompsaon Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunkbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Cowin Equipment
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment
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No Bid Secondary

$4,295.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,485.00 Prime
$2.948.00 Secondary

$2,455.00 Prime
$2,948.00 Secondary

$919.00 Prime
$930.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,645.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1.145.00 Prime
$1,527.00 Secondary

$1,295.00 Prime
$1,844.00 Secondary

$2.195.00 Prime
$2.336.00 Secondary

$1.345.00 Prime
$1,527.00 Secondary

$1,545.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$650.00 Prime
$675.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$928.00 Prime
$995.00 Secondary

$830.00 Prime
$880.00 Secondary

$286.00 Prime
$345.00 Secondary

$354.00 Prime
$565.00 Secondary

$789.00 Prime
$834.00 Secondary

$270.00 Prime
$386.00 Secondary

$748.00 Prime
$789.00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20

DELIVERED WEEKLY AMOUNT COMPANY NAME
Tracks for Skid Steer Loader No Bid No Bid Prime
No Bid No Bid Secondary

Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader

Sunbelt Rentals

$489.00 Prime

Pittman Tractor $695.00 Secondary
Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader or equal Thompson Tractor $1,140.00 Prime
No Bid No Bid Secondary

Portable Screening Plant

Pittman Tractor

$5.995.00 Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
Milling Machine Writgen 2000 or equivalent No Bid No Bid Prime
with Operators No Bid No Bid Secondary

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader or equal

Pittman Tractor

$3,650.00 Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
CAT AP600D Asphalt Spreader or equal No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
CAT AP1000D Asphalt Spreader or equal No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary

Big Truck Rental, LLC 5001 W Lemon St., Tamp:Company is not registered with Alabama Secretary of State as a Foreign Corporatio

Holland Pump - 599 Hancock Rd, Fairhope, AL 36532 - Company is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State

Hydra Service Inc. - 23304 McAuliffe Drive, Robertsdale, AL 36567

Kingline Equipment - 19425 State Hwy 59, Summerdale, AL 36580

Robertsdale Rent All Inc., 22463 State Hwy 59 S. Robertsdale, AL 36567

Pittman Tractor - P.O. Box 26, Montrose, AL 36559

Thompson Tracter - 1950 East I-65 Service Rd N., Mabile, AL 36617

United Rentals -19862 Co. Rd 20, Foley, AL 36535

Sunbelt Rentals - 2341 Deerfield Drive, Fort Mill, SC 29715 - 5905 Rangeline Rd. Mobile, AL

Cowin Equipment Co. Inc. - 35 Schillinger Rd N., Mobile, AL 36608

Exceptions:

Big Truck Rental LLC - County shall be responsible for all damage

or loss arising from the County's abuse, misuse or neglect of the equipment rented.

Rental Rates for 1 Month shall be for a 4 week period, not 30 days.

Once the initial one month rental period is met, a prorated weekly rate of $1700.00

is available. The Delivered rate does not include a one-time round trip transportation
charge of $1500.00. The Picked-Up rate assumes Baldwin County will also return the truck
at the end of rental term.

Sunbelts Rentals, Inc. - Delivery: Delivery shall be as soon as possible butn no more
than Twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of order, providing that equipment is available.
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED MONTHLY AMOUNT

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump w/100ft. Suction
Hose & 200ft Discharge Hose

2 in Electric Submerge Pump w/200 ft. Hose

Mud Pump

COMPANY NAME

Hydra Service
United Rentals

Thompson Tracior
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals

12ft Wood Grinder w/Operator Powered by Diesel

Minimum Reach 27ft. w/Capabilities of lifting
5000 Ibs

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Tub Grinder

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper or equal

Curtain Burner 30ft.

3500 Watt Honda Generatoer or equal

Diesel Powered Light Plants w/four 1000 watt

Metal Halide Fiood Lighis

285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Compressor
w/100 ft. of 1 in. Air Hoses or equal

Gas Powered Portable Welding Machine

Medium Duty

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forlift or equal

Scissor Lift 18'

Trencher

Trencher

Trencher

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Pittman Tractor Company
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman TractorCompany

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals 2' Walk Behind
Pittman Tractor RTX250
Thompson Tractor 4" Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 3" Walk Behind
Sunbelt Rentals 4' Ride On

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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$4.925.00 Secondary
$5,098.00 Secondary

$415.00 Prime
$450.00 Secondary

$598.00 Prime
$630.00 Secondary

$102,500.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3,190.00 Prime
$10,300.C0 Secondary

$4,072.00 Prime
$5,450.00 Secondary

$418.00 Prime
$578.00 Secondary

§755.00 Prime
$810.00 Secondary

$1,235.00 Prime
$1,560.00 Secondary

$566.00 Prime
$720.00 Secondary

$1.680.00 Prime
$1,875.00 Secondary

$1,516.00 Prime
$1,668.00 Secondary

$590.00 Prime
$745.00 Secondary

$1,138.00 Prime
$1,145.00 Secondary

$1.201.00 Prime
$1,454.00 Secondary

$2,190.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -

Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED MONTHLY AMOUNT
Horizontal Directional Boring Machine

Diesel Powered Knuckle Bcom Truck -8' Long

24 CU YD with Barn Door Tailgate Boom
Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck or equal

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Truck
or equal

Volvo A25D-25 ton 6x6 Articulated Off Road
Truck or equal

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body
or equal

938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket
w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket or equal

CAT 966K Front End Loader or equal
CAT 963D Track Loader with multipurpose
bucket or equal

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/ high capacity
Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal

CAT 336E Excavatorw/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C
or equal

CAT 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal
XL4100 Gradall or equal
CAT 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C

or equal w/ 60ft. reach

CAT 349 Long Reach Exvacator with A/C
or equao w/60 ft reach

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator)
CAT 12M Motor Grader or equal
CAT 12M Motor Grader with Front Blade

or equal

CAT 140M Motor Grader or Equal

COMPANY NAME

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tracter
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

United Rentals
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor

6 yd

Page 2 of 4

Ne Bid Priime
No Bid Secondary

$29,900.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$2,260.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$5,205.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$8,762.00 Prime
$8,995.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$4,895.00 Prime
$5,136.00 Secondary

$5,176.00 Prime
$6,445.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3,102.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$8,195.00 Prime
$8.,966.00 Secondary

$6,795.00 Prime
$7.538.00 Secondary

$5.804.00 Prime
$6,145.00 Secondary

$8,900.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$10.495.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$10,093.00 Prime
$10,950.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$400.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$7,445.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$7,998.00 Prime
$8.445.00 Secondary

$7,745.00 Prime



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20
DELIVERED MONTHLY AMOUNT

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Blade
or equal

COMPANY NAME

No Bid

Pittman Tracter
No Bid

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade or equa Cowin Equipment

CAT D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal

CAT 416E Back Hoe or equal

CAT 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd capacity or equal

Pull Behind Tractor Scraper 6 cu. yd.

capacity or equal

4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Reller w/compaction
width of 66 in. or equal

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction
width of 84 in. or equal

9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller

CAT CP44 Sheepfoot Roller w/blade or equal
CAT CP 74 Sheepfaot Roller or equal

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller

114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor

4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor w/6ft

Mower Deck 23 fi. boom reach

CAT 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo)

73HP or equal

CAT 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp or equal

Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Loader

Angle Broom for Skid Steer Loader

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader

Forks for Skid Steer Loader

Hydraulic Hammer for Skid Steer Loader

Pittman Tractor

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

Cowin Equipment
Pittman Tractor

No Bid
No Bid

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

United Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
Cowin Equipment

Pittman Tractor
United Rentals

Pittman Tractor
No Bid

Sunbelt Rentals
Pittman Tractor

Kingline Equipment
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

Thompson Tractor
Sunbelt Rentals

United Rentals
Sunbelt Rentals

Sunbelt Rentals
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Thompson Tractor

Kingline Equipment
Sunbelt Rentals

Cowin Equipment
United Rentals
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No Bid Secondary

$7,945.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$5,458.00 Prime
$6,145.00 Secondary

$5,498.00 Prime
$6,095.00 Secondary

$1,777.00 Prime
$1,785.00 Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3,350.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$3.279.00 Prime
$3,395.00 Secondary

$3,795.00 Prime
$3,844.00 Secondary

$4,435.00 Prime
$5,090.00 Secondary

$3,145.00 Prime
$3,279.00 Secondary

$3,945.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,295.00 Prime
$1,295.00 Secondary

$2,600.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

No Bid Prime
No Bid Secondary

$1,970.00 Prime
$2.007.50 Secondary

$1,530.00 Prime
$1,636.00 Secondary

$371.00 Prime
$645.00 Secondary

$690.00 Prime
$912.00 Secondary

$1,524.00 Prime
$1.740.00 Secondary

$210.00 Prime
$466,00 Secondary

$1.524.00 Prime
$1,549.00 Secondary



COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-20 AWARD LISTING

RENTAL EQUIPMENT -
Effective Date: 02/19/19 through 02/19/20

DELIVERED MONTHLY AMOUNT COMPANY NAME
Tracks for Skid Steer Loader No Bid No Bid Prime
No Bid No Bid Secondary

Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader

Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader or equal

Sunbelt Rentals
United Rentals

Thompson Tractor
No Bid

$1,145.00 Prime
$1.251.00 Secondary

$2,595.00 Prime
No Bid Secondary

Portable Screening Plant Pittman Tractor $14,795.00 Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
Milling Machine Writgen 2000 or equivalent No Bid No Bid Prime
with Operators No Bid No Bid Secondary

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader or equal

Pittman Tractor

$9,450.00 Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
CAT AP600D Asphalt Spreader or equal No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
CAT AP1000D Asphalt Spreader or equal No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secondary
13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck No Bid No Bid Prime

No Bid No Bid Secendary

Big Truck Rental, LLC 5001 W Lemon St., Tamp:i Company is not registered with Alabama Secretary of State as a Foreign Corporatio

Holland Pump - 599 Hancock Rd, Fairhope, AL 36532 - Company is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State.

Hydra Service Inc. - 23304 McAuliffe Drive, Robertsdale, AL 36567

Kingline Equipment - 19425 State Hwy 59, Summerdale, AL 36580

Robertsdale Rent All Inc., 22463 State Hwy 59 S. Robertsdale, AL 36567

Pittman Tractor - P.O. Box 26, Montrose, AL 36559

Thompsen Tractor - 1950 East I-65 Service Rd N., Moebile, AL 36617

United Rentals - 19862 Co. Rd 20, Foley, AL 36535

Sunbelt Rentals - 2341 Deerfield Drive, Fort Mill, SC 29715 - 5905 Rangeline Rd. Mobile, AL

Cowin Equipment Co. Inc, - 35 Schillinger Rd N., Mobile, AL 36608

Exceptions:

Big Truck Rental LLC - County shall be responsible for all damage

or loss arising from the County's abuse, misuse or neglect of the equipment rented.

Rental Rates for 1 Month shall be for a 4 week period, not 30 days.

Once the initial one month rental period is met, a prorated weekly rate of $1700.00

is available. The Delivered rate does not include a one-time round trip transportation
charge of $1500.00. The Picked-Up rate assumes Baldwin County will also return the truck
at the end of rental term.

Sunbelts Rentals, Inc. - Delivery: Delivery shall be as soon as possible butn no more
than Twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of order, providing that equipment is available.
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