BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 1 (2/12/2019)
Indexed Asphalt Cost: Ammons & Blackmon Mobile Asphalt
Alternate 1A Five Roads - All Labor and Materials Contractor Will Collect, Retain, and Haul Off All Milled Material N/A Total NO BID Total NO BID
Alternate 1B - Five Roads - All Labor and Materials Baldwin County Will Collect, Retain, and Haul Off All Milled Material | N/A Total NO BID Total NO BID
[Alternate 2A - Five Roads - County will Provide Asphalt Contractor Will Collect, Retain, and Haul Off All Milled Material I S 1,150,095.01 jLay Down: S 353,328.05 fLay Down: S 394,059.43
TOTAL S 1,503,423.06 JTOTAL S 1,544,154.44
|Alternate 2B Five Roads - County will Provide Asphalt Baldwin County Will Collect, Retain, and Haul Off All Milled Material I S 1,150,095.01 |Lay Down: S 586,840.25 |Lay Down: S 440,951.03
TOTAL S 1,736,935.26 |TOTAL S 1,591,046.04
Addendum 1 Yes Yes
Bid Bond Included Yes Yes
Contract Included Yes Yes
Alternate 2A (Lay Down Only)] S 353,328.05 |Total with County supplied asphalt: $1,503,423.06
ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:
|, JOEY NUNNALLY, ., COUNTY ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE .

\ LV/XVIL i
oeyi Nunnally, P.E. ate



Alternate 1 - FIVE ROADS - ALL LABOR AND MATERIALS

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |[TACK COAT GALLON 502 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid
701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 3 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid
701A-011 |[BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {S" WIDE) MILE 1 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid

AT CR-47 FROM US HWY-31| 701A-016 [SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 NQ BID No Bid No Bid No Bid
TO CR-61 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid

701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid

703A-002 [TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 195 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid

703D-001 [TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 195 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid

BC-723  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1490 | NOBID No Bid No Bid No Bid

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 437 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

_—_ CR-61FROM CR-47TO | 701A-016 |SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5" WIDE) MILE 2 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID
COLEMAN RD 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

703A-002 |TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

703D-001 |TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 80 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID

BC-723  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 721 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 183 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

0203319 F;E((:)Kn; ;Ir?- ;/;P:grz::ou 703A-002 |TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
703D-001 |TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-723  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 302 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROIECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 616 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701A-011 |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BRADY RD EXT FROM 701A-016 |SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
0203419 PINE GROVE RD TO 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NICHOLSVILLE RD 701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
703A-002 |TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 104 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
703D-001 |TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 104 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-723  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1016 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATE 1A - CONTRACTOR WILL COLLECT, RETAIN, AND HAUL OFF ALL MILLED MATERIAL

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 8648 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID




PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0"
408A-052 TR (BLAKE 159 SQUARE YARDS 172972 JR5SiS NOED NOIin KO BID
410H-000 |MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER,
424p-280 [, TON 14270
/2" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE E NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
0203119 CR-112 FROM CR-64 TO | 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PHILLIPSMILLE BD. 701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 26 |noBiD no BID nO BID nO BID
701A-011 |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701A-016 |SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
a2ap286 | SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, - -
LEVELING 1/2" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE E NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1A Total NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATE 1B - BALDWIN COUNTY WILL COLLECT, RETAIN, AND HAUL OFF ALL MILLED MATERIAL
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION uNIT Qary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 8648 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0"
408A-052 THICK) (PLANE 1.57) SQUARE YARDS 172972 | N5%80 NonD NOBD NO BID
410H-000 |MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER
424A-280 * : TON 7
1/2" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE E ° 14270 I noBiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
0203115 CR-112 FROM CR-64 TO | B600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PHILLIPSVILLE RD 701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701A-011 |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701A-016 |[SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701C-002 [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER
424A-286 ’ NO BID NO BID NO BID
LEVELING 1/2" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE E T - NoOZD
1B Total NO BID NO BID




ALTERNATE 2 - FIVE ROADS - ALL LABOR AND MATERIALS EXCEPT COUNTY PROVIDED ASPHALT AS NOTED BY *

Ammons & Blackmon

Mobile Asphalt

PROJECTNO.| ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 902 S 400 s 3,608.00 | $ 4503 4,059.00
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 620.00 | $ 620.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5" WIDE) MILE 3 S 797501 S 2,392500 S 775.00 | S 2,325.00
701A-011 |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE i} s 368.50 | $ 36850 $ 360.00 | $ 360.00
Sa630i8 CR-47 FROMUS | 701A-016 |SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 797.50 | 1,595.00 | $ 775.00 | $ 1.550.00
HWY-31TO CR-61 | 701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE 1 $ 71500 | ¢ 715.00 ) $ 700.00 | $ 700.00
701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE ¥ $ 748.00 | $ 1,496.00 | $ 730.00 | $ 1,460.00
703A-002 |TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 195 $ 550 $ 1,072.50 | $ 535 1,043.25
703D-001 |TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 195 S 2203 429.00 | $ 21510 % 419.25
BC-723*  [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1490 | $ 6.30 | $ 9,387.00 | $ 16.25 | $ 24,212.50

PROJECTNO.| ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 437 $ 400]$ 1,748.00 | $ 450 % 1,966.50
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 S 535.00 | $ 535,00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00
701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 797.50 | $ 1,595.00{ $ 775.00 | $ 1,550.00
0203219 | CR-61FROM CR47 | 701A-016 SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 S 797.50 | 5 159500 5 775.00 | S 1.550.00
TO COLEMANRD | 701C-003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 S 748.00 | $ 1,496.00 | $ 730.00 | $ 1,460.00
703A-002 [TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 80 $ 550 $ 440.00 | $ 535S 428.00
703D-001 |TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 80 $ 220 ¢ 176.00 | $ 215 172.00
BC-723*  [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 721 5 875|$ 6,308.75 $ 13.30| ¢ 9,589.30

PROJECTNO.| ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 183 $ 400 | $ 732.00] $ 450§ 823.50
PECK THOMPSON 600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 S 450.00 | S 450.00 | S 850.00 | § 850.00
0203319 | RDFROMSR-59TO| 703A-002 |TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 18 $ 550 $ 99.00 | $ 535|$ 96.30
END 703D-001 |TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 18 $ 2201 3960 215 38.70
BC-723*  [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 302 s 16.75 | $ 5,058.50 § $ 23.00}% 6,946.00

PROJECTNO.| ROAD NAME ITEMNO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 616 $ 4003 2,464.00 ] $ 4508 2,772.00
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM A $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
701A-007 |SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 797.50 | $ 1,595.00{ $ 775.00 | $ 1,550.00
BRADYRD BT 701A-011 |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 N 368.50 | & 36850 $ 360.00 | $ 360.00
0203410 | FROMPINEGROVE | 701A-016 |SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 3 $ 79750 | § 2,39250 | ¢ 77500 | $ 2.325.00
RDTO 701C-002 [BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 $ 71500 } $ 715.00 f & 700.00 | $ 700.00
NICHOLSVILLERD 1™261¢.003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 $ 748.00 | $ 2,244.00 | $ 730.00 | $ 2,190.00
703A-002 |TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 104 3 550 $ 572.00 | $ 535 (% 556.40
703D-001 |TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 104 $ 220108 22880 $ 215 (s 223.60
BC-723*  |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1016 |$ 6501 $ 6,604.00 | $ 8.00|$ 8,128.00
BC-900  |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 14 $ 11000 | $ 1,540.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 210.00

ALTERNATE 2A - CONTRACTOR WILL COLLECT, RETAIN, AND HAUL OFF ALL MILLED MATERIAL

PROJECTNO.| ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT QTy UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 8648 | 4001}5S 34,592.00 ] ¢ 4501 s 38,916.00




PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0"
A08A-052 T SQUARE YARDS 172972 | ¢ 045 | 8 77,837.40| s 0211% 36,324.12
410H-000 |MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 S 14,270.00 | § 14,270.00 | & 00115 0.01
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER
424A-280* ’ TON 14270
1/2" MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE E 5 575 (5 82,052.50 | $ 85015 121,295.00
- g 30,000.00
CR-112 FROM CR-64|__800A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 3,560.00 | $ 3,560.00 | § 30,000.00 | $
RD 701A-011 |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 14 $ 368.50 | S 5,159.00 | 5 360.00 | $ 5,040.00
701A-016 |SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 12 5 797.50 | $ 9,570.00 § & 775.00 | ¢ 9,300.00
701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 28 $ 715.00 | $ 20,020.001 $ 700.00 | 5 19,600.00
701C-003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 24 $ 748.00 | $ 17,952.00 ] $ 73000 | $ 17,520.00
PER NCRETE IN
B e o S WEMERING | oy | o
! S 12.60 | 5 6,300.00 | $ 15.00 | § 7,500.00
2A Total $ 353,328.05 $ 394,059.43
ALTERNATE 2B - BALDWIN COUNTY WILL COLLECT, RETAIN, AND HAUL OFF ALL MILLED MATERIAL
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
405A-000 |TACK COAT GALLON 8648 $ 4.00|S 34,592.00 | $ 450 % 38,916.00
PLANING EXISTING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0"
A0BA052 L -0 (PLANE 15°) SUUAREYARLS | 272572 [ 180 | $ 311,349.60 | $ 051 88,215.72
410H-000 |MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 14,270.00 | § 14,270.00 ) § 0.01]% 0.01
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 1/2"
424A-280* ¢ TON 14270
MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE E 42 S 575| % 82,052.50 | $ 8503 121,295.00
z ] ] 25,000.00 25,000.00
CR-112 FROM CR-64|__600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 3,560.00 | § 3,560.00 | $ 5,00 S
0203119 TO PHILLIPSVILLE 701A-007 |[SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 26 S 797.50 | & 20,735.00 | $ 775.001 % 20,150.00
RD 701A-011 |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIiDE} MILE 14 4 36850 | $ 5,159.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 5,040.00
701A-016 |[SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 12 $ 79750 | $ 9,570.00 ] 5 775.00 | § 9,300.00
701C-002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 28 $ 715.00 | § 20,020.00| $ 700.00 | $ 19,600.00
701C-003 |SOLID TEMPQORARY TRAFFIC STIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 24 $ 748.00 | § 17,952.00 ] $ 730.00 | § 17,520.00
UMIN ER
B et o ARG oo
: 5 12.60 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 15.00 | § 7,500.00
2B Total S 586,840.25 S 440,951.03




