

Competitive Bid WG19-22A Bid Tabulation
Provision of Uniforms

Item #	Description	Style	BIDDER		BIDDER	
			Golden Standard Uniform		Galls, LLC	
			Bid Bond	Yes	Bid Bond	Yes
1	Raincoat Reversible Hi Visibility	5.11 Style 48125 Reversible		No Bid		\$ 105.00
2	Sheriff Logo Safety Vest (w/Optional Body Worn)	Oralite Zip-Front 343R-S		No Bid		\$ 78.00
3	Trousers, Men	Fechheimer42283		No Bid		\$ 78.00
4	Trousers, Women	Flying Cross/ Fechheimer 47293		No Bid		\$ 78.00
5	Ripstop TDU Shirt – Long Sleeve – OD Green & Khaki	5.11 Tactical #72054		No Bid		\$ 42.00
	Ripstop TDU Shirt – Long Sleeve – OD Green Khaki with 5.11 Tactical Chroma Flex Template Badges 5 Point Star	5.11 Tactical Chroma Flex #81030		No Bid		\$ 57.00
	Ripstop TDU Shirt – Short Sleeve – OD Green & Khaki	5.11 Tactical #81030		No Bid		\$ 42.00
	Ripstop TDU Shirt – Short Sleeve – OD Green & Khaki with 5.11 Tactical Chroma Flex Template Badges 5 Point Star	5.11 Tactical Chroma Flex #81030		No Bid		\$ 57.00
6	Ripstop TDU Pants – OD Green, Khaki	5.11 Tactical 74003		No Bid		\$ 39.50
7	5.11 Tactical Polo Shirts – Blk, Hun Grn, Tan, Red, Whi	5.11 Tactical Style #71049		\$ 44.75		\$ 34.00
	5.11 Tactical ChromaFlex Template Badge	#81030		No Bid		\$ 49.00
8	5.11 Tactical Polo Shirts – Women's Blk,Hun Grn, Tan, Red, White	5.11 Tactical Style#61165		\$ 44.75		\$ 34.00
	5.11 Tactical ChromaFlex Template Badge	#81030		No Bid		\$ 49.00
9	Short Sleeve Street Shirt - Brown	Style# 8972		No Bid		\$ 44.00
10	Long Sleeve Street Shirt – Brown	Style# 8971		No Bid		\$ 49.00
11	Armorskin Vest – Sheriff Brown (w/Optional Body Worn)	Style# 8970		No Bid		\$ 102.00
12	Ripstop BDU Armorskin – Color: Silver Tan	Style# 8470		No Bid		\$ 86.00
13	Long Sleeve Ripstop Armorskin Base Shirt – Color: Silver Tan	Style# 8471		No Bid		\$ 54.00
14	Short Sleeve Ripstop Armorskin Base Shirt - Color: Silver Tan	Style# 8472		No Bid		\$ 46.00
15	Operational Trouser – Color: Silver Tan	Style# 8835		No Bid		\$ 56.00
16	Soft Shell Active Duty Jacket	Style# 4660		\$ 95.00		\$ 110.00

Notes: Orange Hi-Lite indicates you must have samples.

Exceptions:

Golden Standard Uniform did not supply Brochures for the items they Bid on as per the Specifications.