Competitive Bid#WG18-40 Award Listing
Bituminous Materials & Hot Bituminous Plant Mix
Effective 10/18/18 to 10/18/19

AREA 100 Delivered Prices Only

Description

of ltem Delivered Bidder

BC-723 $54.15 MAC Prime

BC-723 $62.25 WEAVER Secondary
424A-280 $67.15 MAC Prime
424A-280 $74.00 WEAVER Secondary
424A-281 $66.40 MAC Prime
424A-281 $70.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-336 $62.35 MAC Prime
424A-336 $69.25 WEAVER Secondary
424A-340 $60.35 MAC Prime
424A-340 $66.25 WEAVER Secondary
424A-341 $60.35 MAC Prime
424A-341 $63.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-360 $60.35 MAC Prime
424A-360 $66.25 WEAVER Secondary
424A-361 $60.35 MAC Prime
424A-361 $63.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-293 $51.15 MAC Prime
424A-293 $55.50 WEAVER Secondary
424B-635 $58.30 MAC Prime
424B-635 $59.00 WEAVER Secondary
424B-636 $49.65 MAC Prime
424B-636 $55.50 WEAVER Secondary
424B-637 $49.65 MAC Prime
424B-637 $55.50 WEAVER Secondary
424B-651 $49.65 MAC Prime
424B-651 $55.50 WEAVER Secondary
424B-663 $51.15 MAC Prime
424B-663 $55.50 WEAVER Secondary
424B-648 $51.15 MAC Prime
424B-648 No Bid WEAVER Secondary

MAC supply location Bay Minette/Saraland
Weaver supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile
Eagle Utilities & Vault Co. supply location is Athens, AL

Cold-Mix 50 LB BAG Delivered Prime
Secondary

Recylce Asphalt (RAP)- Delivered Prime
Secondary

$18.95
$20.00
No Bid
No Bid

EAGLE UTILITIES
MAC

*If the supplier cannot deliver the amount of material needed

on the day of the order, the County at their sole discretion, may
choose to pickup, or have delivered material from the nearest
facility most convenient to the job site, whether it is the Prime

or Secondary vendor, at the pickup or delivered price. By

doing so the County will not violate the Bid Specifications. This in

no way relieves the bidder from delivering the materials to the County.




Competitive Bid#WG18-40 Award Listing
Bituminous Materials & Hot Bituminous Plant Mix
Effective 10/18/18 to 10/18/19

AREA 200 Delivered Prices Only

Description

of ltem Delivered Bidder

BC-723 $53.15 MAC Prime

BC-723 $59.00 WEAVER Secondary
424A-280 $66.15 MAC Prime
424A-280 $70.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-281 $65.40 MAC Prime
424A-281 $67.25 WEAVER Secondary
424A-336 $61.35 MAC Prime
424A-336 $66.00 WEAVER Secondary
424A-340 $59.35 MAC Prime
424A-340 $63.00 WEAVER Secondary
424A-341 $59.35 MAC Prime
424A-341 $60.25 WEAVER Secondary
424A-360 $59.35 MAC Prime
424A-360 $63.00 WEAVER Secondary
424A-361 $59.35 MAC Prime
424A-361 $60.25 WEAVER Secondary
424A-293 $50.15 MAC Prime
424A-293 $52.25 WEAVER Secondary
424B-635 $56.00 WEAVER Prime
424B-635 $57.30 MAC Secondary
424B-636 $48.65 MAC Prime
424B-636 $52.25 WEAVER Secondary
424B-637 $48.65 MAC Prime
424B-637 $52.25 WEAVER Secondary
424B-651 $48.65 MAC Prime
424B-651 $52.25 WEAVER Secondary
424B-663 $50.15 MAC Prime
424B-663 $52.25 WEAVER Secondary
424B-648 $50.15 MAC Prime
424B-648 No Bid WEAVER Secondary

MAC supply location Bay Minette/Saraland
Weaver supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile
Eagle Utilities & Vault Co. supply location is Athens, AL

Cold-Mix 50 LB BAG Delivered Prime
Secondary

Recylce Asphalt (RAP)- Delivered Prime
Secondary

$18.95
$19.00
No Bid
No Bid

EAGLE UTILITIES
MAC

*|f the supplier cannot deliver the amount of material needed

on the day of the order, the County at their sole discretion, may
choose to pickup, or have delivered material from the nearest
facility most convenient to the job site, whether it is the Prime

or Secondary vendor, at the pickup or delivered price. By

doing so the County will not violate the Bid Specifications. This in

no way relieves the bidder from delivering the materials to the County.




Competitive Bid#WG18-40 Award Listing
Bituminous Materials & Hot Bituminous Plant Mix
Effective 10/18/18 to 10/18/19

AREA 300 Delivered Prices Only

Description
of ltem Delivered Bidder
BC-723 $59.40 MAC Prime
BC-723 $63.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-280 $73.00 MAC Prime
424A-280 $75.00 WEAVER Secondary
424A-281 $72.00 WEAVER Prime
424A-281 $73.00 MAC Seconda
424A-336 $65.85 MAC Prime
424A-336 $70.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-340 $65.10 MAC Prime
424A-340 $67.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-341 $64.75 WEAVER Prime
424A-341 $65.10 MAC Secondary
424A-360 $65.10 MAC Prime
424A-360 $67.50 WEAVER Secondary
424A-361 $64.75 WEAVER Prime
424A-361 $65.10 MAC Secondary
424A-293 $54.75 MAC Prime
424A-293 $56.75 WEAVER Secondary
424B-835 $60.25 WEAVER Prime
424B-635 $62.25 MAC Secondary
424B-636 $53.25 MAC Prime
424B-636 $56.75 WEAVER Secondary
424B-637 $53.25 MAC Prime
424B-637 $56.75 WEAVER Secondary
424B-651 $53.25 MAC Prime
424B-651 $56.75 WEAVER Secondary
424B-663 $54.75 MAC Prime
424B-663 $56.75 WEAVER Secondary
424B-648 $54.75 MAC Prime
424B-648 No Bid WEAVER Secondary
MAC supply location Bay Minette/Saraland
Weaver supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile
Eagle Utilities & Vault Co. supply location is Athens, AL
Cold-Mix 50 LB BAG Delivered Prime $18.95 EAGLE UTILITIES
Secondary $19.00 MAC
Recylce Asphalt (RAP)- Delivered Prime No Bid
Secondary No Bid

*If the supplier cannot deliver the amount of material needed

on the day of the order, the County at their sole discretion, may
choose to pickup, or have delivered material from the nearest
facility most convenient to the job site, whether it is the Prime

or Secondary vendor, at the pickup or delivered price. By

doing so the County will not violate the Bid Specifications. This in

no way relieves the bidder from delivering the materials to the County.




COMPETITIVE BID #WG17-33 Award Listing
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

Area 100, 200, 300

Picked Up Prices Based on Facility Location Only

Mobile Asphalt Co. Hosea O. Weaver
DESCRIPTION Bay Minette Foley Cut off Rd.Mobile
Prime Secondary

BC-723 $50.45 $55.25

424A-280 $64.50 $69.50

424A-281 $63.70 $69.50

424A-336 $59.65 $62.65

424A-340 $56.65 $60.90

424A-341 $56.65 $60.90

424A-360 $56.65 $60.90

424A-361 $56.65 $60.90

424A-293 $46.95 $50.00

424B-635 $55.60 $59.00

424B-636 $46.95 $50.00 Prime $52.00
424B-637 $46.95 $50.00

424B-663 $46.95 $50.00

424B-648 $46.95 $50.00

Recycle Asphalt (RAP) $17.00 $20.00

Prime Secondary
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $14.50 $14.50
FOB Theodore FOB Theodore

Prime pricing in RED
Secondary pricing in Black

MAC plant locations:

Bay Minette - 43382 Nicholsville Rd.
Saraland - 1370 Hwy 43 S.

Foley - 21650 Doc McDuffie Rd.

H. O. Weaver plant location: Moible - Bay Bridge Cut Off Rd.




