

**COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-53 Bid Tabulation**  
**BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 100**  
**Delivered Prices Only**

<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>Mobile Asphalt Co. Delivered</b>	<b>Hosea O. Weaver Delivered</b>
BC-723	\$54.35	\$61.25
424A-280	\$66.00	\$70.25
424A-281	\$66.00	\$69.25
424A-336	\$61.00	\$65.00
424A-340	\$58.90	\$63.50
424A-341	\$59.35	\$62.10
424A-360	\$58.90	\$63.50
424A-361	\$59.35	\$62.10
424B-293	\$51.25	\$57.25
424B-635	\$51.90	\$57.75
424B-636	\$49.75	\$57.25
424B-637	\$49.75	\$57.25
424B-651	\$49.75	\$57.25
424B-663	\$51.25	\$57.25
424B-648	\$51.25	
Recycle Asphalt (RAP)	No Bid	\$27.00
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 lb bag	\$25.00	No Bid

**COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-53 Bid Tabulation**  
**BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 200**  
**Delivered Prices Only**

<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>Mobile Asphalt Co. Delivered</b>	<b>Hosea O. Weaver Delivered</b>
BC-723	\$53.35	\$58.00
424A-280	\$65.00	\$67.00
424A-281	\$65.00	\$66.00
424A-336	\$60.00	\$61.75
424A-340	\$57.90	\$60.25
424A-341	\$58.35	\$58.85
424A-360	\$57.90	\$60.25
424A-361	\$58.35	\$58.85
424B-293	\$50.25	\$54.00
424B-635	\$50.90	\$54.50
424B-636	\$48.75	\$54.00
424B-637	\$48.75	\$54.00
424B-651	\$48.75	\$54.00
424B-663	\$50.25	\$54.00
424B-648	\$50.25	
Recycle Asphalt (RAP)	No Bid	\$26.00
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 lb bag	\$25.00	No Bid

**COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-53 Bid Tabulation**  
**BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 300**  
**Delivered Prices Only**

<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>Mobile Asphalt Co. Delivered</b>	<b>Hosea O. Weaver Delivered</b>
BC-723	\$58.85	\$62.50
424A-280	\$71.25	\$71.50
424A-281	\$71.25	\$70.50
424A-336	\$66.00	\$66.25
424A-340	\$64.00	\$64.75
424A-341	\$64.00	\$63.35
424A-360	\$64.00	\$64.75
424A-361	\$64.00	\$63.35
424B-293	\$55.70	\$58.50
424B-635	\$56.30	\$59.00
424B-636	\$54.20	\$58.50
424B-637	\$54.20	\$58.50
424B-651	\$54.20	\$58.50
424B-663	\$55.70	\$58.50
424B-648	\$55.70	
Recycle Asphalt (RAP)	No Bid	No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 lb bag	\$25.00	No Bid

**COMPETITIVE BID #WG19-53 Bid Tabulation**  
**BITUMINOUS MATERIALS**  
 Area 100, 200, 300  
 Picked Up Prices Based on Facility Location Only

DESCRIPTION	Mobile Asphalt Co.			Hosea O. Weaver
	Bay Minette	Saraland	Foley	Cut off Rd.Mobile
BC-723	\$50.65	\$50.65	\$55.00	\$50.00
424A-280	\$63.40	\$63.40	\$69.00	\$59.00
424A-281	\$63.30	\$63.30	\$69.00	\$58.00
424A-336	\$58.30	\$58.30	\$63.80	\$53.75
424A-340	\$55.20	\$55.20	\$60.00	\$52.25
424A-341	\$55.65	\$55.65	\$60.00	\$50.85
424A-360	\$55.20	\$55.20	\$60.00	\$52.25
424A-361	\$55.65	\$55.65	\$60.00	\$50.85
424B-293	\$47.00	\$47.00	\$52.00	\$46.00
424B-635	\$49.20	\$49.20	\$54.10	\$46.50
424B-636	\$47.00	\$47.00	\$52.00	\$46.00
424B-637	\$47.00	\$47.00	\$52.00	\$46.00
424B-651	\$47.00	\$47.00	\$52.00	\$46.00
424B-663	\$47.00	\$47.00	\$52.00	\$46.00
Recycle Asphalt (RAP)	\$17.00	\$17.00	\$20.00	\$18.00
	FOB Theodore	FOB Theodore	FOB Theodore	