
COMPETITIVE BID #WG20-12 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Motorgrader Blades

BIDDER: Tractor & Equipment Company, Inc.

Length Width Thickness Bolt Hole Amount Bid 

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width: 6' 6" 5/8" Not Specified $43.54

6' 6" 3/4" Not Specified No Bid

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 8" width: 6' 8" 5/8" Not Specified No Bid

6' 8" 3/4" Not Specified $69.12

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width: 7' 6" 5/8" Not Specified $47.04

7' 6" 3/4" Not Specified No Bid

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4"  8" width: 7' 8" 5/8" Not Specified No Bid

7' 8" 3/4" Not Specified $79.63

Exceptions: NONE

BIDDER: Thompson Tractor Company, Inc.

Length Width Thickness Bolt Hole Amount Bid 

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width: 6' 6" 5/8" 5/8" $44.32

6' 6" 5/8" 3/4" $72.68

6' 6" 3/4" 5/8" $46.61

6' 6" 3/4" 3/4" No Bid

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 8" width: 6' 8" 5/8" 5/8" $62.58

6' 8" 5/8" 3/4" $72.87

6' 8" 3/4" 5/8" $61.93

6' 8" 3/4" 3/4" $75.35

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width: 7' 6" 5/8" 5/8" $53.00

7' 6" 5/8" 3/4" $84.46

7' 6" 3/4" 5/8" $50.44

7' 6" 3/4" 5/8" $84.46

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4"  8" width: 7' 8" 5/8" 5/8" $72.79

7' 8" 5/8" 3/4" $85.23

7' 8" 3/4" 3/4" $87.48

7' 8" 3/4" 5/8" $72.15

Exceptions: NONE

BIDDER: 1 Source Power & Equipment

Length Width Thickness Bolt Hole Amount Bid 

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width: 6' 6" 5/8" Not Specified $60.29

6' 6" 3/4" Not Specified No Bid

Price per 6 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 8" width: 6' 8" 5/8" Not Specified $79.40

6' 8" 3/4" Not Specified No Bid

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4" 6" width 7' 6" 5/8" Not Specified $65.68

7' 6" 3/4" Not Specified No Bid

Price per 7 ft. Blade: 5/8" or 3/4"  8" width 7' 8" 5/8" Not Specified $92.64

7' 8" 3/4" Not Specified No Bid

Exceptions: 1 Source Power & Equipment did not provide a bid price that includes delivery charges as was 
required in the bid specifications. It is indicated on their bid that a $150.00 freight charge will apply per order.

BIDDER: Valk Manufacturing Company

Valk Manufacturing Company's bid package was delivered to the Purchasing Office via FedEx after the bid 

deadline of January 16, 2020 at 1:00 P.M. The bid package will be returned to the bidder, unopened, as is 
stated in the bid specifications. 


