BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 2 (1/16/2020)
Indexed Asphalt Cost: John G. Walton _ Ammons & Blackmon Mabile Asphalt Co.
Alternate 1 - Seventeen Roads - All Labor and Material N/A TOTAL: $ 1,591,907.00 JTOTAL: No Bid No Bid

Alternate 2 - Seventeen Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix |s 1,025,009.45 |Lay Down: No Bid Lay Down: S 476,274.87 S 538,113.22
TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: $ 1,501,284.32 5 1,563,122.67

Addendum 1and 2 N/A N/A N/A

Bid Bond Included Yes Yes Yes

Contract Included Yes Yes Yes

| Alternate 2 (Lay Down Only)] S

1, JC%UNNAL
| 4

Jogy Nun aﬁfy P.E. Date

/ éﬁl«f&o

1,501,284.32 IAmmons And Blackmond. (actual low bid is *$476,274.87 for asphalt lay down)

UCTION ENGINEER HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE.




Alternate 1 - Seventeen Roads - All Labor and Material MOBILE ASPHALT AMMONS E BLACKMON John G. Walton
FROIECT NO. ROAD NAME TTEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT any URIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRECE BID PRICE
A05A 000 | TACK COAT GALLON 123 s 152 439.11
C00A000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 15000 | 5 157500
TOLA-301 | 5OLD WHITE, CLASS 1K, TYPE A TRRFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE} MiLE 1 S 15003 1,175.00
s == TOLA-309 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5° WIOE) MILE 1 H L1500 5 117500
ansate |y |_101C001 | SOUD TEMBQRARY TRAFTIC STAIPE (PAINT) YELLOW MILE 1 3 500 | 5 550,00
703002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 32 H 500|% 160.00
7010001 | TEMPORAY TRAFFIC CONTADL MAHKINGS SQIUARE FEET 12 $ 100§ 96.00
BC723 | SALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOLS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 213 $ 13| 20,049.69
BCO00 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD a0 5 oo | § 1,640.00
PROJIECT KO, ROAD NAME ITEM NO. |CESCRIPTION UNIT ary URIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE 8D PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PAICE
4054000 | TACK COAT GAILON 284 $ 15715 101388
GO0A-DOD LUMP SUM 1 s 2,700 | § 2.7i0.00
TOLA-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE & TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 1 s L1500 | § 1,135.00
TOLA-303 | SOUD VELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE |5 WIDE] MILE 1 s 1,1500 | 5 1.175.00
NELSON DR FROM 701C-001 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 4 8500 | § B50.00
OO cemic wy 95 TO£0M | 703400 | TRAFTIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 84 s soofs 420.00
7030-001_| TEMPCRARY TRAFFIE CONTROL MARKINGS SOUARE FEET 84 $ 1005 5200
BL723 | BALOWIN COUNTY DITURINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TOH 447 $ nm|s 32.975.19
BC-723F | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON ToH 45 s nr|s 3.319.65
BC-300 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SCUARE YARD 74 $ 405 3,034.00
PROIECT HO. ROAD NAME nEM e, | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRUCE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE 8l PRICE UNIT PRICE BIO PRICE
4054000 [ TACK COAT GALLON 103 $ 573 108171
Aapeag | SUPEPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPFER BINDER LAYER WIDENING., 1 1/2 = =
MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MiX, ESAL AANGE A/8 5 suis |'s 1.060.05
GOOA-D0 | MOBILZATION LUMP Sum 1 H 1011 | $ F00.11
HEARD RO FRGM TWIN | 701A-301_[S0LID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TVPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [5" WIDE) MILE ] 5 117500 | § 1175.00
0216219 | BEECHRDTOMELSON | 5012309 |s0UD YELLOW, CLASS IH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE (5" WIOE) MILE L s 11500 |5 1.175.00
on 701003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRASFIC STRIPE (PAINT)- YELLOW MILE 1 $ 85000 | § 850.00
703A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 60 s soofs 300.00
7030001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKIKGS SQUARE FEET a0 5 200 12000
BC-723 | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 478 $ 6162 | % 30,888.36
BC.500 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD: 10 S 4005 410.00
PROJECT HO. ROAD HAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION [ ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE RID PRICE
4052000 | TACK COAT GALLON 540 5 157 |5 2,284 BD
A10H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 5 2,118.00 | § 2,178.00
GO0A 0D | MOMUZATION LUMP SUM i $ 3,8000 | § 1.590.00
TOLA-30L | SOUID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE ] s 17500 | § 2,350.00
T01A-304 | BROXEN YELLOW, CLASS IH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [5° WiDE) MILE L s 7500 |5 72500
J01A-309 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5° wIDE} MILE 2 5 11500 | § 2,350.00
OLE BATILES RD FAOM ™50, 02 [ GRONEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINTI-YELLOW MiLE | s #5000 | § 850.00
0216719 | SECTIGH 5T TOUS HWY
o8 I01C003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PRINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 H 85000 | 5 1,700.00
7034002 | TRASFIC CONTRUL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 80 s 5005 400,00
7030-00L | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 80 s 1005 240,00
6723 |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1051 s 6462 | § 61,915.62
BC.723P | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINDUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON Ton 58 5 662 | 5 13,1476
7400000 | PILOT CAR EACH 1 § 5 =
HC300 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 10 5 41005 410,00
PROJECT NO. ROAD HAME ITEM KO. | DESCRIPIICH UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PAICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
4054000 | Tack coat GALLON 991 5 3575 153751
410H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 5 326000 | 5 3,268 00
G00A000 | MoBIIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 7000 | § 70000
TOLA-301_| SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYFE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [5° WIDE) MILE 4 5 11500 ) § 4,700.00
T0LA-304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE) MILE 1 5 73500 | & 725.00
BATTLES RD FROM T01A-309 | SOUD YELLOW, CLASS 14, T¥PE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5* WIDE) MILE 4 5 1500 ) 8 4,700.00
0217218 SCENIC HWY 33 10 F01C-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT)-TELLOW. MILE 1 5 #s000 | 5 §50.00
SECTION 5T TOIC-003 [ SOUID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 s 8900 | 5 3,400 60
F03A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 114 5 5005 570.00
7010-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 114 s 100 | 5 342.00
BC-723 | BALDWIN COUNTY ITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON Tan 1718 5 6162 | & 111,017.16
7400-000_[PILOT CAR EACH 1 $ - Is R
GC-000 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 15 5 W00 |s 515.00
PROIECT NO. ROAD NAME TTEM NO. | DESCRIPTION Uit arv UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
40SA.000 | TACK COAT GALLON 810 s 1575 291,70
A10H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING GEVICE EACH L s 27000 § 2723.00
HO0A-00D | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 aw00 | s 87000
TOLA-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE 5° WIDE) MILE 2 H 110500 | 5 2.350.00
TWIN BEECH RD § FROM |__7014-309 | SOU YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIFE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 5 117500 | 5 2,350.00
oA TWINBEECHRD TO | 701C-003 | SOUIC TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINTHYELLOW MILE 2 5 85000 | & 1,760.00
RATHES AD 703A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTAGE MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET a8 5 5005 240.00
030001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 48 5 100§ 144.00
BC-723 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOLUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1403 H 662 | § 50,651 86
7400000 | PiLOT cAR EACH 1 - 5
BC-900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 6 5 41.00 | § 245.00




PROIECT NOL ROAD NAME 1TEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UHIT arv UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT FRICE 0D PRICE UNIT PRICE 81D PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 10 $ s 2,891.70
A10H-000 | MATERIL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 5 222300 § 212100
G00A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 87000 5 B70.00
701A-301 | 50LID WINTE, CLASS 14, TYPE & TRAFTIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 $ 117500 | § 2,350.00
TWIN BEECH AD FROM | TO1A-309 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS L, TVPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [S” WIDE} MILE 2 5 117500 | § 2,350 00
0222015 | TWINBEECHRDSTO | 7010003 |SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 s 8000 | 5 1,700.00
SECHOR ST 1034-007 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TVPE & SOUARE FEET 8 s 5005 24000
7030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTRGL MARKINGS SEUARE FEET 48 $ 100§ 14400
BC-723  [BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINDUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TOoN 1403 5 6462 [ § 90.661.86
7400000 [PILOT CAR EACH 3 s - Is
(0900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-RACKS SQUARE YARD 8 $ 4100 |5 328,00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME IEM ND. | DESCRIPTION UNIT [l UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT FRICE B0 PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A.000 [ TACK COAT GALLON 299 $ 3518 1.067.43
£00A.00 | MOBILRZATION LUMP SUM 1 H 157500 | § 1.575.00
701A-301 | SOUD WHITE, CUASS IH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE {5” WIDE) MILE z $ 117500 5 235000
2ieie | VAUGHN RO ERON Eom| F01A-305 |5OLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC SIRIPE (5° wADE) ML 2 5 117500 § 2.35000
TOSTHWY S3WEST | 701C-003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFTIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2 H #5000 | § 1.700.00
703A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 7, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 6 $ so0|§ 180,00
7030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTADL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 35 s 3005 105.00
BC-723 | BALDWIN COUNTY SITUMINOUS PLANT MiX - FER TON TON 518 s 70| s 37,037.00
PROJECT NO, ROAL NAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION uNIT ary BIC PRICE UNIT PRICE BiD PRICE UNIT PRICE 61D PAICE
405000 |TACK COAT GALLON 622 5 3575 222054
410011000 | MATERIAL REMINING DEVICE EATH 1 s Lm| § 2100
600A-000_| MOBIIZATION - LUMPSUM 1 s ismom|s 157500
FOLA-30L | SOUD WHITE, CLASS 11, TYFE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIGE} MILE 2 5 117500 | § 235000
TOUA-304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS TH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIOE) MILE 1 s 75005 712500
SEUTH BIVD FROM TOIA-303 | SOUD YELLDW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE (57 wiDE) MiLE 1 $ 117500 | 5 2,350.00
0216419 | BOWEMiAN HALL RD 10 | 010000 |BROXEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 $ 85000 | § 250,00
CR49 F01-00) | SOLID TEMPGRARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT) YELLOW MILE 2 5 #5000 | 5 1,700.00
7034001 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, TLASS 2, TYPEA SQUARE FEET 48 $ 500§ 240,00
7030-001 | TEMPORARY TRATFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 45 s 3008 144,00
BC723 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON oM 1078 s 6647 % TLE54.66
7400000 |PILOTCAR EACH 1 s s Z
AC900 | DUVEWAY CUT-RACKS SQUARE TARD 46 5 4100 |5 1,886.00
PROJECT HO. ROAD NAME ITEM KO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT Qry UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BIDPRICE
4054000 | TACK COAT GALLON 34 s 3st|s 1,12098
600A-G00 | MOBILZATION LUMP 5UM 1 S 70000 | § 70000 |
TOLA-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE [5° WIDE) MILE 1 5 L1500 | § 1,17500
TO1A-304 | BROKEN YELLOTW, CLASS IH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE {S° WIDE) MILE 1 5 72500 | § 12500
TOLA-309 [ SOUID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 5 117500 | § 1.175.00
onrgstg [ WHITEAD FRGM ER S 101 ™ G OKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STAIPE (PAINT) YELLOW MILE 1 4 85000 | 5 850.00
S A R o2 [SOUID TEMPORARY TRAEFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 5 200 | § 850.00
T03A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 44 4 5005 22000
1030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MATKINGS SQUARE FEET a1 s Er S 13200
80.723 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS FLANT MIX - FER TON TOR S3a 5 B547 | 5 15,159.68
BC-000 | DRIVEWAY CUIT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 25 5 41006 1.025.00
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT an UNIT PAICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BIO PRICE
4054-000 ] TACK COAT GALLON 903 5 357)% 1.241.56
410H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 s 3600018 3,630.00
£00A.000 | MOBILZATION LUMP SUM i 5 250000 5 2,800.00
7014-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFHC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE z s 117500 | § 2,350.00
7G1A-30¢ | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS LH, TYPE & TRAFFIC STRIPE {5° WIDE) MILE 2 S 725000 § 1,450.00
TOLA-308 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5 WIDE) MILE 2 s 17501} 8 2,350.00
— r:r?n:[x:::: ‘;‘G:“c:':n HILC002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)YELLOW MILE 2 5 as000] s 1,700.00
O SQUTHELD 701C-001_| SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MitE 2 5 5000 & 1,700.00
T03A-00) | THAFFIC COMTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TVPE A SOUARE FEET 36 5 soa| s 180,00
T030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIL CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 36 5 T 108.00
BC-723 | BALDWIN COUNTY 81T UMINDUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ToH 1535 s 8547]% 102,031.45
0C-7230 | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS FLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TN 39 H 5647] 5 259233
00000 |PILOT CAR EACH 1 $ H
BLG00 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS. SQUARE YARD 15 £} am| s 515,00
PROIECT NO. ROAD HAME TEM NO. |DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE 810 PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE 810 PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 370 5 357 § 1,320 50
410H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH L s 5 -
G00A-000 | MOBILZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 720000 | $ 7.200 00
JOTA-301 | 50LID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 5 117500 ¢ 2,350 00
F01A-303 [ SOLID YELLOW, CLASS IH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE {5 WiDE) MILE 2 s 117500 § 235000
216019 xch:;r::\;: c:;' OM [T 701000 _|50LID TEMPORARY TRATFIC STRIPE (PAINT) YELLOW MiLE 2 B 85000 | 5 170000 |
v BC-721 | RALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINDUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 494 3 rw|s 3611140
BC:723L | BALDWIN COUNTY LANT M., LEVELING - PER TON TON 26 5 8183 )5 2.129.14
8C-723° | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TOH 1 3 70| 284510
7400-000 | PILOT CAR EACH k 5 i <
BC-500 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 186 5 am|s 762600




PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM ND.[DESCRIPTION UNIT arv UKIT PRICE BID PAICE LINIT PRICE BIO PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PAICE
A0SA-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 661 $ 1575 236691
410H-000 [MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ - s z
600000 [MERIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 50000005 5,000,00
FOLA-301 | SOLI0 WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE (5" wADE) MILE 2 $ 117500 % 2,350.00
TOLA-30% |SOULIC YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYI'E A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE) MILE ' ) S 117500 % 2,350.00
TO1C-003 | 5CUID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINTLVELLOW MILE 2 S 850.00 | § 1,700.00
0716619 "R”;f;:“;:;“ MY oA o0 | TRAFRIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPEA SQUARE FEET 0 5 500 % 100.00
7030001 | TEMPORARY THAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET w0 L 3.00 60.00
BL.723 | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINDUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ToN 505 ] 73.10 66,155.50
8C-723L | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MiX, LEVELING - PER TON Ton 154 5 81.89 12,611.06
BC-123F | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TN 90 5 73.10| % 5,579.00
7400000 |PILOT CAR EACH 1 L) - 5 .
BC-900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SOUARE YARD 110 S 41.00 | § 4,510.00
PROIECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE URIT PRICE 8I0 PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
A05A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 493 5 357 |5 1,760.01
6004 000 |MACRIIZATION LUMP SUM 1 § 600000|5 6,000.00
FOLA-301 | S00I0 WHITE, CLASS 11, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIE (5" WIDE) MiLE z S 117500 § 2,350.00
FOLA-39  |SOLID YELLOW, CLAGS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5 WIDE) MILE 2 $ 1175005 2,350.00
ILLIPS HO FAOR ST|  JOLC-001 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW ML z s 85000 § 1.700.00
0216819 HWY 104 1O 1037002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL AMARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SOUARE FEET 28 5 500|585 140.00
LEATHERBUAY AD 7030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 28 s 3003 84.00
BC-721 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PEA TON TaN 749 $ 6708 |5  50,242.92
AC-723L | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGLS PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TON 2 s 8189 |5 1,719.69
BC-723P | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINCHS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 85 s 67.08 | § 5,701.80
BC.900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 13 s 41.00 | § 533.00
PROJECT ND. ROAD NAME ITEM ND. | DESCRIPTION [ ant UNIT PRICE B0 PRICE UNIT FRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE 21D PRICE
405A-000 [ TACK COAT GALLON 1063 $ 357]5§ 3,794.91
A10H-D00 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 § 39%400]5% 3,994.00
IPEPAVE BITUMING al L a N
BOOA-D00 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 § 1575008 1,575.00
F01A-301 | SCUID WHITE, CLASS IH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 $  1,175.00 3.525.00
0217015 THOMPSON RD FROM CA 7014-304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE} MILE 1 § 725.00 725,00
5570 ST HWY 59 7014-309 | SOLID YELLOWY, CLASS LH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5° WIDE) MILE 3 $  1,175.00 3,525.00
701C-002 | ERCKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW MILE 1 5 85000 | § 850.00
701C-003 | 50LID TEMPGRARY TRAFFIC STIFE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE k) S 850.00 | § 1,550.00
703A 002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 80 $ 5.00| 5 400.00
T010-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SOUARE FEET 80 S 3.0015 240,60
BC-723 | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS FLANT MIX - FER TON TON 1688 $ 66.47 | §  112,201.36
7400000 | PILOT CAR EACH 1 § - 15 -
PROIECT HO. ROAD HAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UHI ary UNIT PRICE B10 PRICE LNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE D PRICE
A05A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 1033 S 357158 1.687.81
410H-000 REMIING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 3630008 3,630,00
600A-000 | MOBILZATION LUMP SUR 1 $ 650.00 | § 650.00
J01A-301 | SOLID WHITE. CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WiDE) MILE 3 1,175.00 | § 3.525.00
T01A-304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE] MILE 1 72500 | § 725.00
701A-30% | 50410 YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE |5 WIDE) MILE 1 1,175.00 | § 3,525.00 |
I E::L"t:’::?;f FO1C-002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT) ¥ELLOW MILE 1 § 850.00 | § 850.00
016003 | 50UD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIFE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 §  850.00 |5 2,550.00
7038001 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET & § 5.00 | § 300.00
7030-001 | TEMPCRARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET &0 s 3.00|5 180.00
BC-723 | BALOWIN COUNTY DITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TN 1783 $ 6549 |5 117,16L61
7400000 | PiLOT CAR EACH 1 4§ e -
BC.500 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD s 5 4L.00 | § 1,558.00
PROJECT HO. ROAD HAME TEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BiC PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-X0 | FACK COAT GALLON 1401 5 357156 5,001.57
A10H-D00 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH L S 5846.0015 5,446.00
INOUS 4 FPER 1
sy |t iMoo |y | NN F—
6004-000 | MOBILZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 107500 5 1.075.00
FOLA-301 | SOU0 WHITE, CLASS 11, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5% WIDE) MILE a 5 1,175.00 & 4,700.00
COUNTY RO 54 £ FROM | 0UA-301 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 14, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5° WIDE) MILE 1 S 725.00| % 725.00
onrng CR 54 TOCR 64 JOLA-309 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE [5* WIDE) MILE 4 5 117500 % 4,700.00
1010001 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {(PAINT)- YELLOW MILE 5 850.00 | £50.00
1010003 | 50UID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-VELLOW MILE a $ 850.00 | 5 3.400.00
7034000 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 52 s 5005 260.00
7030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 52 $ 3005 156.00
BC723 | BALDWIN COUNTY ITUMINGLS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 2215 s 65.53 | §  145,804.25
7400000 |PHOT CAR EACH 1 $ N -
BC-900 | DIMVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 42 $ 4100 | § 1,722.00
Total Bid Na Bid No Bid $ 1,591,907.00




MOBILE ASPHALT

JohnG. Walton

I 2 - Seventeen Roads - All Labor and Material except County provided asphalt as noted by *

PADVECT MO ROAD NAME ITEM NO.[DESCRIFTION uniT ary UNIT PRICE 4D PRICE UNIT PRICE 81D PRICE
2058000 | TACK COAT GaLLoN 121 s amo|s 29200
G00A-000 | MOBILIZATION 1UMP SUM 1 5 TR0 | S
I01A301_| SOLID WINTE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE) [ 1 5 1,26000 | §
et FOVA-109 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5™ WIDE) MILE 1 5 126000 | %
0115919 nll'f;;:;; ey |_721€003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIFE (PAINT) YELLGW ML T s 91000 §
7014007 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SOUARE FELT un |s 550 %
7030-001_| TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 32 |s 150 | 3
BC-723% BALOWIN COUNTY EITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 211 1 1750 | %
BC-H00 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD: a0 5 1500
PROIECT NG AOAD HAME 1TEM KO, | DESCRIPTION unt ary UNIT PRICE 2D PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PAICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 284 $ 00| $
LOOA000 | FAOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 0000 | 5
701A-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE |5 WIDE} MILE 1 s 126000 | 5
701A-309 | SOUDYELLOW, CLASS 10, TYFE A TRAFFIC STAIPE {5” WIDE} MILE 1 s 126000
NELSGNOR FROM | 701C.003 | SOUID TEMPORARY TRAFRIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 | 91000 | &
US| scmnc iy 98 70 £0M [ 7034007 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FELT B s 5505
7030-001_| TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTHDL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET B4 | 350 s
8723 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANY MiX- FER TON 108 ar s uso| s
BC.723P* | BALOWIN CCUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TOH ToN s |s as00 |3
BCoo0 [ oRivEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD. M |s 1500 | §
PROIECT MO HOAD NAME TTEM NO._|DEscripTion unit ary UNIT PRICE 9ID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
A05A000 | TACK COAT GAILON B 400
. |SUPEPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER QINDER LAYER WIDENING, 1172
G| AKiMUM AGGREGATE SIE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B L 7o, wpi s
6004000 | MOEILZATICR LUMP SUM 1 s 140000
WEARD D FROM TWIN | T01A.301 | SOLID WINTE, CLASS 11, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE (5" wiDF) MILE 1 s 126000
0216219 | DIECHRDTONELSON | 701A.309 | SOUID YELLOW, CLASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 1 5 128000 | 5
L 01C.003 | SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 s 51000 | §
TO3A-001 | TARFAIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE & SCQUARE FEET 60 5 550 | 5
1030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 40 B 150 | S
BC.723% | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX . PER TON TON anm_ |5 1750 ]S
BC-900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD w_|s 1500 |
PROJECT HO. OAD NAME WEMnD. |DEscRIFTIGN UNIT ary UNIT PRICE 1D PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
AD5A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 540 H amo| s
A10H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 § 0oL s
GODA-000_| MODILIZATION LUMP SLM 1 s 1800008
701A-301_| SOUID WHITE, CLASS IH, TVPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (57 WiDE} MILE 2 S L0005
1014304 |SROXKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5” WIDE) MILE 1 s 80000 | §
701A-309_| SOUID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {57 WADE] MILE 2 5 12w00]5 25000
i z‘:ﬂ“;ﬁ‘::::‘:m 1010007 | BAOXEN TEMPQRARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT) YELLOW MILE 1 5 00| S
E™ 701C003 | SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MiLE 2 5 $1000 | 5
702A.002_| TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET W |s 5508
7030001 _| TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SCUARE FEET a0 s 150§
BC-723* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON o ws s o [s  1anam
BC-723P* | BALDWIN COUNTY SITUMINOLS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON Ton s |5 9500 | §
7400000 [PLOT CAR EACH 1 s oo1]s
GC.200 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD o |s 15.00 | §
PROJECT O ROAD NAME ITEM NO, | DESCRIPTION urt ar UNIT PRICE DI PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
£05A-000 | TRLK COAT GALLON 791 $ A00|$ 3.964.00
A10H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 S 0o0L|s 001
S00A-D00 | MORILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 300000 B
O1A-301_|SOUID WHITE, CLASS IH, TYPE & TRAFFIC STRIPE {5° WIDE) MILE 4 5 L2000
TU1A-303 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 11, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE [5” WIDE) MILE 1 5 30000 | §
BATTLES RO FROM | _701A-303|50UID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE] MILE 4 s 1,26000 | §
[eIeIL] SCENICHWY9ATO | 701C-002 |BROXEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIFE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 5 g1000 | §
SECTICH ST 701C:003 | SOUID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 5 91000 | §
703A.002_| TRAFFIC CONTRGL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYFE A SQUARE FEET e |s 5508
7030001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET T a5 s
0C-723% | BALOWIN COURTY DITUMINDUS PLANT MiX - PER TON ToN 1| S 1a00 |5 2405200
7200.000 | FILOT CAR EACH 1 s oo s
00900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 5 |s 1500 | 5 22500
PROJECT MO. HOAD HAME TEM KO, | DESCAIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE GIDPAICE | UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TacK coAT GALLON 810 |5 a00|s 324000
41CH-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 s 00L]s
BOOADO0_| MOBILIZATION LUMP 5UM 1 5 250000 | §
701A-J01_| SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE) MILE 2 s 126000 | §
TWIN BEECH RD 5 FROM|_7CLA'309 | SOLIO YELLOW, CLASS IH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 s 1260005
2217419 TWINBEECHAD TG | JDLC-003 |SOUID TEMPORANY TRAFFIC STIPE {PAINTS-YELLOW MILE 2 5 91000 | §
BATTIES AD) 703007 | TRAFFIC CONTADL MARIKINGS, CLASS 2, T¥PE & SQUARE FEET @ |3 ssals
703D-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET % |5 350] §
BC-721' | BALDWIN COUNTY PLANT MIX - PER TON 104 N E won| s 13500
7400000 |PLOT CAR EACH 1 5 051§
8C.000 | BRWVEWAY CUT.BACKS SAUARE YARD 5 s 1500 §




UNIT PRICE fID PRICE
UNIT PRICE BIDPRICE
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
UNIT PRICE BiD PRICE

PROIECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM KO. |QESCRIPTION unit ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
20SA000 | FACK COAT GAILON. s10 | a0 s
4104000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DIVICC EACH 1 s oo s
GO0A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM i 5 2,50000 | §
FOIA-301 [ SOUD WHIITE. CLASS LH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE (5 WIDE) MILE 2 s 126000 | §
TwiN BEECH ADFROM | T01A.302 'smmvmmv. CLASS 1. TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE 15° WIDE} MILE 2 $ 136000 §
nnne TWINBEECH RO S TO 1010003 [ SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT) YELLOW MILE 2 5 91000 | §
SECTION ST 7038002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TVPE A SQUARE FEET 4 |s 5505
7010-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MATKINGS SQUARE FEET 4 s 250 ]s !
BO-723* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS FLANT MIX - PER TON TON B 1100 (5 194200
7400000 | PLOT CAR EACH 1 s oo [ s
BC.500 | DRIVEWAY CUT-RACES SQUARE YARD a 5 1500 | 5
PROIECT NO. ROAD HAME TEM NO. | DESCRIPTION unIr ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
A054000 | TACK COAT GRILON @ s 4005 119600
004000 | MOBILZATION LUMP SUM 1 s 70000 | §
7014301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5* WIDE] MiLE 2 s 126000 | §
gitgarg | VAUGHNRD FROM oM | TOLA303 [5OUID YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A THAFFIC STRIVE (5" 1) MILE 2 s 126000 | §
TOSTHWY 53 WEST | 701C.003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIFE (PAINT)-YELLOW ML ] 5 91000 | §
703002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2 TYPE A SQUARE FEET i |s 5508
T030-001_| TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET s |5 350 ¢
BC-723" | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 518 & 18.00 | §
PROSECT NO. ROAD NAME wemno. |pescrpmion unIT arv UNIT PRICE BIDPRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 622 | 200 ¢
A10H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 5 001 | §
6004000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 1,700.00 | §
FOIA 301 | SCLID WHITE, CLASS LN, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {57 WIDZ) MILE z 5 126000 | §
TOLA-30t | DAOKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE) MILE 1 5 50000 | §
SOUTHBLYD FROM | TOIA-I09 [SOUID YELLOW, CLASS I, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (S” wiDE) MILE 2 5 126000 | §
0216419 | EOHEMIAN HALLAD T0 | 701C.002 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFHC STRIPE [PAINTHYELLOW MILE 1 s 91000 | §
CR43 7016001 | SGUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT]-TELLOW MILE F) 5 91000 | §
F0IA007 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TVPE A SQUARE FEET s s 550 &
7030001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 48 [ 350 %
BC723' | BALDWAH COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MiX . PER TON Ton wE s wo0ls w0
7400000 _|PILOT CAR EACH 1 s o01L]s
ACO00 | DRIVEWAY CUT-RACKS SQUARE YARD 46 |s 1500 | §
PROIECT NG ROAD NAME [TEM ND. | DESCRIPTION UHIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON s 4005 1.256.00
GO0R000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM i B 120000 | 5
J0LA301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [5* wIDE) MIE L 5 126000 | §
701A-304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5° WIDE} MILE i 5 80000 | 5
701A-305 | 50UID YELLGW, CLASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 1 5 1,26000 | §
oangsag | WHITERD ""I:"".fl":b'" 701C.007_| EROKEN TEMPORAIY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT] YELLOW MILE T s 91000 | §
7010003 | 5GUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT) TELLOW MILE 1 5 910,00 | $
7034002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET u s 550 %
7030001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTHOL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET I B 350 %
BC-723* | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 544 5 1000 | §
BC:900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS. SOQUARE YARD 3 |5 1500 | 5
FROIECT NO. ROAD NAME ITERA NO. | DESCAIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
4054000 [ TACK COAT GALLGH - a00)s 351200
410H.000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 5 ool
5004000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 S 2B0000) 5
7014-301 | SCUD WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WIDE} MILE 2 s 1,260.00 | §
TDIA-304 | BAOKEN YELLOW, CLASS TH, TYRE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE] MILE 2 s B0.00 | 5
1014309 | SOUID YELLOW, CLASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5 WIDE) MILE z 5 1,26000 | §
BOHEMIAN HALL RO 17500 0 007 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT) YELLOW MILE 1 5 51000 &
anes FROM WHITE RD/CR 48
Fosoumi Bl 101C.003_|SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT}-YELLOW MILE ? 5 91000 | $
1032002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 7, TYPE A SOUARE FEET 6 5 550 | 4%
7030001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARANGS SQUARE FEET B 3505
BC-723* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMIKOUS PLANT MIX. PER TON ToN 1535 5 1000 | § 15.350.00
BC-723P* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - ToN 1 5 9500 %
7400000 _[PivoT can EACH [l 5 o013
BC.900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 15 5 15001 %
PROJECT NO. ADAD NAME TEM NO. | DESCRIFTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLOK 0 fs aoo|s
4100000 | MATERIAL REMIING DEVICE EACH 1 5 so1]$
600A-000 |MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 1,400.00 | §
J01A-301 | SOUID WHITE, CLASS 11, TYPE A TRAFFIC STAIPE |S* wiDE| MILE [ 5 1,26000 | §
7314-309 | SCLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WiOE) MiLE ? 5 126000 | §
@iems '“"i;';:;‘?;m” JILC003 | S0LID TERPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINTI-YELLOW MILE 3 5 21000 | &
C-723* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON Ton ama s 1600 | §
BC-723L* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, LEVEUING . PER TON 10N [ 4000 &
BC.723P* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON oM 121 | 3500 |5 143500
7400-000_|FILOT CAR EACH ] s 0015
BC-300 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACXS SQUARE YARD: s |5 1500 §




PROIECT NO. ROAD NAME TTEM KO, | GESCRIPTION UNIT qry UMIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A000 | IACK COAT GALLON B 400 s
410H-000 | MATERIALREMIDING DEVICE EACH i 5 001§

G00AOD0 | MDBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 180000 | §
JOIA3D1 [ SOUID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIE STRIPE {5 WIDE} MLk 2 s 136000 §
7014309 _|SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2 s 1000 §
701C-001_{50LI0 TEMPCRARY TRATFIC STIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 7 5 a0 | 5
0216610 ““r::’:;?:*;m“ 703A007_|TAATTIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPEA SQUARE FEET w3 550 5
7030001 | TEMPORRRY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS. SOUARE FEET 0 |s 350§
0C-723* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS FLANT MiX - PER TON TON 505 |5 1600fs 1448000 ]
87237 | BALDWIN COUNTY PLANT MIX, LEVELING - PER TON TN 15 |5 4000 | 5
BC.723P% | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS FLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON Ton %0 |s 9500 | $
7400000 [PiOT AR EACH 1 s o0 | s
BC-900 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YASD o |5 1500 ] 5

PROIECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEMNO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PAICE BI0 PRICE UNIT PAICE BID PRICE
4058000 [1ACK COAT GALLON o |s am|s
GO0A000 | MOBILZATION LUME SUM 1 s 140000 | §
IDIA301_|STUD WHITE, CLASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [5° WIDE} MILE E] $ 1,76000 | §

014309 | SOUID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {57 WIOE) MILE 2 s 1,26000 | §

MACPINLLIPS RO FAOM ST|_ 7016003 [SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)YELLOW MILE 1 ¢ a1000 | 5

0216819 HWY 104 10 7034002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPEA SQUARE FEET B s 5505
LEATHERBUAY RD F030.001 | TERMPORARY THAFHIE CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 8 5 350 %

BC.723* {BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON o6 e s 1200 | §

BC.72310 [ BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIK, LEVELING - PER TGN TOK 1 |s 4000 | §

BC723P¢ | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINCUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON a5 |¢ 9500 | §

DC00 | DRIVEVAY CUT-BACKS SOUARE YARD 13 |s 1500 | §

PROIECT NO. ROAD NAME 1EM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT air UHIT PRICE B0 FRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
05000 | TACK COAT GALLON 01 |4 4005
A10H-D00 [ MATERIAL REMINING DEVICE EACH 1 s oo |5
azttypags | FUPEPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE LPPER BINDER LAYERWIDENING, 1 1/2 s W

MAXIMUM AGGAEGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B 5 5008
BO0A000 | MOBILZATION LUMP 5UM 1 $ 350000 | §
014301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5 WIDE) MILE 3 $ 126000 | §
capsarg | MOMPSON RO FROMCAL 7014304 | BROXEN YELLOW, CLASS IH, TYPE ATRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 1 s Bo0.0D | §
AETOSTHWESS T01A-309 | SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYFE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 3 s 126000 | &
010002 | SACKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW. MILE 1 5 91000 | §
7010003 | S0LI0 TEMPCRARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)YELLOW MILE 3 B 91000 | §
7030002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPEA SQUARE FEET s |s 5506
7030001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET W |5 350 ¢ !

BC.723* | BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MUX - PER TON Ton 1688 | 12005 3025600
7400000 | PILOT CAR EACH 1 H 0o | 5

PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEM MO, | DESCRIPTION unIt ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE
405A.000 | TACK COAT GALLON w3l s 400 s
AL0H.000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 5 001 | 5
GO0ADO0 | MOBILZATION LUMP SUM 1 5 300000 | §

014101 | SCUID WHITE, CLASS 11, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 1 5 126000 | §
7014304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5 WIDE) WILE 1 5 20000 | 5
7014309 [ S0LID YELLOW, CLASS IH, TYFE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 3 5 1,260.00 | 5
0317119 Eﬁ;":;:::z:: 7010002 | BROKEN TEMPONARY TRAFFIC STRIPE {PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 5 91000 | 3
FOIC003 | SOLID TEMPORARY TRATFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 3 $ 91000 | 3
T03A002 | TRAFFIC CONTRCL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 0 |3 5505
J030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTAOL MARXINGS SQUARE FEET @ |3 18| s
BC-723' | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOLS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON s | 120006 21.468.00
7400000 _|PILOT CAR EACH 1 & not]s
BCHO | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD B |s 1500 | §

PROIECT NO. FOAD NAME ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE 8i0 PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
405A000 | TACK CCAT GALLON 10 |5 4005 5.604.00
410H000 | MATERIAL REMUING DEVICE EAGH 1 s soL]s |

R LAYER, WIDENI

6004000 _| MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM i s 500000 | &
701A-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS LH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE % 136000 | §
s | o s B oo st Ao e
CR54TO CR 64 3 3 1,500 §
701C-002_| BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1 5 91000 | §
TOIC003 | S0U0 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 4 s 81000 | 5
7034002 | TRAFFIC CONTROUMARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 2 |s 550§
T030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET El B 350 &

AC723* | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON a5 s 1000]5 2225000
7400000 [PROT CAR EACH 1 s 0o | s
0000 | DAIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD 2 |s 1500 §

Total Bldl § 518,113.22 No 8id




