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EQUIPMENT

United Rentals Pittman Tractor Tractor & United Rentals 1 Source Power Kingline Robertsdale 

Irvington Co., Inc. Equipment Co. Foley & Equipment Equipment Rent All, Inc.

6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump Daily $1,327.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid

w/100ft.suction hose&200ft. Weekly $4,601.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $750.00 No Bid No Bid

discharge hose Monthly $6,733.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid

2 in. Electric Submerge Pump Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid $35.00

w/200 ft. hose Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.00 No Bid $175.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $545.00 No Bid $250.00

Mud Pump Daily $335.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid

Weekly $485.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly $988.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $545.00 No Bid No Bid

12 ft. Wood Grinder w/ Operator Daily No Bid $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Powered by Diesel, Minimum Reach 27' Weekly No Bid $18,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/Capabilities of lifting 5000 lbs. Monthly No Bid $54,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper Daily No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $2,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Curtain Burner 30ft. Daily No Bid $645.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $1,725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Monthly No Bid $3,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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3500 Watt Honda Generator Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 No Bid $45.00

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid $180.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $475.00 No Bid $465.00

Diesel Powered Light Plants Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.47 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

w/four 1000 watt Metal Halide Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $201.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid

Flood Lights Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $459.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid

285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $275.00 No Bid No Bid

Compressor w/100 ft. of 1 in. air Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $600.00 No Bid No Bid

hoses or equal Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid

Gas Powered Portable Welding Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.45 $100.00 No Bid No Bid

Machine - Medium Duty Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $226.06 $225.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $476.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $258.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $759.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,553.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forklift Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $221.00 $175.00 No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $589.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,199.00 $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid

32' Scissor Lift Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $167.00 $150.00 No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $348.00 $375.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $701.00 $900.00 No Bid No Bid

4" 2'

Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $149.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $444.00 No Bid No Bid $490.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,044.00 No Bid No Bid $1,200.00

3'

Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,580.00

4'

Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,580.00

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck-8' Daily No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Long 24 CU Yard with Barn Door Tailgate Weekly No Bid $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Boom Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor Monthly No Bid $23,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck Daily No Bid $1,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $4,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $14,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truck or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Daily No Bid $795.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $2,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Volvo A25D- 25 ton 6x6 Articulated Daily No Bid $1,495.00 $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Off Road Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $3,400.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,200.00 $9,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket Daily No Bid $625.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket Weekly No Bid $1,775.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Monthly No Bid $4,600.00 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 966K Front End Loader or equal Daily No Bid $839.00 $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $2,050.00 $1,580.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $4,900.00 $4,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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Caterpillar 963D Track Loader with Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

multipurpose bucket or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/high capacity Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal    No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

                                                                                       MonthlyMonthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 336E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily No Bid $1,200.00 $950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $3,400.00 $2,580.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,150.00 $8,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily No Bid $1,050.00 $800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $2,900.00 $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $6,750.00 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily No Bid $850.00 $700.00 No Bid $900.00 No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $2,250.00 $2,100.00 No Bid $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $5,290.00 $6,300.00 No Bid $7,200.00 No Bid No Bid

Cat 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal Daily No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $2,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

XL4100 Gradall or equal Daily No Bid $1,505.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $4,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $10,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C Daily No Bid $1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal 60 ft. reach Weekly No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $9,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 349 Excavator Loader with multipurpose Daily No Bid No Bid $1,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

bucket or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator) Daily No Bid $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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Cat 12M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid $1,050.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $2,950.00 $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $7,950.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 12M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid $1,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Blade or equal Weekly No Bid $2,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CAT 140M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $3,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid $1,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Blade or equal Weekly No Bid $3,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $9,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade Daily No Bid $850.00 $950.00 $508.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $2,250.00 $2,800.00 $1,411.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $5,850.00 $6,900.00 $3,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal Daily No Bid $850.00 $950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $2,250.00 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $5,850.00 $6,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 416E Back Hoe or equal Daily No Bid $285.00 No Bid $284.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $669.00 No Bid $735.00 $725.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,450.00 No Bid $1,594.00 $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid

Cat 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd. capacity Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pull behind Tractor Scraper Daily No Bid $850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 cu. yd. capacity or equal Weekly No Bid $2,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $5,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $425.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

width of 66 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $1,050.00 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $2,800.00 $4,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $525.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

width of 84 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $1,425.00 $1,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $3,550.00 $5,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller Daily No Bid $625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $4,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat CP 44 Sheepfoot Roller Daily No Bid $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/blade or equal Weekly No Bid $1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $2,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal Daily No Bid $550.00 No Bid $583.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $1,450.00 No Bid $1,311.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $4,300.00 No Bid $3,010.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller Daily No Bid $169.00 $250.00 $201.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $450.00 $500.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,250.00 $1,500.00 $1,399.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Minimum 114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.00 $400.00

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $920.00 $1,200.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,300.00 $2,300.00

4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/6ft. Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo) Daily No Bid $290.00 No Bid No Bid $350.00 No Bid No Bid

73hp or equal, Rubber Tracks Weekly No Bid $750.00 No Bid No Bid $900.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $2,150.00 No Bid No Bid $1,900.00 No Bid No Bid

Cat 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp Daily No Bid $230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $660.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 No Bid No Bid $100.00

Loader Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.00 No Bid No Bid $150.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00

BIDDERS
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Angle Broom for Skid Steer Daily No Bid $105.00 No Bid $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Loader Weekly No Bid $205.00 No Bid $245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $600.00 No Bid $722.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Forks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $45.00 No Bid $49.58 $50.00 No Bid $50.00

 Weekly No Bid $80.00 No Bid $123.95 $125.00 No Bid $75.00

Monthly No Bid $160.00 No Bid $298.17 $350.00 No Bid $160.00

Hydraulic Hammer for Ski Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.00 $185.00 No Bid $115.00

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $403.00 $500.00 No Bid $380.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,204.91 $1,350.00 No Bid $800.00

Tracks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Portable Screening Plant Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model 271 or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid $13,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Milling Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Writgen 2000 or equivalent with operators Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid $25,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS



COMPETITVE BID #WG20-14 BID TABULATION

EQUIPMENT RENTAL 

Page 8               Picked-Up

EQUIPMENT

United Rentals Pittman Tractor Tractor & United Rentals 1 Source Power Kingline Robertsdale 

Irvington Co., Inc. Equipment Co. Foley & Equipment Equipment Rent All, Inc.

Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $11,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat AP600D Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat AP1000D Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Exceptions: 

NONE

BIDDERS
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6" Diesel Hydraulic Pump Daily $1,327.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.00 No Bid No Bid

w/100ft.suction hose&200ft. Weekly $4,601.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $850.00 No Bid No Bid

discharge hose Monthly $6,733.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,350.00 No Bid No Bid

2 in. Electric Submerge Pump Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid $55.00

w/200 ft. hose Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $262.00 No Bid $195.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $645.00 No Bid $275.00

Mud Pump Daily $335.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid No Bid

Weekly $485.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $262.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly $988.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $645.00 No Bid No Bid

12 ft. Wood Grinder w/ Operator Daily No Bid $6,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Powered by Diesel, Minimum Reach 27' Weekly No Bid $18,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/Capabilities of lifting 5000 lbs. Monthly No Bid $55,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tub Grinder Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bandit Model 1890 Wood Chipper Daily No Bid $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Curtain Burner 30ft. Daily No Bid $850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $1,925.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Monthly No Bid $3,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS



COMPETITVE BID #WG20-14 BID TABULATION

EQUIPMENT RENTAL 

Page 2               Delivered

EQUIPMENT

United Rentals Pittman Tractor Tractor & United Rentals 1 Source Power Kingline Robertsdale 

Irvington Co., Inc. Equipment Co. Foley & Equipment Equipment Rent All Inc.

 

3500 Watt Honda Generator Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $122.00 No Bid $75.00

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 No Bid $210.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $525.00 No Bid $495.00

Diesel Powered Light Plants Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $349.47 $220.00 No Bid No Bid

w/four 1000 watt Metal Halide Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $451.00 $350.00 No Bid No Bid

Flood Lights Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $709.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid

285 CFM Diesel Powered Air Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $375.00 No Bid No Bid

Compressor w/100 ft. of 1 in. air Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $700.00 No Bid No Bid

hoses or equal Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Gas Powered Portable Welding Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $345.45 $200.00 No Bid No Bid

Machine - Medium Duty Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $476.06 $325.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $726.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid

40 ft. Towable Bucket Lift Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $508.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,009.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,803.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Toyota Model 7FGU25 Forklift Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $471.00 $375.00 No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $839.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,449.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid

32' Scissor Lift Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $417.00 $350.00 No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $598.00 $575.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $951.00 $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid

4"  

Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $399.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $694.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,294.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Trencher Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Horizontal Directional Boring Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List various sizes available w/price Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Diesel Powered Knuckle Boom Truck-8' Daily No Bid $2,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Long 24 CU Yard with Barn Door Tailgate Weekly No Bid $7,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Boom Rotation 280 dg by Hydraulic Motor Monthly No Bid $23,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mack Tri-Axle 21 Yard Dump Truck Daily No Bid $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $5,245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $15,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Freightliner Single Axle 8 Yard Dump Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truck or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mack Tandum Axle 14 Yard Dump Daily No Bid $1,045.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $3,245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Volvo A25D- 25 ton 6x6 Articulated Daily No Bid $1,895.00 $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Off Road Truck or equal Weekly No Bid $3,800.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,600.00 $11,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Freightliner M2 106 with 10ft Dump Body Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

938K Rubber Tire Loader w/4 way Bucket Daily No Bid $875.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/2.5 cu. yd. multipurpose Bucket Weekly No Bid $2,025.00 $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Monthly No Bid $4,850.00 $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 966K Front End Loader or equal Daily No Bid $1,089.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $2,300.00 $2,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $5,150.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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Caterpillar 963D Track Loader with Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

multipurpose bucket or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bobcat T870 Track Loader w/high capacity Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $675.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydraulic Pump with attachments or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

                                                                                       MonthlyMonthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 336E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily No Bid $2,000.00 $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $3,900.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,650.00 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 329E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily No Bid $2,000.00 $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $3,400.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $7,250.00 $9,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 324E Excavator w/Thumb and A/C Daily No Bid $1,150.00 $1,000.00 No Bid $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $2,500.00 $3,100.00 No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $5,540.00 $7,500.00 No Bid $8,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Cat 318 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal Daily No Bid $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $3,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

XL4100 Gradall or equal Daily No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $4,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 329 Long Reach Excavator with A/C Daily No Bid $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal 60 ft. reach Weekly No Bid $4,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $10,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 349 Excavator Loader with multipurpose Daily No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

bucket or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid $13,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ditch Cleaning Bucket (for Excavator) Daily No Bid $400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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Cat 12M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid $1,550.00 $900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $3,450.00 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,450.00 $6,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 12M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid $1,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Blade or equal Weekly No Bid $3,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $8,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CAT 140M Motor Grader or equal Daily No Bid $1,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $3,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $9,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CAT 140M Motor Grader with Front Daily No Bid $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Blade or equal Weekly No Bid $4,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $9,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat D6K LGP Dozer with Straight Blade Daily No Bid $1,250.00 $2,950.00 $758.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $2,650.00 $4,800.00 $1,661.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $6,050.00 $8,900.00 $3,556.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat D6K LGP Dozer with Tilt Blade or equal Daily No Bid $1,250.00 $2,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $2,650.00 $4,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $6,050.00 $8,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 416E Back Hoe or equal Daily No Bid $515.00 No Bid $534.00 $550.00 No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $950.00 No Bid $985.00 $975.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,725.00 No Bid $1,844.00 $1,900.00 No Bid No Bid

Cat 623H - 18 to 23 cu. yd. capacity Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pull behind Tractor Scraper Daily No Bid $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 cu. yd. capacity or equal Weekly No Bid $2,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 - 6 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $725.00 $900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

width of 66 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $1,450.00 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $3,250.00 $5,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8-10 Ton Steel Wheel Roller w/compaction Daily No Bid $850.00 $1,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

width of 84 in. or equal Weekly No Bid $1,750.00 $3,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $3,790.00 $6,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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9-12 Ton Rubber Tire Roller Daily No Bid $1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $2,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat CP 44 Sheepfoot Roller Daily No Bid $725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/blade or equal Weekly No Bid $1,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $3,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat CP 74 Sheepfoot Roller or equal Daily No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid $833.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $1,750.00 No Bid $1,561.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $4,500.00 No Bid $3,260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

One Ton Small Steel Wheel Roller Daily No Bid $325.00 $850.00 $451.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid $675.00 $1,100.00 $950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,295.00 $2,200.00 $1,649.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Minimum 114 HP Kubota Farm Type Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.00 $500.00

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $920.00 $1,300.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,300.00 $2,300.00

4 Wheel Drive Boom Mower w/Tractor Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/6ft. Mower Deck 23 ft. boom reach Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat 262C Skid Steer Loader (Hi-Flo) Daily No Bid $590.00 No Bid No Bid $600.00 No Bid No Bid

73hp or equal, Rubber Tracks Weekly No Bid $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid $1,150.00 No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $2,350.00 No Bid No Bid $2,050.00 No Bid No Bid

Cat 226B Skid Steer Loader 59 hp Daily No Bid $530.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Auger 8" - 36" bits for Skid Steer Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $272.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00

Loader Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $341.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $410.00 No Bid No Bid $275.00

BIDDERS
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Angle Broom for Skid Steer Daily No Bid $340.00 No Bid $385.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Loader Weekly No Bid $425.00 No Bid $495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $820.00 No Bid $972.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

 

Cold Planner for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Forks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $315.00 No Bid $299.58 $150.00 No Bid $100.00

 Weekly No Bid $350.00 No Bid $373.95 $225.00 No Bid $125.00

Monthly No Bid $430.00 No Bid $548.17 $450.00 No Bid $210.00

Hydraulic Hammer for Ski Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid $377.00 $285.00 No Bid $175.00

Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid $653.00 $600.00 No Bid $420.00

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,454.91 $1,450.00 No Bid $860.00

Tracks for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brush Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid $695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rotary Cutter for Skid Steer Loader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Portable Screening Plant Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model 271 or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid $15,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Milling Machine Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Writgen 2000 or equivalent with operators Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid $28,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDDERS
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Mauldin 1750-C Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid $11,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat AP600D Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cat AP1000D Asphalt Spreader Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 Cubic Yard Rear Loader Garbage Truck Daily No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

or equal Weekly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monthly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Exceptions: 

United Rentals - Foley - charging an additional $250.00 for delivery ($125.00 to deliver and $125.00 to pick-up; this additional amount is reflected in the bid amounts listed

BIDDERS


