
COMPETITIVE BID #WG20-15 Bid Tabulation

Pipe, Concrete - Circular & Arch

Foley Products Co. Alabama Pipe & Supply Construction Materials Fortiline Water Works Gulf Atlantic Culvert

Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up

Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount

15" RCP C-3 $13.78 $13.40 $14.05 No Bid No Bid

15" BEVELED END SECTION $48.15 *$370.00 $51.50 No Bid No Bid

18" RCP C-3 $16.80 $15.57 $17.15 No Bid No Bid

18" BEVELED END SECTION $51.18 *$387.00 $52.25 No Bid No Bid

21" RCP C-3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24" RCP C-3 $24.75 $21.54 $25.25 No Bid No Bid

24" BEVELED END SECTION $59.13 *$497.00 $59.95 No Bid No Bid

27" RCP C-3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30" RCP  C-3 $35.55 $31.30 $36.25 No Bid No Bid

30" BEVELED END SECTION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36" RCP C-3 $46.60 $43.40 $48.55 No Bid No Bid

36" BEVELED END SECTION No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42" RCP C-3 $59.80 $60.97 $60.95 No Bid No Bid

48" RCP C-3 $82.40 $81.61 $81.95 No Bid No Bid

54" RCP C-3 $117.70 No Bid $118.90 No Bid No Bid

60" RCP C-3 $136.10 $122.53 $145.50 No Bid No Bid

66" RCP C-3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72" RCP C-3 $199.10 $180.25 $211.10 No Bid No Bid

84" RCP C-3 $336.56 No Bid $373.40 No Bid No Bid

96" RCP C-3 $478.80 $330.13 $532.25 No Bid No Bid

18"x11" RCP C-3 ARCH $21.00 $22.28 $24.65 No Bid No Bid

18"X11" BES No Bid *$456.00 $59.25 No Bid No Bid

22"X13" RCP C-3 ARCH $24.00 $24.31 $29.85 No Bid No Bid

22"X13 BES No Bid *$501.00 $64.05 No Bid No Bid

29"X18" RCP C-3 ARCH $34.00 $34.68 $41.85 No Bid No Bid

29"x18" BES No Bid *$522.00 $76.45 No Bid No Bid

36"x23" RCP C-3 ARCH $48.25 $46.26 $59.99 No Bid No Bid

36"X23" BES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44"x27" RCP C-3 ARCH $64.20 $62.76 $78.95 No Bid No Bid

44"X27" BES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51"x31" RCP C-3 ARCH $87.75 $78.55 $110.95 No Bid No Bid

58" X 36" RCP C-3 ARCH $113.60 $102.17 $137.95 No Bid No Bid

65" X40" RCP C-3 ARCH $141.45 $119.54 $170.85 No Bid No Bid

73"X45" RCP C-3 ARCH $177.60 $149.61 $213.95 No Bid No Bid

88"X54" RCP C-3 ARCH $228.75 No Bid $305.95 No Bid No Bid

EXCEPTIONS:

 

Alabama Pipe & Supply bid for some items as a "pair." Said bid amounts are indicated with an asterisk. 

Description 

Gulf Atlantic Culvert is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State, and did not include a bid bond as was required in the bid specifications.



Provision of High Density Polyethylene Corrugated Pipe

Foley Products Co. Alabama Pipe & Supply Construction Materials Fortiline Water Works Gulf Atlantic Culvert

Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up

Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount

4" No Bid $1.11 $1.16 $1.00 No Bid

6" No Bid $2.45 $2.52 $2.20 No Bid

8" No Bid $3.38 $3.75 $3.03 No Bid

10" No Bid $4.49 $4.91 $4.02 No Bid

12" No Bid $5.50 $5.98 $4.92 No Bid

15" No Bid $7.06 $7.70 $6.31 No Bid

18" No Bid $8.71 $8.74 $7.79 No Bid

24" No Bid $14.81 $15.18 $13.23 No Bid

30" No Bid $21.28 $21.15 $19.01 No Bid

36" No Bid $28.20 $27.75 $25.19 No Bid

42" No Bid $37.22 $36.10 $33.24 No Bid

48" No Bid $46.64 $43.90 $41.65 No Bid

EXCEPTIONS:

Gulf Atlantic Culvert is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State, and did not include a bid bond as was required in the bid specifications.

 

 

 

Competitive Bid # WG20-15 Bid Tabulation 

Diameter



Provision of High Performance Polypropylene Pipe (PP)

Foley Products Co. Alabama Pipe & Supply Construction Materials Fortiline Water Works Gulf Atlantic Culvert

Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up

Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount

12" No Bid $6.90 $7.10 $6.16 No Bid

15" No Bid $7.78 $7.90 $6.96 No Bid

18" No Bid $10.48 $10.60 $9.37 No Bid

24" No Bid $18.29 $18.50 $16.34 No Bid

30" No Bid $28.96 $29.39 $25.87 No Bid

36" No Bid $31.83 $32.29 $28.43 No Bid

42" No Bid $38.76 $39.33 $34.62 No Bid

48" No Bid $53.63 $54.41 $47.89 No Bid

60" No Bid $86.14 $85.45 $76.92 No Bid

EXCEPTIONS:

Gulf Atlantic Culvert is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State, and did not include a bid bond as was required in the bid specifications.

 

 

 

Competitive Bid # WG20-15 Bid Tabulation 

Diameter



Pipe - Corrugated Round & Arch Bituminous Coated (Metal)

Foley Products Co. Alabama Pipe & Supply Construction Materials Fortiline Water Works Gulf Atlantic Culvert

Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up

Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount

6" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.52

15" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.46

18" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.48

21" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.11

24" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.99

30" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.43

36" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.13

42" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.08

48" 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.64

15" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.12

18" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.64

21" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.66

24" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.19

30" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.73

36" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.78

42" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.32

48" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.95

54" 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.09

21" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.98

48" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.49

54" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $88.85

60" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.77

66" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $108.69

72" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.96

78" 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Competitive Bid # WG20-15 Bid Tabulation 

Diameter Gage

Corrugated Metal Culvert Pipe (2.66")



36" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $121.93

66" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.15

72" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $146.36

78" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17X13 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.06

21x15 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.39

24x18 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.21

28x20 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.39

35x24 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.18

42x29 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.73

49x33 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.54

57x38 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17X13 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.62

21x15 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.44

24x18 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.76

28x20 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.59

35x24 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.51

42x29 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.61

49x33 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.83

57x38 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

64x43 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24x18 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



28x20 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35x24 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42x29 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49x33 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.56

57x38 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.29

64x43 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.25

71x47 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.78

77x52 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42x29 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49x33 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

57x38 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

64x43 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

71x47 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.15

77x52 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.99

83x57 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $154.13

57x 38 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

64x43 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

71x47 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

77x52 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

83x57 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Corrugated Metal Culvert Pipe (5" x 1" Corrugation)



78 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

102 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

108 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

114 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

120 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

102 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

108 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

114 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

120 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

126 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

132 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

138 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

144 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 

60 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



84 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

96 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

102 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

108 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

114 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

120 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40x31 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46x36 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

53x41 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60x46 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66x51 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73x55 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

81x59 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

87x63 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

95x64 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

103x71 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112x75 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40x31 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46x36 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

53x41 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60x46 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66x51 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73x55 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

81x59 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

87x63 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

95x67 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

103x71 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112x75 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

53x41 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60x46 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66x51 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73x55 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

81x59 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

87x63 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

95x67 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

103x71 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112x75 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

117x79 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

128x83 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



137x87 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

142x91 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

81x59 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

87x63 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

95x67 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

103x71 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112x75 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

117x79 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

128x83 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

137x87 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

142x91 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66x51 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73x55 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

81x59 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

87x63 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

95x64 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

103x71 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112x75 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

117x79 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

128x83 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

137x87 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

142x91 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

EXCEPTIONS:

Gulf Atlantic Culvert is not registered with the Alabama Secretary of State, and did not include a bid bond as was required in the bid specifications.


