BALDWIN COUNTY

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
P.O.Box 220 JOEY NUNNALLY, P.E.
SILVERHILL, ALABAMA 36576 COUNTY ENGINEER
TELEPHONE: (251)937-0371
Fax (251)937-0201

March 19, 2020

Baldwin County Commission
312 Courthouse Square
Bay Minette, AL 36507
Re: Baldwin County Resurfacing Projects FY 2020: Group 3 & Group 3RA, BCR-2020-3
BALDWIN COUNTY
AREA 300
Dear Commissioners:
My office has thoroughly reviewed the bids taken on January 16, 2020, for the above referenced
projects. John G. Walton was the low bidder under Alternative 1 with a bid of $2,399,077.57.
The estimated budget amount for FY20 Resurfacing Projects Group 3 & Group 3RA was
$2,576,811.00.
The low bidder John G. Walton had no errors in their bid proposal.
Each bid package has been reviewed for the inclusion of the appropriate bid bond.

Based on this information, it is my recommendation that the Baldwin County Commission award
this contract to the lowest bidder, John G. Walton.

If you have any questions or comments, please give me a call at 251-937-0371

Sincerely,

A

Jogy Nunnally, P.E.
unty Engineer

IN/js

ATTACHMENT
cc:File



BID TAB SUMMARY - RESURFACING GROUP 3 & 3RA (3/18/2020) | :
| indexed Asphalt Cost:__| Ammons & Blackman | Mobile Asphalt | John G. Walton HCL Contracting
Alternate 1 - Ten Roads - All Labor and Material I N/A |TOTAL; No Bid |TDTAL: No Bid |TCITAL: S 2,395,077.57 |TOTAL: No Bid

Alternate 2 - Ten Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix Is 1,905,228.66 [Lay Down: S 550,112.64 |Lay Down: S 539,140.00 |Lay Down: No Bid [Lay Down: S 710,024.95
|ToTAL: § 2,455,341.30 |TOTAL: $ 2,444,368.66 | TOTAL: No Bid JroTaL: $ 2,615,253.61

Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

Contract Included Yes Yes Yes Yes

| Alternate 1 (All Labor and Material)| $ , 2,399,077.57 |lohn G. Walton {actual low bid is *$2,399,077.57)

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE:

I. JOEY NUNNALLY, P.E., COp TRUCT ON ENGINEER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE.




Altarnate 1 - Ten Roads - All Labar and Material AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT | JonnG watton. . | HCL CONTRACTING
PROJECT NO. ROAD NAME UNIT ary UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID FRICE
SO W LI —
GALLON 303
0718519 AUDUBON DR OFF (R 10 ToN m
LUMP SUM 1
PROJECTHO. ROAD NAME UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
A05A-D00 JTACK COAT ;lT.[W ? ]
G00AD00_[MOBILIZATION LUMPSUM 1
TOIA-301 | SOUD WHITE, CLASS 18, TYPE A TRAFHC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 2
7014304 _|BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRUPE (5™ WIDE) MILE 2
S0UD YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFC STRIPE (5” WIDE) MILE 1
oatazng | MNALRDFROMCR 16 T0| 7016002 TRAOKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFICSTRIPE [PAINT) YELLOW MILE 2
m12s 701C003_|SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1
[TRAFFIC CONTROL MASKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 58
TEMPGRARY TRAFHIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET s8
BC723__|BALOWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON o 1113
7400-000 |PiLOT CAR EACH 1
8C000 | DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SQUARE YARD B
PROJECTNO. ITEMND. UNIT ary UNIT PRICE &ID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
QTEA.EI:II TACK COAT GALLON 859
$10H.000_|MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1
600A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1
T01A-301_[SOUD WHITE, CLASS 14, TYPE A TRAFTIC STRIPE (5 WIDE) MILE 2
FOIA-304  |BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (S° WIDE) MILE 2
) FOIAI08_|SOUD YELLOW, CLASS H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WiDE) MILE 2
0219319 kak‘l)uf:gﬂnmﬂs 016007 |BAOKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2
70IC003_[SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFIC STIPE (PAINTLYELLOW MILE 2
F03A-002 [TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SOUARE FEET 60
7030001 _|TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS ‘SOUARE FEET )
Bc-713 [BALDWIN C PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1307
BC-723L |BALDWIN COU! FPLANT MIX, LEVELING - FER TON TON 324
BC723P _[BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS FLANT MiX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 15
m—(‘;»ﬂ_ ROAD NAME ITEM NO. Om— m ud UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
|| *&Aom [tAccoaT GALLON 780
A10H-000  [MATERIAL REN EACH 1
E00A-000 LUIMP SUM 1
FO1A-301 |S00ID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5~ WIDE) MILE 2
COMNTY 125 Epoag |20 JOROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFTIC STRIE (5” WIDE) MILE 2
iy | iemoam AR T J01A-309 _1SOUD YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFHIC STRIFE [S® WIDE) MILE 2
aida F01C007_|BROXEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2
TOICH03  {SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2
7034002 | TRAFTIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 32
FU3D-001_| TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS. SQUARE FEET 2
60723 |BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS FLANT MIX - PER TON ToN 1481
7400-000 |PROTCAR EACH 1
PROJECT NO. ROAD MANE ITEM ND. |DESCRIFTION UNIT ary UNIT PRICE __;I-IIFI)CE ﬂ.ll-ﬂPllI:E BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLDN 173
A10H 000 [MATERIAL 3 EACH 1
EO0A-N00 LUMP SUM 1
701A301 _[S0LID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE] MLE a
JOIA304 |BROKEN YELLOW. CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE |5” WIDE) MiLE 2
arigsre | VERNANTPARSRD | 7014309 JSOUD YEWLOW, CLASS i, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIFE (5 WIDE) MILE 2
FROM CR12STOCR2G | 010002 |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT}YELLOW MLE 2
FOIC-003  |SOUD TEMPORARY TRAFHC STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2
7031002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 92
T030-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS. SOUARE FEET 92
BC-723 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINGUS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 235
7400000 _|PLOT CAR EACH 1
PROIECT NO. TEM NO. |DEscAIPTION UNT ar’ UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
A05A-000 §TACK COAT GALLON 1349
410h000_[MATERIAL E EACH 1
E00A-000 | LUMP SUM 1
POIAS0L_{SOLID WHITE, QLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE |5 WIDE) MILE 4
aposyy | CARDWERRDFROMCC | 7014303 |BROKEN VELOW, CLASS 1, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIE (5 WIDE) MILE 2
ADTOCRSL F01A-300_[SOUD YELLOW, CLASS TH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5 WDE) MILE z
F01C-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2
F01C-003_[SOUD TEMPORATY TRAFFIC STIFE (PAINT)-YELLOW [ 2
BC-T23 BALIWIN COUNTY PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 2560
7400000 |PROT CAR EACH 1
PROJECT 1O, TTEM NO. UNIT qry UNIT FRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE EID FRICE
[ AIGA-D00 | TACK CORT GALLON 73
4104000 | MATERIAL REMIING DEVICE EACH 1
6004000 | MOBILLATION LUIMP SUM 1
F01A-301  ISOUID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [5° WIDE) MILE L]
J01A-304 | BROKEN YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 2
7017309 [SOLID YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MILE 3
0219719 m“";:‘; ?;::,m':‘ FOIC007 | BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFC STRIPE [PAINTHVELLOW MILE 2
) 701C-003_[SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE (PAINT]-YELLOW MILE 3
JO3A-002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SOUARE FEET 58
703D-001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 58
BC-723 | BALDWAN COUNTY BITUMINOLIS PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 5020
BC-7237 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINOUS PLANT MIX, PATCHING - PER TON TON 127
7400000 _|PILOT CAR EACH 1




FROJECT NO. ROAD NAME ITEMNO. [DESCRIFTION uniT ary UNIT PRICE 81D FRICE T PRICE BID PRICE
405A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 01
A10H-000 | MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1
G00A-000_[MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1
TOLA-301 _|SOLID WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE |5” WIDE) MILE 2
7OLA-304_|BAOKEN YELLOW, CLASS 14, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE} MILE 1
pA-gzagz | SPANTHAMRDFROM | TOIA303 |S0UD YELLOW, CLASS I, TYPE A TRAFFICSTRIE [5* WDE) MUE 2
CAETOUSHWY 98 7DIC002 | BADKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 1
FULCO03 _|S0UD TEMPORARY TRAFFIL STIPE (PAINT)-YELLOW MILE 2
TU3A002 | TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SOUARE FEET 68
F030-001 _[TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MATRKINGS SOUARE FEET 8
BC-723 N C PLANT MIX - PER TON TON 1141
7500-000_|PILOT CAR EACH 1
PROJECT NO.. "m I-IE ary UMNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
A05A-000 | TACK COAT GALLON 3252
A10H000[MATERIAL ICE Eacit 1
BO0A-000 LUMP SUM 1
FO1A-301 | SOLID WHITE, CLASS TH, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MILE 10
FOIA-304 | BROKE YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFTIC STRIPE (5° WIDE) MIE 3
J0IA-300_|SOUD YELLOW, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5° WiDE) MILE 3
RA- 0219919 mm:mm B F01C002 | BROXEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE [PAINT}-VELLOW MIE 3
FOLC-003 _|SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW. MILE 3
ADO2_| TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SQUARE FEET 7
30001 | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SOUARE FEET 72
BC-723 BALDWIN COUNTY MIX - PER TON TON 6200
7400000 |PIOT CAR EACH 1
SOUARE YARD 16
ROAD NAME ? arny UMIT PRICE BID FRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
e GALLON 6118
HCRETE P A b
AABEI mmunm&nmmmmmwlﬁu s Tou e
600A-000 | MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1
F01A-301 |SOLUD WHITE, CLASS 1H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WIDE) MOLE 18
o s | P i s e A ST ] -
HWY 5B TOCRAB. A
FOIC-002  |BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE (PAINT) YELLOW MILE 2
701C-003_[SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINT)-YELLOW MILE [
FOEA-D02 | TRAFHC CONTROL MARIKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPE A SCOUARE FEET 136
7030-001_| TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FEET 136
BC-721 | BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMSNOUS PLANT MIX - PER TON ToN 9716
BC900 Inmv[w BACKS SOUARE YARD 218
Graup 3 Total Bid| No Bid

Graup 3 RA Total Bid)

TOTAL BID|

UNIT PRI WD PRICE

UNTFRICE | BIDFRICE |

U rRicE | BoPRice |
No Bid

Mo Bid

No Bid




zuumm2-'rmnnd:-ﬂl-borandmmnﬂmugt Cotunty provided asghalt wa noted by ¥ | AMMONS & BLACKMON MOBILE ASPHALT JOHN G. WALTON HCL CONTRACTING

FROJECT 0. 'ROAD NAME TEMHO, |DESCRIPTIGH UNIT ary GHIT PRICE BID PRICE BID FRICE UNIT FRICE 21D FRICE ST PRICE RIS PRICE

| AT [TACKEonT ShIGN TR T esi3  yamrls ats|s  aaras s smls  amem
L

ORISELS - (AUDLRGY DROKF CRIC| 4245236 ﬁmﬂ&mﬁ'ﬁm%&“ﬁm“w“m Tou s 210 $ 008 500 s puls  osmris
0 000 [MONRRATION LUKeSUM 1 |s 25000 1 § asnoaf s 50000 | § 50000 5 aa0000 |5 30000

PROIEET 110 ROADFIAME ITEM HO, [DESCRIPTICH "G are UNIT PRICE BIDPRILE UNIT PRICE BID FRKE UATT FRAKE BID PRICE eIt PRICE BID PACE
ZOSA 00 _[TATK CoNT aatiey el g A5 16 e B dis |3 2,305 $ 5403 3,15080
£00A-000 IMDﬂ\uMnDN LUHPSUM 1|5 _aweels aaiop aopnls 10000 $ 400005 4poono
70U [EGUD WABTE, ELASS 111, TYPE A THAFFIC STRIPE {5° WIDE) MILE 2 s  awswm]s  z3weols a000|$ 190000 $  1mee0ls  a66d0a)
TOLA-I0_|OCKEN YELLOW, CIASS L TYPE A TRAFFIC SYRIPE (5” WIOE) HILE = Is 50015 ddsom]s sseoals 370000 $ koo ls 1emm
TOLAHA_[SGLID YELLOW, CLASS $H, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5* WIDE] MILE Lo ]s  tamels  sapse]d w000 |s 95000 § 390008 133.00]
artgzin [HALLAOFRAMCRISTOl TTBECUN” [ACHEN TEMPORARY TRASFICSTRRE (PRRTHELLOW WIE I 95000 [ 8 az000|$ 009 |8 30000 5 I T
mus JOLCO0 [ SOLI TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAINTI-YELLGW. MILE [ ) a0 | ¢ e El ot | g 78000 ) 25400 [ ¢ z31.00 |
JOU D02 [TRAFFIC OONTROL MATRBIGS, CIASS 2 TYPEA SQUARE £ERT se |4 s o] § 3758 14750 ¢ 565 | & e
TOI0 DAL | TEMAORARY TRAF AC CONTROL MATKINGS SOUARE FEET 58 E 1.00 | 8 174.00 § 5 ir)g 257.50 [] 340 | 19020
GE721"_ [ BALGWIN CXRNTY BMTUMIRIGAS FEART MIX - FER TOH ToH FETY ¢ swrsels us|d 3335600 $ 1267 |5 100005
00000 |RILOT CAR FACH 1 |s N oo ]s 0oL § 00l 4 =00 |§ w500
80900 |DRIVEWAY CUT-BACKS SOUARE YATD s |35 1000 |5  1om]s 15.00 | 135,00 3 62340 | § " sk1000
PRONECTHO. | ROADHAME e, |SECRFTON [ G| UNIFPRICE IFPRICE UFET PRICE B0 PRICE TS FRICE BB FAICE |
oot ey .t
AGSA-000_[TACK COAT GALLDR [FEH 45§ 5 356485 $ SAU|S  4E3mE0
401000 | MATERIN. RUMIXING DEAICE FACH 1 4 oL | § $ L 3 544000 | § 545000
L0ATON_[NOmUZANGH LUME SurA 1 3 14000 | § $ 150000 s 430000 | 5 AE000
Z0UA- 0L Immmmsu TYPE A TIVAFFIZ ST [57 WIbE) WILE 2 |&  3psm ¢ 400000 $ aoee|s ]
J0IA-301_ [RROKEN VELLOW, CLASS 14, TYPE A TRAEHS STRIPE {5” WIBE) MILE 2 $ 25§ Pl asno s 1,700.00 5 Rrzoe )5 1,544.00 |
bR 125 bR J50UD YEUOW, CLASS TIL TYPE ATIAFFIC STRIPE (5 WADE} MULE 7 Is  simseo|s 20003 w0005 190000 5 aamoele  aemam0
0 oz TGIC002_UROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE[PAI) YELOW MIE z |4 womo |6 umasofs w000 |5 130000 § c6to |$ 19a800
FRICO01_JS0AID TEMPORARY TRATFIC STIPE [PAINY]-VELOW MILE P womo [ szecals o000 [$  sanoc0 s w6400 |3 1mmoe
FOIA002 [TRAFFIC CONIRODL RAARRINS, CLASS D, TYPEA SOUAREFEET [ E 5008 sl s %24 K3 225 00 5 555 | & 395.00
000001 $TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROLMARKINGS SOUAREFEET & a0 s 000 an|s 225.00 240 |3 204.00
" TN 1307 Ru|s  60i6ie 100§ uhea00 w8 140253
Tou an R Y T 1200]8 588500 n6ls  rwmom
To 15 wm)$ 15000 woools 150000 1933 [8 " ysmass

PAGIECI NO.| | ROAEHAME GHIr ar UNIT PRICE D PRICE UNIT PRICE PID PRICE UHIT PRICE UNIT PRICE HID ARICE

e s et ——r B

GALLOH B0 1§ 435 |4 331500 4155 3,237.00 ) 540 4,212 0
41041.000_| MATFRIAL REVIING DEVICE BACH 1 |s o0l $ o1 $ e 5.555.00
EG0A-000_|MOBIUZATION LUMP SUM 4 s 1000 §_ 16000 5 AEO000 4,800.00
17004301 |11 WHIE, CLASS 114, TYPE A TRATFICSTTITE {57 WIDE) MHE z |s  mm § im0 $._ 1me|d 2660
OIA-30_| ROKESE YELLCHW, CLASS HH, TVPE ATRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WasE) MRE 7|3 n500 Y] $ 00 fs 600
SIS | ot TOIAI_[50Ly YW, 1Ay UL TVPEA TRAHIL 1R (5 Wite) MHE T |6 suse S sooon PN T PR T
ma JOICOTZ_| BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIIPE [PAIHT) YELLOW MILE 2 |4 #5090 5 33000 § seeon (¢ aomece
201000 | S0LID TEMPORARY TAAFFIC STIPE (PAINT) YELLOW ME 2 3 BYANG i 1,400.00 3 a6400 | 4 1,328.00
FOADTE | TRAFTIC COMTROLMARKINGS, CiASS 2, TYPEA SOUAREFEET 2 s 500 5 12000 s 65 |3 21280
FIB-O0L_| TEMPORARY TRATEIC CON RO MARKINGS SOLARE FEET 32 {g 300 35 sx0.00 4 340 5 10800
BC723% | BAUDWIN COUHTY GITUMRNOUS PLANT MIX - PER FOH TOH LTI Y B0 $__ mses ) 9528  womna2
| - 400000 |PILT CATL 'E:EH 1 3 001 5 001 3 350,00 | 3 B56.00

PAOJECT MO, HOAD HAME TIRM HG. | DESCRIPTRON Uiy ary BID pilCE \REY PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE O PRICE
WEA D0 [TACKCOAT CALL R D 5 asuwss s sa0]f  Gamzo
10000 _| MATERAL BEMIING DEVRE EACH F a0 s oDt §  somscals  sosspo
00n 000 _[MORRITATIOH LUMP SUM. 3 I8 zoesm|$ 5 3200 $ st cmen
F1A-30t {5010 WIHTE, CIASS 1M, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5™ WADEL MILE 4_1¢ el 5 280000 3 tareals  oamoo
7014-30_| DROKEH ¥ELLOW, CLASS 111, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE [5° WIDE] MILE Pl 2500 |3 § 1m0 3 0003~ asivee
e VERNANTPARK AT | 701A-209 15040 yTHAOW, CLASS 14, 1YPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WiE} LR 1 3 110500 | % 3 180000 § 133200 | § 2,664.00
FROM R 125 TOCN 25 [ 700007 |ERONER TEMPORANY TAAF AIC S TRIE [SAINT). YELLOW MIE 2 s #sno0 | $ 3 1000 3 sst00le asmmoe
2010003 _|SCLN TEMPORARY TRAHFIC STIRE [PAINTMVEGW MILE 2 15 asnoo [ & $..ldoooy $ o510 |3 aoane
004000 |TRAFHIC CONTAOL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPEA SQUARE FEET W ¢ 00 |4 s 345,00 3 65 | & 51180
F037001_[TEMPORATY TRAFHIE.CONTAGL MANKINGS SOUAREFEET m Ty s $ 3500 ] 240 |4 1280
523" |RALDAH COURTY BHUMINDIS PLANT MIX - PERTOH 2268 Bo0 | % § w0 s 633 ][5  inmise
7406000 _[PROTCAR ENN B am]s 5 [T 3 250.00 [ st |

PROILCY 110, RGAD NAME WWEN N0, [DESCRIPTION BID PRICE FPAICE B0 PRICE RN PARCE BIDPRICE
MEAOW_|TACGK COAT 5 b59mas $ SAV[S  zaeden
AI0H 000 [MATEMAL REMIXING DEVICE B oo 5 sEmst |5 seeso0
E00A-000 |MORTLZATION s 2,800.00 3 SA0000 | & £,300,00
T01A-301 _[sauin waiE, CUASS H, 140E A TRAFFIC STRIPE {5® WADE) §... 380000 . aarmls  sueo
oagsrn | ERRPNERSC R [ FOAIOL [BROKEN VeIOw, CLASS 1, TYE ATRAFFIC STRIE 5 WIOE) $ 1000 3 oo l:  astaw
POTOCRST FOIA 09 _[SGUU YELLUW, CLASS 1L TNPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE{S® WDt} $__ 190000 $  tmegle  asam
FMC-002 [BROKEH TEMPORARY TRATFIC STRIPE JPANIT) VELLOW 3 130000 H 90400 | $ 1,938 00
701C003_|S00ID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE {PAIN L FELLOW E 1,400.00 H 96400 | § 1,92850
AG-7130 Iwmwucuumv LAHY MR- PER TGN 5 _biooy $ 553 |3 24,05, 60
A0 [PILOT CAR naifd 001 5 5000 [ § Py

FROJECT HO, ADAD NAME 1TER NQ. JDESCRIPTON GRIF FRItE BiD FRIEE UHIE pAiCy EID FAICE UHST PRICE IO FRICE
A 00 [TACK CORT GAUCH 5 s HA5 |5 1105805 ) 540 |8 leman
AL 000 _|MATETUAT REMIKIHG DEVICE Aol 1 s on s o ds voifs 6oL $  narer )4 asovmog
GOOA 000 N b St 1 $ - |% - % swapafs  s1mm § 500 |3 5,100.00
TOA3U [SOUD WINTE, E1ASS 11, TYPEATRAFHE STAIPE 4 WIDE} MuE L] Lsm ls  asace) semols o smm §  1smpols  nssEe
F0LASM |BROKEN VILLOW, CLASS 11, TYPE A TRAFFIC STRIPE (5 WiDE) e 2 s s s 1450004 5o f3 1000 8 ol isum
SURS—— lwnmmww.msmwsArwncsrmals'wwﬁ MuE 3 ¢ rusonls  amsemls p5000 fS  2AsEe s _1anools  assem
onsy1a lbisind T0c002_[IRGReN TEMPORARY TRAFTICSTRITE {FAINT veLlw [ 2 Is woos s wwooo]s sso00ls  dsmes [ seeon 4 asee0e
F0IC003 [5G0 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STIPE [PAIRT]-YELLOW MIE 1 s BS0.00 255000 | & mwooels 20w 3 a6400 |3 zmzma
7OIND02_| TAEHC CONTROL MARKINGS, CLASS 2, TYPEA "SOUARK FFEV % |3 505 w000 ] & e 21250 3§ GES |3 285,70
F040.000 | TEMPORARY TRAFAC CONTROL MARKINGS SOUARE FEET 58 3 300 | 3 pell g ] AT tS 21750 5 340 |3 g
RC-7a3*  [MALDWIN COUNTY FLANT bRk - PER TON TOR 0 Iy am|i 401600015 70 fS 3604400 3 562 |4  AR26240
BC7236% | BALDWIN COUNTY SITUMIHERIS PIANT MIK, PATCHING - PERTON 10 1w |s ismls  imaeeds spog b4 s3noo ) 2or|s as61a]
740G 000 [PILOT CAR EATH R s w1 s 001 | § [ §  wnem|s  s7wco




e re—— e — reteeer - e I — — —
FROJECT HO ROAD KAE RANO. |o:mm-non URIr arv UNT PRICE 30 PRICE URAT PRICE WIDFRICE AT 2RICE. 10 PAICE LIATT PRICE BIDPRICE
4e5a-000_|rack cont GAULON |3 435 |5  assensis ads|8§  pamaas s 540|3  3zsa0
SIR000 | MATERIAL REAANIPG DEVICE EACH 1 | a2 anls oo | ¢ P $ 300000 250000
A IMBBIIIZI“EIN LUMP SUM 3|6 wena)d  agepon]s  1soopols ws0q00 $ o HE000)S | 251000
T01A-301 [SOiH0 WIHIE, CLASS S, TYPEA VRAFFIC STRIPE (5" WA AIE 2 s 1amsmm $ 55000 300,00 $___raeowls s
TONA-I0_|UROKEH YEHOW, OASS I TYFEA (=" WinE) MAE 1 s 72500 | § el B Bsomp | § 85000 5 anools 2200
A o2iga | GRANTIAMRDTRON | TOIA309 |SOLD VELLOW, CLASS 31k TYPEATRAFFICSTRIPE (S VIDE) MIE T s aamse0l3  zasoefs soon|s  ss0000 3. tamools e
CRBTOUSINYSE | vpic002 [BROKEN TEMPRRARY TRAFFIG STISPE (PANTHELLOW AHLE 1 $ B5040 | § it ES ES000 | 4 550.00 $ 95400 | $ 64.00
FHICO08_[50LID TEMPORAKY TRAFFIC STIAE (PAINT} YEUCW WHE P B5000 |3 ageocafs 0000 | § 140000 5 S5L00 1078 00
203A-002_| TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKIHGS, CLASS 2, FWPEA SOUARE FEET & |3 500 | 3 uam |3 anls 25500 $ 685 |3 452,20
7630-001 lrmmwmwncmwmmmmss SOUARE FEET ¥ 500 |5 e b 37514 255,00 s sae]g .10
16325 [BALDWIN COUNTY BITUMINDUS 1 AHT MiX - PER TOH ] [N Y o008 iwamocfs Py P $ samls  zesuam
- EACH i s LY S noifs JooLls 0.01 3 a540 | § 425,00
PAOIECTRT. | ROADHAME [ (] UNIT PRICE BID PAICK UNITPRICE RO PRICE LT PRIGE FIDZRICE NI FRECE RIDFRICE
SALLGN 25 |3 X35 ¢ el s a8 agmsen $ 54003 izssas
4101000 _|MATEISAL REMINIHG DEVICE TATH 1|3 001 | $ 05 | 3 &8l | $ Q01 3 aamspoc[s  asson
BO0A-000 | MOBIIZATION 1UMPSUM, Lt 18  amoua|d  sveapald  daooonfd  Ga00my $  ozwos|s  92sam
2010301 _|SGLID WITE, €IASS 31, TYPE A TRAFTIE STRIPE |S* WIDE) MIE 16 |8 1amwis  umew]d sseoe |5 350000 $  1aaoag  13mom
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