CRUSHED AGGREGATES BID WG21-05
AREA 100

Award Listing

Effective 1/19/2021 through 1/19/2022

Stephens Trucking Company, Inc.

Vulcan Materials Company, Inc.

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Graestone Aggregates, LLC

C.R. Pate Logging, Inc.

PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY
Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only N/A Bay Bridge, Mobile Blakeley, Mobile Saraland, AL Theodore, AL Mobile, AL Andalusia, AL
CRUSHED GRAVEL

ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #57 No Bid 39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #78 No Bid 40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

ALDOT #467 No Bid 38.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #4 No Bid 38.00 28.00 35.77 No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.75 No Bid No Bid 27.99 36.00 No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 28.00 35.77 No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.75 No Bid No Bid 27.99 36.00 No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #67 No Bid 38.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #78 No Bid 39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #89 No Bid 39.50 35.00 42.77 No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #8910 No Bid 37.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00 26.50
CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION

ALDOT CLASS 1 No Bid 39.25 44.00 51.77 No Bid No Bid 49.00 59.25 No Bid No Bid 46.00 54.00 25.00 38.00

ALDOT CLASS 2 No Bid 38.50 44.00 51.77 No Bid No Bid 49.00 59.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00 38.00

ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid 44.00 51.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.00 40.00

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE No Bid 37.00 44.00 51.77 No Bid No Bid 49.00 59.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.

2" X 0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6" x 2" COBBLES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE

825-A No Bid 36.00 26.00 33.77 No Bid No Bid 32.00 41.75 No Bid No Bid 26.00 34.00 No Bid No Bid

825-B No Bid 36.00 No Bid No Bid 23.75 31.52 32.00 41.25 26.00 39.25 26.00 34.00 14.00 26.50
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE

2" MINUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 18.00

WHITE SAND - WASHED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Low Bid Price is highlighted in yellow

Supply Locations
Martin Marietta - Calera, AL

Hard Rock - Titus, AL
Dunn - Saginaw, AL
Dunn - Longview, AL

Supply Locations

Pride - Mobile, AL
SACTUN - Mobile, AL

Supply Locations
Maylene - Saraland, AL
O'Neal - Saraland, AL
Bahama - Theodore, AL

Supply Locations
Winn Materials

Lafarge Three Rivers Quarry
N. Montgomery Materials

Supply Locations
Brooklyn Limestone -

Andalusia, AL

Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the prime bidder.




CRUSHED AGGREGATES BID WG21-05
AREA 200

Award Listing

Effective 1/19/2021 through 1/19/2022

Stephens Trucking Company, Inc.

Vulcan Materials Company, Inc.

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Graestone Aggregates, LLC

C.R. Pate Logging, Inc.

PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY
Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only N/A Bay Bridge, Mobile Blakeley, Mobile Saraland, AL Theodore, AL Mobile, AL Andalusia, AL
CRUSHED GRAVEL

ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #57 No Bid 41.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #78 No Bid 42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

ALDOT #467 No Bid 41.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #4 No Bid 40.00 28.00 35.00 No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid 27.99 38.00 No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 28.00 35.00 No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid 27.99 38.00 No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #67 No Bid 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #78 No Bid 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #89 No Bid 41.50 35.00 42.00 No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #8910 No Bid 39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00 29.50
CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION

ALDOT CLASS 1 No Bid 41.25 44.00 51.00 No Bid No Bid 49.00 58.50 No Bid No Bid 46.00 56.00 25.00 39.00

ALDOT CLASS 2 No Bid 40.50 44.00 51.00 No Bid No Bid 49.00 58.50 No Bid No Bid 46.00 56.00 25.00 39.00

ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid 44.00 51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00 42.00

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE No Bid 39.00 44.00 51.00 No Bid No Bid 49.00 58.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.

2" X 0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6" x 2" COBBLES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE

825-A No Bid 38.00 26.00 33.00 No Bid No Bid 32.00 40.50 No Bid No Bid 26.00 36.00 No Bid No Bid

825-B No Bid 38.00 No Bid No Bid 23.75 30.75 32.00 40.50 25.50 36.25 26.00 36.00 14.00 28.00
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE

2" MINUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 20.50

WHITE SAND - WASHED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Low Bid Price is highlighted in yellow

Supply Locations
Martin Marietta - Calera, AL

Hard Rock - Titus, AL
Dunn - Saginaw, AL
Dunn - Longview, AL

Supply Locations

Pride - Mobile, AL
SACTUN - Mobile, AL

Supply Locations
Maylene - Saraland, AL
O'Neal - Saraland, AL
Bahama - Theodore, AL

Supply Locations
Winn Materials

Lafarge Three Rivers Quarry
N. Montgomery Materials

Supply Locations
Brooklyn Limestone -

Andalusia, AL

Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the prime bidder.




CRUSHED AGGREGATES BID WG21-05
AREA 300

Award Listing

Effective 1/19/2021 through 1/19/2022

Stephens Trucking Company, Inc.

Vulcan Materials Company, Inc.

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Graestone Aggregates, LLC

C.R. Pate Logging, Inc.

PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY PICK-UP | DELIVERY
Plant or Yard Location for Pick-up Only N/A Bay Bridge, Mobile Blakeley, Mobile Saraland, AL Theodore, AL Mobile, AL Andalusia, AL
CRUSHED GRAVEL

ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #57 No Bid 43.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #78 No Bid 44.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

ALDOT #467 No Bid 43.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #4 No Bid 42.00 28.00 36.50 No Bid No Bid 32.50 43.25 No Bid No Bid 27.99 42.00 No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid 28.00 36.50 No Bid No Bid 32.50 43.25 No Bid No Bid 27.99 42.00 No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #67 No Bid 42.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 43.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #78 No Bid 43.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 43.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #89 No Bid 43.00 35.00 43.50 No Bid No Bid 32.50 43.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #8910 No Bid 41.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.50 43.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00 30.50
CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION

ALDOT CLASS 1 No Bid 43.25 44.00 52.50 No Bid No Bid 49.00 60.75 No Bid No Bid 46.00 50.00 25.00 41.00

ALDOT CLASS 2 No Bid 42.50 44.00 52.50 No Bid No Bid 49.00 60.75 No Bid No Bid 46.00 50.00 25.00 41.00

ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid 44.00 52.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00 44.00

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE No Bid 41.00 44.00 52.50 No Bid No Bid 49.00 60.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD.

2" X 0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6" x 2" COBBLES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE

825-A No Bid 40.00 26.00 34.50 No Bid No Bid 32.00 42.50 No Bid No Bid 26.00 40.00 No Bid No Bid

825-B No Bid 40.00 No Bid No Bid 23.75 32.25 32.00 42.50 25.50 36.25 26.00 40.00 14.00 30.00
2" MINUS SCREENED LIMESTONE

2" MINUS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 22.50

WHITE SAND - WASHED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Low Bid Price is highlighted in yellow

Supply Locations
Martin Marietta - Calera, AL

Hard Rock - Titus, AL
Dunn - Saginaw, AL
Dunn - Longview, AL

Supply Locations

Pride - Mobile, AL
SACTUN - Mobile, AL

Supply Locations
Maylene - Saraland, AL
O'Neal - Saraland, AL
Bahama - Theodore, AL

Supply Locations
Winn Materials

Lafarge Three Rivers Quarry
N. Montgomery Materials

Supply Locations
Brooklyn Limestone -

Andalusia, AL

Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the prime bidder.
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