COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-18 AWARD LISTING
Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories
Effective: April 20, 2021 through April 20, 2022

BIDDER: Floyd's Exhaust & Performance Accessories, Inc.

GROUP #1

SPRAY IN BEDLINERS FOR PICKUP TRUCKS

Amount Bid
5.5 Foot Regular Bed $400.00 per vehicle
6.5 Foot Regular Bed $450.00 per vehicle
6.5 Foot Utility Bed $650.00 per vehicle
ECCO EW3225 25" ECCO LED BAR
Model Amount Bid
ECO EW3225 $470.00 each

BETTER BUILT SEC 70" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010901
Model Amount Bid
Better Built $419.95 each

BETTER BUILT SEC 72" DEEP SINGLE LID CROSSOVER 79010902
Model Amount Bid
Better Built $419.95 each

RIGID LED POD LIGHT 50231 IN PAIRS
Model Amount Bid
Rigid 502313 $398.99 each

DECKED LOCKABLE TRUCK STORAGE FULL BED UNIT PAR DF-4 TONNEAU COVER
Model Amount Bid
DCK DF-4 $1,349.99 each

TRIFOLD NON-LOCKABLE; BLACK

Model Amount Bid

Undercover $1,190.00 each

BIDDER: ProlLogic ITS, LLC

GROUP #2

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS

Model Amount Bid YEAR

Ram Mount Chev. Silv $227.09 each 2014-2019
Ram Mount Chev. Silv $164.74 each 2019-2020
Base Mount Amount Bid

Ram Base 2014-2019 $110.88 each

Ram Base 2019-2021 $40.60 each

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODEL 2021+

Model Amount Bid YEAR
RAM MOUNT FORD F250 $144.97 each 2017-2021
RAM BASE $28.24 each 2017-2021

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODEL

Model Amount Bid Year
RAM MOUNT FORD RANGER $160.29 2019-2021
RAM BASE No Bid

RAM COMPUTER MOUNTS - VEHICLE YEAR MODEL

Model Amount Bid Year
RAM MOUNT FORD EXPLORER $160.29 2020-2021
RAM BASE FORD EXPLORER $43.53 2020-2021

BROTHER POCKETJET 762 IN CAR PRINTER WITH BLUETOOTH

Model Amount Bid
POCKETIET 762 $303.05
Base Mount Amount Bid
RAM MOUNT PJ762 $71.88

RAM PLASTIC PRINTER MOUNT

Model Amount Bid
No Bid No Bid
Base Mount Amount Bid
No Bid No Bid

E-SEEK M-260 CARD READER AND CABLE

Model Amount Bid
E-Seek M260 $417.97
Base Mount Amount Bid

No Bid No Bid
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