
COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-20 Award Listing
Provision of Police Vehicle Equipment
Effective:  April 20, 2021 through April 20, 2022
BIDDER:                   DANA SAFETY SUPPLY, INC.
PK0228TAH21SCA SMC 10VS C2 RECESSED PANEL COATED POLY WINDOW SECURITY 2021+ TAHOE
Model: PK0228TAH21SCA
Amount Bid: $627.61 each
PK0123TAH212ND SMC 12VS EXP METAL CARGO PARTITION 2021+ TAHOE
Model: PK0123TAH212ND
Amount Bid: $333.95 each
WK0514TAH21 SMC WINDOW BARRIER VS STEEL VERTICAL 2021+ TAHOE
Model: WK0514TAH21
Amount Bid: $183.71 each
BK0534TAH21 SMC PB400- PUSH BUMPER 2021+ TAHOE
Model: WK0534TAH21
Amount Bid: $340.78 each
PK0228ITU12SCA SMC 10S-RP PARTITION - CTD POLY W/POLY COVER – PIUT
Model: PK0228ITU12SCA
Amount Bid: $627.61 each
PK0123ITU122ND SMC 12-VS EXP MTL CARGO BARRIER 2012+ FORD PIUT
Model: PK0123ITU122ND
Amount Bid: $333.95 each
WK514ITU12 SMC VERTICAL STEEL WINDOW BARS FOR 2013+ FORD PIUT
Model: WK0514ITU12
Amount Bid: $183.71 each
BK0534ITU16 SMC PB400 ALUMINUM PUSH BUMPER 2016+ PIUT
Model: BK0534ITU16
Amount Bid: $340.78 each
PK0228FDT15F150 SMC #10VS C2 Recessed Panel Coated Polycarbonate FORD F150
Model: PK0228FDT15F150
Amount Bid: $627.61 each
WK0514FDT15F150H SMC Window Barrier Steel Horizontal 2015+ Ford F150
Model: WK0514FDT15F150H
Amount Bid: $183.71 each
BK0534FDT15F150 Setina PB400 Aluminum Push Bumper 2015+ Ford F150
Model: BK0534FDT15F150
Amount Bid: $340.78 each
EMPS2SMS4M SOI MPOWER FASCIA 4"12-LED SCREW MNT BLUE/AMBER
Model: EMPS2SMS4M
Amount Bid: $80.70 each
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-20 Award Listing
Provision of Police Vehicle Equipment
Effective:  April 20, 2021 through April 20, 2022
BIDDER:                   DANA SAFETY SUPPLY, INC.
ENFWB8-AB SOI INTERIOR LED LIGHT BAR 8 MODULES 2018+ FORD F250
Model: EMFWB00B8
Amount Bid: $645.00 each
ENFTCDGS1208 SOI NFORCE 8 MOD INT. TRAFFIC CONTROLLER 2018+ FORD F250
Model: ENFTC00
Amount Bid: $448.00 each
WEC-P46SLC LED SPOTLIGHT
Model: P46SC
Amount Bid: $124.37 each
WEC-VTX609 Whelen Omni Vertex Directional Light head 9' Cable
Model: WEC-VTX609C
Amount Bid: $47.61 each
D6BBBBBB WEC 6 LED DOMINATOR - ALL LEDS TO BE BLUE
Model: D6B
Amount Bid: $280.37 each
WEC-295SLSA6 Whelen 100/200W Scan-Lock Self-Contained Siren/Switch
Model: 295SLSA6
Amount Bid: $277.86 each
SA315P5Whelen 100W Compact Black Composite 122DB Speaker
Model: SA315P
Amount Bid: $129.62 each
MKEZ93TWEC 2015 TAHOE STRAP KIT
Model: NO BID
Amount Bid: NO BID
MKEA94WEC EXTENDED ADJ MOUNT KIT#94
Model: MKEA94
Amount Bid: $55.65 each
MKEZ83 WEC LIGHTBAR STRAP KIT- 2013+ FORD PIUT
Model: NO BID
Amount Bid: NO BID
OELS45FWEC 2 PC 6 LAMP OUTER EDGE UPPER MOUNT 2021+ TAHOE
Model: OELS34
Amount Bid: $569.05 each
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-20 Award Listing
Provision of Police Vehicle Equipment
Effective:  April 20, 2021 through April 20, 2022
BIDDER:                   DANA SAFETY SUPPLY, INC.
MISCXWEC OELS34 FORD PIUT
Model: OELS34
Amount Bid: $566.57 each
IE54UR8XWEC 2021+ TAHOE UPPER REAR HOUSING FOR 6 OR 8 MODULES
Model: IE54UR8
Amount Bid: $606.70 each        *Must be ordered with ITRAYL8; included in amount bid
IE34UR8ZWEC 6/8 LT UPPER HSG EXPLORER
Model: IE34UR8
Amount Bid: $606.70 each        *Must be ordered with ITRAYL8; included in amount bid
WEC I2SME SURFACE MOUNT ION BLUE/WHITE
Model: I2SME
Amount Bid: $91.12 each
(WHELEN CORE LIGHTBAR PACKAGE) PART #EB2SP3B LEGACY 54” LIGHT BAR WITH ALLEYS AND TAKEDOWNS IN DUO COLOR: FRONT: BLUE/WHITE,
REAR: BLUE/AMBER *54” FOR F150 AND 54” FOR 2021+ TAHOE INCLUDES (EB2SP3B, C399, C399KS, CCTL6, SA315P, CEM16, CV2V, SAK1, SAK70, MKEZ93
Model: Whelen Core Lightbar Package EB2SP3B
Amount Bid: $3,004.00 each
WEC H/L & T/L FLASHER
Model: UHF2150A
Amount Bid: $29.00 each
WEC CANTROL BOX WITH OBD2 PLUG IN AND CANTL6 CONTROL HEAD
Model: CANCW1, CBD2, CANTL6
Amount Bid: $1,163.35 each
MAGNETIC MICROPHONE HANGERS MMSU1
Model: MMSU-1
Amount Bid: $26.80 each
SETINA GUN RACK LOCKING SYSTEM GK11191B1SHKSVSC SHOTGUN LOCK AND BLACK RAC MOUNT
Model: GK11191B1SHKSVSC
Amount Bid: $641.27 each
WEC ALL WHELEN INNER EDGE AND OUTER EDGE AND REAR PILLAR LIGHTS BLUE IX54UFX, IX34UFX, OELS34, OELS54, RPLS54, RPLS34
Model: IX54UFX-BB
Amount Bid: $548.10 each

Model: IX34UFX
Amount Bid: $548.10 each
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-20 Award Listing
Provision of Police Vehicle Equipment
Effective:  April 20, 2021 through April 20, 2022
BIDDER:                   DANA SAFETY SUPPLY, INC.
Model: OELS34
Amount Bid: $567.05 each

Model: OELS54
Amount Bid: $567.05 each

Model: RPLS54-BB
Amount Bid: $782.95 each

Model: RPLS34
Amount Bid: $646.59 each
WEC STRIP LIGHT PLUS B/W PART #PSE02FCR
Model: PSE02FCR
Amount Bid: $75.68 each
WHELEN TRAFFIC ADVISOR FRONT LOAD DUO BLUE/AMBER TADF6
Model: TADF6
Amount Bid: $959.08 each
WEC MICRON IN BLUE, WHITE AND DUO BLUE/WHITE
Model: MCRNSB BLUE OR WHITE
Amount Bid: $64.00 each

Model: MCRNSE B/W
Amount Bid: $64.00 each
EZPF-TAH-2021 AMERICAN ALUMINUM K-9 PLATFORM/INSERT (INCLUDES PC MATTE BLACK, RUBBER MAT, LED LIGHT KIT)
Model: EZPF-TAH-21
Amount Bid: $2,187.00 each
AMERICAN ALUMINUM COOLGUARD PRO-RESCUE AMEALAC E/Z-COOL GUARD SYSTEM WITH RESCUE TAHOE 2021+
Model: Cool Guard
Amount Bid: $1,467.00 each
AMERICAN ALUMINUM NEW HINGED AMEALAC HINGED UNIVERSAL WATER DISH
Model: Water Dish
Amount Bid: $83.70 each
WHELEN CORE SIREN PACKAGE (INCLUDES PART #’S C399, C399K2, CCTL6, SA315P, SAK1, CV2V, CEM16)
Model: Core Package
Amount Bid: $1,393.58 each
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-20 Award Listing
Provision of Police Vehicle Equipment
Effective:  April 20, 2021 through April 20, 2022
BIDDER:                   DANA SAFETY SUPPLY, INC.
WHELEN CORE (SLICK-TOP) PACKAGE (INCLUDES BSFW54Z, OEWS54, RPLS54, C399, C399K2, CCTL6, SA315P, SAK1, CV2V, CEM16)
Model: Slick top
Amount Bid: $3,292.00 each
WHELEN CORE (ADMIN) PACKAGE (INCLUDES BSFW54Z, RPWS54, SA315P, SAK1, C399, C399K2, CV2V)
Model: Admin
Amount Bid: $2,516.00 each
WHELEN CORE LIGHTBAR PACKAGE (PATROL) (INCLUDES EB2SP3B, C399, C399K2, CCTL6, SA315P, CEM16, CV2V, SAK1(13), SAK70(1), SA315P, MKEZ93).
Model: Patrol
Amount Bid: $3,004.00 each
GAMBER JOHNSON CONSOLE PACKAGE W/ PRINTER MOUNT 7170-0848-03
Model: 7170-0848-03
Amount Bid: $827.31 each

For items not specifically referenced above, a bid of “Percent off MSRP” amount for the following manufacturers is requested:

MANUFACTURER: WHELEN
Percent off MSRP price 46.5 %

MANUFACTURER: SETINA (EXCLUDING LIGHTED PUSH BUMPERS, BLAC RAC)
Percent off MSRP price  30  %

MANUFACTURER: SOUND OFF SIGNAL
Percent off MSRP price 46.5 %

MANUFACTURER: GAMBER JOHNSON
Percent off MSRP price  42  %

MANUFACTURER: AMERICAN ALUMINUM
Percent off MSRP price   5   %

MANUFACTURER: ACE K-9
Percent off MSRP price   5   %
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