COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-31 BID TABULATION
Purchase of Four Hundred (400) Pedestrian Barricade Wall Units

BIDDER: Coastal Industrial Supply, LLC

BIDDER: Gulf Supply Co., Inc.

Brand/Manufacturer: Crowdcade/Plasticade
Bid Amounts:
Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color)
Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting

Delivery Time: 7 - 10 business days ARO

$126.98
$120.98
$89.98
$26.50

Exceptions: Product bid differs from the specifications as follows:

Length: 74" (specifications requested: 72")
Height: 39.5" (specifications requested: 38")

Weight: 32 Ibs with 9.5 Ib feet ea. (specifications requested: max of 30 Ibs)

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Devices, Inc. - Urbanite

Bid Amounts:
Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color)
Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting

Delivery Time: 10 - 14 days ARO if in stock

$127.00
$127.00
$127.00
$34.80 (4 per unit)

Exceptions: Price to add reflected sheeting is $8.70 per location with up to

4 |ocations = $34.80

BIDDER: Safety Products, Inc.

BIDDER: LotusUSA, Inc.

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Urbanite
Bid Amounts:

Brand/Manufacturer: Urbanite
Bid Amounts:

Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) $158.00 Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) $165.00
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) $149.00 Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) $165.00
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $138.00 Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $165.00
Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting $8.82 per location Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting $165.00
(up to 4 per unit)

Delivery Time: 14 - 18 days ARO Delivery Time: 21 days ARO

Exceptions: NONE Exceptions: NONE

BIDDER: Tamis Corporation BIDDER: National Trench Safety

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Devices Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Devices, Inc.

Bid Amounts: Bid Amounts:
Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) NO BID Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) $153.50
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) NO BID Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) $153.50
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $158.85 Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $153.50

Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting

Delivery Time: 28 days ARO

Exceptions: NONE

$15.00 per stripe
(engineer grade reflectivity)

Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting

Delivery Time: 2 - 3 weeks ARO

$25.75 - 2 spots
$51.30 - 4 spots

Exceptions: Vendor is not registered as a Foreign Corporation with
the Alabama Secretary of State to do business in Alabama

BIDDER: Airgas

BIDDER: Safety Zone Specialists

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Urbanite 57000-U

Bid Amounts:
Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color)
Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting

Delivery Time: 40 days ARO

Exceptions: NONE

$183.18
$183.18
$183.18
$19.23

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Devices

Bid Amounts:
Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color)
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color)
Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting

Delivery Time: Approximately 21 days ARO

$174.00

$165.00

$159.50

$156.00 - DG (4 per unit)
$72.00 - HIP (4 per unit)
$44.00 - EG (4 per unit)

Exceptions: Price to add reflective sheeting is $39.00 - DG, $18.00 - HIP,

$16.00 - EG per location, with up to 4 locations.
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COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-31 BID TABULATION

Purchase of Four Hundred (400) Pedestrian Barricade Wall Units

BIDDER: Evans & Company, Inc.

BIDDER: ATCO Manufacturing Company, Inc.

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix 57000-U
Bid Amounts:

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Devices, Inc.
Bid Amounts:

Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) $199.85 Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) NO BID
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) $195.50 Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) NO BID
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $185.88 Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $314.83
Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting $22.00 Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting $18.80

Delivery Time: 30 days ARO Delivery Time: 30 days ARO

Exceptions: NONE Exceptions: NONE

BIDDER: Vizocom ICT, LLC BIDDER: Striping Service and Supply, LLC

Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Brand/Manufacturer: Traffix Urbanite 57000 Series

Bid Amounts: Bid Amounts:
Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) $196.61 Price per unit (Qty 0-149, either color) $162.50
Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) $185.38 Price per unit (Qty 150-299, either color) $154.50
Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $182.57 Price per unit (Qty 300-449, either color) $148.50
Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting $19.66 Unit upcharge to add reflective sheeting $17.80

Delivery Time: 45 days max ARO

Exceptions: Vendor is not registered as a Foreign Corporation with

the Alabama Secretary of State to do business in Alabama

Delivery Time: 45 days ARO

Exceptions: Vendor is not registered as a Foreign Corporation with

the Alabama Secretary of State to do business in Alabama

Page 2 of 2




	Sheet1

