COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-35 - BID TABULATION

Provision of Paint Striping Materials

BIDDER: PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc.

Item Description

Amount Bid
PICKED-UP

Amount Bid
DELIVERED

Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application,
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application,
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets

Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon IBC Storage

$0.48 per pound

$0.90 per pound

$0.48 per pound

$0.90 per pound

No Bid No Bid
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon IBC Storage . )
—— No Bid No Bid
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage . )
—— No Bid No Bid
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage . )
—— No Bid No Bid
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage . )
——— No Bid No Bid
System
Exceptions: NONE
BIDDER: Safety Coatings, Inc.
[tem Descrintion Amount Bid Amount Bid
P PICKED-UP DELIVERED
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, i .
) - . No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, i .
) - . No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon IBC Storage
— $3,025.00 each $3,080.00 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon IBC Storage
— $2,805.00 each $2,860.00 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage
— $67.00 each $81.00 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage
— $62.00 each $76.00 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage
— $77.00 each $91.00 each
System
Exceptions: NONE
BIDDER: Ennis-Flint, Inc.
[tem Descrintion Amount Bid Amount Bid
P PICKED-UP DELIVERED
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, i .
) - . No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Glass Spheres: AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, i .
) - . No Bid No Bid
Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 275 Gallon IBC Storage .
— No Bid $3,492.50 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 275 Gallon IBC Storage .
— No Bid $3,630.00 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage .
— No Bid $68.50 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage .
— No Bid $71.00 each
System
Paint: Class 1H, High Build, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon IBC Storage .
— No Bid $76.00 each

System

Exceptions: NONE
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