COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-47  Bid Tabulation
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 100

Delivered Prices Only

Mobile Asphalt Co.

Hosea 0. Weaver

Advanced Asphalt Products LLC

DESCRIPTION Delivered Delivered Delivered

BC-723 $59.50 $60.50 No Bid
424A-280 $71.35 $71.50 No Bid
424A-281 $71.80 $67.50 No Bid
424A-336 $64.75 $69.50 No Bid
424A-340 364.45 $63.50 No Bid
424A-341 $64.45 $61.50 No Bid
424A-360 $64.45 $63.50 No Bid
424A-361 $64.45 $61.50 No Bid
424A-293 $59.35 $55.50 No Bid
424B-635 $59.75 $59.00 No Bid
424B-636 $59.35 $65.50 No Bid
424B-637 $59.35 $55.50 No Bid
424B-851 $59.35 $55.50 No Bid
424B-663 $59.35 $65.50 No Bid
424B-648 $59.35 $55.50 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid $13.50

ESAL Range A/B

*MACGC supply location is Bay Minette/Saraland
Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County

*WEAVER supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile & Atmore - Woods Rd
424B-648 - Superpave Bituminous Concrete upper Binder Layer, widening, 1 1/2" maximum Aggregate Size Mix

Advanced Asphalt Products LLC

Jasper Plant - 25801 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504
Variations to Bid: Cold Mix Asphalt (Bulk L.oad) $110.00 Per Ton - Delivered (Minimum Load Size 29 Tons)

Cold Mix Asphalt (Bulk Load) $70.00 Per Ton F.Q.B. - Picked up at Jasper Plant




COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-47 Bid Tabulation
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 200

Delivered Prices Only

Mobile Asphalt Co.

Hosea O. Weaver

Advanced Asphalt Products LL.C

DESCRIPTION Delivered Delivered Delivered
BC-723 $58.50 $58.50 No Bid
424A-280 $69.35 $69.50 No Bid
424 A-281 $67.20 $65.50 No Bid
424A-336 $62.30 $67.50 No Bid
424A-340 $61.00 $61.50 No Bid
424A-341 $58.10 $59.50 No Bid
424A-360 $61.00 $61.50 No Bid
A24A-361 $58.10 $59.50 No Bid
424A-203 $55.50 $53.50

424B-635 $57.75 $57.00 No Bid
424B-636 $55.50 $53.50 No Bid
424B-637 $65.50 $53.50 No Bid
424B-651 $55.50 $53.50 No Bid
424B-663 $55.50 $53.50 No Bid
424B-6848 $55.50 $53.50 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid $13.50

*MAC supply location is Bay Minette/Saraland
Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County
“WEAVER supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile

424B-648 - Superpave Bituminous Concrete upper Binder Layer, widening, 1 1/2" maximum Aggregate Size Mix

ESAL Range A/B

Advanced Asphait Products LLC
Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, Al 35504

Variations to Bid: Cold Mix Asphalt (Butk Load) $110.00 Per Ton - Delivered (Minimum Load Size 29 Tons)
Cold Mix Asphalt (Bulk Load) $70.00 Per Ton F.O.B. - Picked up at Jasper Plant




COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-47

Bid Tabulation

BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AREA 300

Delivered Prices Only

Mobile Asphalt Co.

Hosea O. Weaver

Advanced Asphalt Products L1.C

DESCRIPTION Delivered Delivered Delivered

BC-723 $62.00 $63.00 No Bid
424A-280 $74.80 $74.00 No Bid
424A-281 $75.35 $70.00 No Bid
424A-336 $68.30 $72.00 No Bid
424A-340 $66.55 $66.00 No Bid
424A-341 $68.55 $64.00 No Bid
424 A-360 $66.55 $66.00 No Bid
424A-361 $66.55 $64.00 No Bid
424A-293 $62.45 $58.00 No Bid
424B-635 $62.55 $61.50 No Bid
424B-838 $62.45 $58.00 No Bid
424B-637 $62.45 $58.00 No Bid
424B-651 $62.45 $58.00 No Bid
424B-663 $62.45 $58.00 No Bid
424B-648 $62.45 $58.60 No Bid
Recycle Asphait (RAP) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 Ib bag $40.00 No Bid $13.50

*MAC supply location is Foley

Cold Mix Asphalt will be shipped by Vendor to Baldwin County
*WEAVER supply location is Bay Bridge Cut Off Road Mobile
424B-648 - Superpave Bituminous Concrete upper Binder Layer, widening, 1 1/2" maximum Aggregate Size Mix

ESAL Range A/B

Advanced Asphalt Products LLC
Jagper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, Al. 35504
Variations to Bid: Cold Mix Asphalt (Bulk Load) $110.00 Per Ton - Delivered {(Minimum Load Size 29 Tons)

Cold Mix Asphalt (Bulk Load) $70.00 Per Ton F.O.B. - Picked up at Jasper Plant




COMPETITIVE BID #WG21-47 Bid Tabulation
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

Area 100, 200, 300

Picked Up Prices Based on Faclity Location Only

Mobile Asphalt Co. Hosea O. Weaver Advanced Asphalt Products LLC

DESCRIPTION Bay Minette Saraland Foley Cut off Rd.Mobile

BC-723 $55.00 $55.00 $58.00 $53.00 No Bid
424A-280 $66.50 $66.50 $70.00 $65.00 No Bid
424A-281 $66.50 $686.60 $71.00 $60.00 No Bidt
424/-336 $50.00 $60.00 $64.15 $63.00 No Bid
424A-340 ) $60.00 $60.00 $63.60 $60.00 No Bid
424A-341 $60.00 $60.00 $63.60 $56.00 No Bld
424A-360 $60.00 $60.00 $63.60 $60.00 No Bid
424A-361 $60.00 $60.00 $63.60 $56.00 No Bld
424A-203 $55.00 $65.00 $58.30 $50.00 No Bid
424B-635 $55.00 $55.00 $58.60 $54.00 Mo Bid
424B-636 $55.00 $55.00 $58.30 $50.00 No Bid
424B-637 $55.00 $55.00 $58.30 $50.00 No Bid
424B-651 $55.00 $55.00 $58.20 $50.00 No Bid
424B-663 $55.00 $55.00 $58.30 $50.00 No Bid
424B-6488 $50.00 No Bid
Recycle Asphalt (RAP} $20.00 $20.00 $25.00 $20.00 No Bid

FOB Theodora
Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 |b bag $30.00 No Bid $12.50

MAC plant locations:

Bay Minette - 43385 Nicholsville Rd.

Saraland - 1370 Bwy 43 5.

Folay - 21650 Doc McDuffie Rd.

Cold Mix Asphait will be shippad by Vendor to Baldwin County

424B-648 - Superpave Bituminous Concrete upper Binder Layer, widening, 1 1/2" maximum Aggregate Size Mix ESAL Range A/B

H. O. Weaver plant Incations:
Meblle - Bay Bridge Cut Off Road
Atmore - Woods Road

Advanced Asphalt Products LLC

Jasper Plant - 25601 Highway 69, Jasper, AL 35504
Variations to Bid: Cald Mix Asphalt (Bulk Load) $110.00 Per Ton - Delivered (Minimum Load Size 28 Tons)

Cold Mix Asphalt (Bulk Load} $70.00 Per Ton F.O.B. - Picked up at Jasper Plant




