Competitive Bid #WG22-03 Bid Tabulation

Fire Extinguisher Service

Inspection Site Southern Fire Fyr-Fyter Sales | McCoy Fire McCoy Fire VSC Fire
& Safety Inc. & Service Inc. & Safety & Safety & Security
Cost Per Visit
Recycled Units

Baldwin County Courthouse $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Administration Bldg $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Annex Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Annex Il Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Annex Il Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Annex IV Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Annex V Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Board of Education (2 bldgs) $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Sheriff Office Bldg $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Correctional Center - Monthly $150.00 $175.00| $3.00 ea unit| $5.00 ea Annual $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Sheriff's Maintenace Shop $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Sheriff's Garage $45.00 $55.00/ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Annex VI Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Probate Office Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Archives Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Symbol Health Clinic Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Byrne Street Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Council on Aging North $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Building Maintenance Bldg. $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Bay Minette Hwy Dept. $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Juvenile Detention Center $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin Co. Transfer Station $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Mill Creek (Sheriff's) Training Facility $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Level Il Shelter $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County District Attorney's Office $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
BRATS Annex Bldg. $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Legislative Delegation Bldg. $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Shierff's Support Services $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Community Corrections $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Bicentennial Park (All Buildings) $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Baldwin County Megasite Pavillion $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Voting Machine Building (behind BM Hwy) $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Ellisville Community Center (Loxley) $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
McBride C & D Landfill $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
BRATS - Robertsdale $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Robertsdale Sheriff's Office $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Emergency Mgmt (Rdale - 2 Bldgs) $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Robertsdale Central Annex $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Robertsdale Central Annex Il $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Coroner's Office $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Robertsdale Sheriff Storage Facility $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Robertsdale Sheriff's Garage $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Robertsdale Ft. Jones, $45.00 $55.00] $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Health Department (Gilbert Drive) $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Robertsdale Coliseum & Fairgrounds $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Sheriff metal Storage Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Symbol Health Clinic Building $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Eastfork Inert Landfill $65.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Fairhope Courthouse $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Court Referral Office - 20555 Bishop Road $45.00 $55.00/ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Fairhope BRATS HUB 20531 Bishop Rd $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Fairhope BRATS Hub 918 Fairhope Ave. $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Silverhill Hwy Dept. (All Bldgs) $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Silverhill Hwy Construction Bldg $45.00 $55.00/ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Magnolia Landfill (All Buildings) $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Animal Shelter $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Foley Courthouse $45.00 $55.00/ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Foley Maintenace Shop North Juniper St. $45.00 $55.00/ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Foley Building Maintenance Building 201 Section § $45.00 $55.00{ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Foley Highway (New Site) $45.00 $55.00 $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit




Competitive Bid #WG22-03 Bid Tabulation
Fire Extinguisher Service

Inspection Site Southern Fire Fyr-Fyter Sales | McCoy Fire McCoy Fire VSC Fire
& Safety Inc. & Service Inc. & Safety & Safety & Security

Cost Per Visit

Protable Fire Extinguishers Wheeled Units
Inspection Cost Per Year
2.51b ABC $3.50 $5.50| $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
2.51b ABC 6-Yr $12.50 $17.50 $23.25 $2.95 ea unit
51b ABC $3.50 $5.50| $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
51b ABC 6-yr $24.00 $32.00 $34.50 $2.95 ea unit
10 Ib ABC $3.50 $5.50| $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
10 Ib ABC - 6yr $38.00 $42.50 $36.00 $2.95 ea unit
20 1b ABC $3.50 $5.50| $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
20Ib 6 yr $43.00 $56.00 $75.00 $2.95 ea unit
K Type $3.50 $5.50[ $5.00 ea unit $2.95 ea unit
Cost P/Charge Extinguisher Units:
2.51b ABC $12.50 $17.50 $14.50 $15.00
2.51b ABC 6-Yr $12.50 $17.50 $23.25 $20.00
51b ABC $24.00 $32.00 $25.00 $15.00
51b ABC 6-yr $24.00 $32.00 $34.50 $25.00
10 Ib ABC $38.00 $42.50 $45.00 $15.00
10 Ib ABC - 6yr $38.00 $42.50 $36.00 $25.00
20 1b ABC $43.00 $56.00 $75.00 $15.00
20Ib 6 yr $43.00 $56.00 $40.00 $30.00
K Type $82.00 $98.00 $140.00 $80.00
2.51b.BC $16.00 $32.00 $14.50 $15.00
51b BC $26.00 $45.50 $25.00 $15.00
51b Co2 $12.00 $33.00 $20.00 $54.00
101b BC $28.00 $69.50 $45.00 $15.00
201b BC $45.00 $116.00 $75.00 $15.00
10 Ib Co2 $14.00 $43.00 $40.00 $66.00
151b Co2 $14.00 $49.75 $60.00 $72.00
20 Ib Co2 $14.00 $58.00 $80.00 $85.00
50 Ib Co2 $28.00 $89.00 $200.00 $105.00
50lb ABC $135.00 $295.00 $185.00 $50.00
150 Ib ABC $350.00 $465.00 $325.00 $100.00
2.5 gallon K $150.00 $135.00 $125.00 $110.00
6 liter K Class $82.00 $98.00 $125.00 $80.00
50Ib Wheel Unit $160.00 $295.00 $225.00 $75.00
150 Ib Wheel Unit $360.00 $465.00 $375.00 $120.00
11 Ib Halotron Empty $470.85 $665.00 $65.00 Full] $225.00 - Empty $210.00
Cost of Purchasing New Units: Recycled Units
2.5 b ABC w/ Vehicle Bracket $33.50 $39.00 $38.00 $25.00 $40.00
5 Ib ABC w/Wall Hanger $47.00 $49.75 $45.00 $35.00 $50.00
10 Ib ABC w/Wall Hanger $68.00 $69.75 $65.00 $45.00 $75.00
20 Ib ABC w/Wall Hanger $129.00 $139.85 $110.00 $95.00 $130.00
50 Ib ABC Wheel Unit $1,380.00 $1,992.00 $1,950.00 No Bid $1,330.00
125 Ib ABC Wheel Unit $2,100.00 $2,976.41 $3,650.00 No Bid $2,285.00
150 Ib BC Wheel Unit $2,650.00 $3,162.12 $4,350.00 No Bid $2,920.00
5 Ib Co2 w/Wall Hanger $126.00 $193.00 $120.00 $70.00 $250.00
10 Ib Co2 w/Wall Hanger $160.00 $262.00 $180.00 $90.00 $320.00
15 Ib Co2 w/Wall Hanger $195.00 $299.00 $410.00 $215.00 $340.00
20 Ib Co2 w/Wall Hanger $230.00 $383.00 $230.00 $180.00 $450.00
50 Ib Co2 Wheel Unit $1,565.00 $2,772.00 $3,920.00 No Bid $2,628.00
100 Ib Co @ Wheel Unit $2,990.00 $3,900.00 $7,300.00 No Bid $4,955.00
2.5 Ib Halotron w/Vehicle Bracket $168.00 $145.50 $240.00 $150.00 $84.50
5 Ib Halotron w/ Wall Hanger $265.00 $261.08 $400.00 $225.00 $155.00
11 Ib Halotron w/Wall Hanger $570.00 $499.00 $820.00 $315.00 $310.00
15.5 Halotran w/Wall Hanger $795.00 $689.11 $1,220.00 $475.00 $465.00
6 liter K-Class w/Wall Hanger $176.00 $215.00 $195.00 $95.00 $186.00
2.5 gal K-Class w/Wall Hanger $265.00 $249.00 $240.00 $140.00 $245.00
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2.5 Gallon Water $135.00 $145.00 $210.00 $120.00 $115.00
4.75 Clean Guard $230.00 $227.00 $390.00 $145.00 $208.00
9lb Clean Guard $460.00 $448.50 $850.00 $375.00 $425.00
13lb Clean Guard $770.00 $687.00 $1,550.00 $515.00 $703.00

NOTES:

McCoy Fire & Safety: $5.00 ea per Extinguisher, Additional services rendered other than Annual Fire Extinguisher

Inspections , a $45.00 Trip charge will apply.

VSC Fire & Security: Company bid on $2.95 each Extinguisher per Building. Some Locations have multiple buildings.

Bid Evaulation Example: Magnolai Landfill has est. 240 extinguishers in just equipment and vehicles

McCoy - $5.00/ per extinguisher x 240 = $1200.00 per annual visii

VSC Fiire - $2.95/per extinguisher x 240 = $708.00 per annual visit

Fyr. Fyter Sales- s $55.00 per location regardless of the number of extinguishers

Southern Fire & Safety - $45.00 per location regarless of the number of extinguishers




